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Pauline Alden

From: Homan, Angela <Angela.Homan@Katzmedia.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 21, 2021 3:43 PM

To: Sandi Mancuso; Pauline Alden

Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] RE: Proof of Payment - Clean Energy Matters, est. 9857

Sorry for the delay! Below is a screenshot of the ACH payment  

 

 

Angela Homan  
Account Coordinator  

Katz Radio Group  
111 Presidential Blvd, Suite 215 | Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004  
Angela.Homan@katzmedia.com  
o: 215-557-4230 c: 267-650-8082 f: 917-206-9773 

 

From: Sandi Mancuso <Sandra.Mancuso@townsquaremedia.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, April 21, 2021 3:30 PM 

To: Pauline Alden <Pauline.Alden@townsquaremedia.com>; Homan, Angela <Angela.Homan@Katzmedia.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Proof of Payment - Clean Energy Matters, est. 9857  

  

Hi Angela 

Can you please send the proof of payment for est 9857 Clean Energy Matters. 

I can’t seem to find it in my emails. 

Thanks, 

  

Sandi Mancuso  

National Sales Assistant 

Sandi.Mancuso@townsquaremedia.com 

Ph – 848-221-8144 

Cell – 732-995-5880 

  

  

  

From: Pauline Alden <Pauline.Alden@townsquaremedia.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, April 21, 2021 3:25 PM 

To: Sandi Mancuso <Sandra.Mancuso@townsquaremedia.com>; Homan, Angela <Angela.Homan@Katzmedia.com> 



2

Subject: RE: Proof of Payment - Clean Energy Matters, est. 9857 

Importance: High 

  

Hi All, 
  
Just circling back to this. Do we have proof of payment for this estimate? 

  
Thank you. 
  

Pauline AldenPauline AldenPauline AldenPauline Alden 

Accounts Receivable Specialist 
Wide Orbit Payments Region 1 
pauline.alden@townsquaremedia.com 
Office: 603-285-6002 
Fax: 1-866-240-9808 

 
  

From: Sandi Mancuso <Sandra.Mancuso@townsquaremedia.com>  

Sent: Monday, April 19, 2021 4:44 PM 

To: Homan, Angela <Angela.Homan@Katzmedia.com> 

Cc: Pauline Alden <Pauline.Alden@townsquaremedia.com> 

Subject: FW: Proof of Payment - Clean Energy Matters, est. 9857 

  

Hi Angela 

We never received the proof of payment for est 9857 Clean Energy Matters. 

Can you please send as soon as possible-thanks 

  

Sandi Mancuso  

National Sales Assistant 

Sandi.Mancuso@townsquaremedia.com 

Ph – 848-221-8144 

Cell – 732-995-5880 

  

  

  

From: Pauline Alden <Pauline.Alden@townsquaremedia.com>  

Sent: Monday, April 19, 2021 3:11 PM 

To: Sandi Mancuso <Sandra.Mancuso@townsquaremedia.com>; Wide Orbit Payments - Region 1 

<wopayments1@townsquaremedia.com> 

Subject: RE: Proof of Payment - Clean Energy Matters, est. 9864  

  

Thanks Sandi. Do you have the proof of payment for estimate 9857? I don’t recall receiving that one.  
  

Pauline AldenPauline AldenPauline AldenPauline Alden 

Accounts Receivable Specialist 
Wide Orbit Payments Region 1 
pauline.alden@townsquaremedia.com 
Office: 603-285-6002 
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Fax: 1-866-240-9808 

 
  

From: Sandi Mancuso <Sandra.Mancuso@townsquaremedia.com>  

Sent: Monday, April 19, 2021 2:52 PM 

To: Wide Orbit Payments - Region 1 <wopayments1@townsquaremedia.com> 

Subject: FW: Proof of Payment - Clean Energy Matters, est. 9864  

Importance: High 

  

Proof of payment for Clean Energy Matters est 9864-Portland, Augusta and Bangor 

  

  

Sandi Mancuso  

National Sales Assistant 

Sandi.Mancuso@townsquaremedia.com 

Ph – 848-221-8144 

Cell – 732-995-5880 

  

  

  

From: Homan, Angela <Angela.Homan@Katzmedia.com>  

Sent: Monday, April 19, 2021 2:35 PM 

To: brucebiette@blueberrybroadcasting.com; tammysears@blueberrybroadcasting.com; Daniel Bershad 

<Dan.Bershad@townsquaremedia.com>; Sandi Mancuso <Sandra.Mancuso@townsquaremedia.com>; 

Bwerner@sagacom.com; Heather Burleigh <HBurleigh@portlandradiogroup.com>; abaker@portlandradiogroup.com 

Cc: Chenault, LaTonya <LaTonya.Chenault@Katzmedia.com> 

Subject: Proof of Payment - Clean Energy Matters, est. 9864  

Importance: High 

  

Hi - attached is proof of payment.  

  

Thanks! 

  

Angela Homan  

Account Coordinator  

Katz Radio Group  

111 Presidential Blvd, Suite 215 | Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004  

Angela.Homan@katzmedia.com  

o: 215-557-4230 c: 267-650-8082 f: 917-206-9773 

 
  

From: Homan, Angela <Angela.Homan@Katzmedia.com> 

Sent: Monday, April 19, 2021 11:03 AM 
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To: brucebiette@blueberrybroadcasting.com <brucebiette@blueberrybroadcasting.com>; 

tammysears@blueberrybroadcasting.com <tammysears@blueberrybroadcasting.com>; Daniel Bershad 

<Dan.Bershad@townsquaremedia.com>; Sandi Mancuso <Sandra.Mancuso@townsquaremedia.com>; 

Bwerner@sagacom.com <Bwerner@sagacom.com>; Heather Burleigh <HBurleigh@portlandradiogroup.com>; 

abaker@portlandradiogroup.com <abaker@portlandradiogroup.com> 

Cc: Chenault, LaTonya <LaTonya.Chenault@Katzmedia.com> 

Subject: Clean Energy Matters, est. 9864 - Traffic  

  

Hi,  

  

Please continue the current traffic until further notice for the next Clean Energy Matters orders. We'll follow up once 

payment is available. 

  

Estimate 9864 Clean Energy Matters Radio 4.20-4.26 

Flight Dates: 4.20-4.26 

Markets: Portland, Bangor, Augusta 

  

Thanks! 

Angela Homan  

Account Coordinator  

Katz Radio Group  

111 Presidential Blvd, Suite 215 | Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004  

Angela.Homan@katzmedia.com  

o: 215-557-4230 c: 267-650-8082 f: 917-206-9773 

 
  

  

Internet Email Warning 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize 

the sender and know the content is safe.  

  

CAUTION: This message originated from outside of the company. Please take all precautions when opening attachments or links 

from outside sources. 

 

  

Internet Email Warning 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize 

the sender and know the content is safe.  

 


