
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of Sinclair. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and
know the content is safe.

[EXT] Re: Payment Instructions

floydldonald@gmail.com <floydldonald@gmail.com>
Fri 3/29/2024 8:43 AM
To:​Craig Castrellon <cecastrellon@sbgtv.com>;​F L Donald <nmedia564@yahoo.com>;​Teal Woods <tmwoods@sbgtv.com>;​John Clayton <jrclayton@sbgtv.com>;​Jessica
Burkett <jrburkett@sbgtv.com>​
Cc:​Misty Johnson <misjohnson@sbgtv.com>;​Mia Richard <mcrichard@sbgtv.com>​

Confirmed…and accepted…..

Sent from Yahoo Mail

On Friday, March 29, 2024, 8:39 AM, Craig Castrellon <cecastrellon@sbgtv.com> wrote:

Floyd,
Please confirm this email schedule is acceptable so we can get you set up in the payment portal...need this asap!

Thanks

Craig   

-----Original Message-----
From: Craig Castrellon <cecastrellon@sbgtv.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 28, 2024 2:48 PM
To: Floyd Donald <floydldonald@gmail.com>; F L Donald <nmedia564@yahoo.com>; Teal Woods <tmwoods@sbgtv.com>;
John Clayton <jrclayton@sbgtv.com>; Jessica Burkett <jrburkett@sbgtv.com>
Cc: Misty Johnson <misjohnson@sbgtv.com>; Mia Richard <mcrichard@sbgtv.com>
Subject: Payment Instructions

https://nam04.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fmail.onelink.me%2F107872968%3Fpid%3Dnativeplacement%26c%3DGlobal_Acquisition_YMktg_315_Internal_EmailSignature%26af_sub1%3DAcquisition%26af_sub2%3DGlobal_YMktg%26af_sub3%3D%26af_sub4%3D100000604%26af_sub5%3DEmailSignature__Static_&data=05%7C02%7Cjrburkett%40sbgtv.com%7C07d0ceb90dfe405ce3c008dc4ff63a3e%7C897dbc0dc02d43479a713e589c67f8aa%7C0%7C0%7C638473166162854386%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=1ahrsFYvy45b9ZGAe7aUkRzI%2FKKihcEnfHymEG1VyJI%3D&reserved=0
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Hi Floyd,
Per our conversation, here is the requested schedule for Candidate Shirley Washington - Re elect Pine Bluff Mayor.  Let us
know if this is acceptable. We do have the commercial in house and it is acceptable.

Schedule:
Sunday 3/31 10:35p-11:05p 1x $100
Monday 4/1 5am-6am 1x $250
Monday 4/1 6am-7am 1x $575
Monday 4/1 11:30am-12am $275

Total Schedule $1,200 Gross
Total Net Cost  $1,020 Pay this amount

Teal Woods is setting you up In the payment portal so you can make the payment.  Once you pay in the payment portal, you
will receive a receipt.  You must send us a copy immediately of the receipt so we can enter the order so we can get you on the
air.  We have until 10am tomorrow morning to get this entered and on the books for airing. 

Teal, here is Mr. Donalds information for the portal set up.  Please send him the payment portal instructions.  Thanks.

Floyd L. Donald
Network Media One LLC
Pine Bluff, Arkansas 71601 floydldonald@gmail.com

(870) 717-3362

Floyd, let us know if you have any questions.

Thanks

Craig   

-----Original Message-----
From: Floyd Donald <floydldonald@gmail.com>
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Sent: Thursday, March 28, 2024 1:38 PM
To: Craig Castrellon <cecastrellon@sbgtv.com>
Cc: Misty Johnson <misjohnson@sbgtv.com>; F L Donald <nmedia564@yahoo.com>
Subject: [EXT] Payment Instructions

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of Sinclair. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Please remember to send the instructions for me to make the payment.  Also, please send the flight schedule that we
discussed for Monday and Tuesday programming..

Thanks

Floyd L. Donald
Network Media One LLC
Pine Bluff, Arkansas 71601 floydldonald@gmail.com

(870) 717-3362
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