Nancy Ward

From: Mary Ann Phyall <maryannphyall@ymail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, May 02, 2018 9:07 PM

To: Nancy Ward

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: Robb Pitts Campaign 050518
GM Nancy,

We are staying with the weekend schedule until probably the last week. I had that spot at $20 not $35 and it put me
over budget. So, I apologize, we'll purchase the weekend schedule for 5/5 and 5/6 only. That should be $450. Mary Ann

From: Nancy Ward <naward@radio-one.com>
To: "maryannphyall@ymail.com" <maryannphyall@ymail.com>; "dori@dginsburg.com" <dori@dginsburg.com>
Sent: Wednesday, May 2, 2018 5:30 PM

Subject: Robb Pitts Campaign 050518

Please find attached sales orders for Robb’s upcoming campaign on Majic and Praise. Payment is due by 11:30am on Friday 5/4/18. Thank
you!

Nancy Ward

Senior Integrated Media Specialist
0:404-832-7265

C: 470-286-0727

101 Marietta Street, 12" Floor, Atlanta, GA 30303



