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ISSUES AND PROGRAMS: FIRST QUARTER 2015

ISSUE: YOUTH PROGRAMMING
 
01/09/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug Barry talked with Pat 
Castle and Sharla Cloutier. They are with the awareness group LIFE runners. Both of them run at local 
races to promote/raise awareness of women’s health issues.
 
01/16/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug Barry spoke to Jennifer 
Baugh. Jennifer operates a young professionals group. The group aids young adults successfully 
navigate the work place.
 
02/06/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug Barry discussed an event 
held in San Francisco, California. One attendee said hearts would be changed at the event this year. 
Another attendee mentioned how the next generation is making a difference.
 
02/13/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug Barry talked to Christina 
Mead. She works on a youth website and other youth oriented materials. She said teenagers use social 
media to get their information.
 
03/06/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug Barry spoke to Scott 
Sullivan. The topic of discussion was atheism and philosophy’s influence on the pop culture. The “why” 
of things is not discussed with young people prior to college, according to Professor Sullivan.
 
03/13/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug Barry talked with Katie 
Schmid. Katie is a professional painter. She likes to combine nature and interior realities into her 
paintings. Reverence was an important aspect of her paintings.
 
ISSUE: FAMILY, PARENTING AND RELATIONSHIPS
 
01/06/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood spoke about a New Year’s 
resolution worth keeping. Steve recommended a yearly reading plan of a “good book” to learn to be a 
better person for your family.
 
01/13/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood encouraged setting up a family 
study and dialogue time. The tools needed are good reference materials. Steve recommended that the 
Dad’s do a little research before the family comes together. The study time should be short and sweet, 
roughly one good question to discuss according to Steve.
 
02/03/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood continued his discussion of 
encouraging families to study together. Steve said family time is a good environment to share ideas and 
discuss the good news.
 
02/10/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood continued his explanation for 
families to study together. Steve reviewed many issues and/or concepts based upon ancient texts. A 
leader should exhibit humility according to Steve.



 
03/03/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood spoke about healing in the 
family. It is uniting for families to get together for the discussion of various issues. It was noted that 
miracles in life bring about conversion and hope.
 
03/10/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood talked about how to prepare 
youth in a sexually promiscuous culture. There is a stunning moral decline in the United States, 
especially the last ten years. Sexually transmitted diseases are going to be on the rise. Many in society 
don’t feel like fighting this issue, according to Steve. The target of this sexually permissive culture will 
be our children and grandchildren, Steve warned. Last, public schools are fast becoming the epicenter 
for this sexual revolution.
 
ISSUE: HEALTH
 
01/15/15 at 12:00...The Doctor is In...57 minutes...Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, answers 
listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. Dr. Ray spoke of how 
manners cultivate good communication and connections with other people.
 
01/16/15 at 12:00...The Doctor is In...57 minutes...Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, answers 
listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. Dr. Ray said we need “real” 
honesty about our faults in order to transcend them.
 
02/10/15 at 12:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, answers 
listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. Dr. Ray noted that American 
contentment is among the the lowest in the world. Dr. Ray believed the marketing of telling us what we 
should have squelches satisfaction and gratitude.
 
02/11/15 at 12:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, answers 
listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. Dr. Ray said discipline 
without authority does not work. Discipline, as defined by Dr. Ray, is a penalty based on a consequence. 
Authority, on the other hand, is the ability to enforce discipline according to Dr. Ray.
 
03/04/15 at 12:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, answers 
listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. Dr. Ray spoke about how as 
men age, their levels of aggression tend to diminish.
 
03/05/15 at 12:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, answers 
listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. A caller asked about panic 
attacks and anxiety.
 

ISSUE: EDUCATIONAL
 
01/09/15 at 13:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan Burke, and Thom Price 
taught on current events making news. Topics covered were university freedom issues and setting up 
good routines in the New Year.
 



01/16/15 at 13:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan Burke, and Thom Price 
taught on current events making news. Topics covered according to EWTN were author Robert Reilly 
was on to discuss last week’s terror attack in Paris.
 
02/06/15 at 13:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan Burke, and Thom Price 
taught on current events making news. Topic covered involved the day to day life in a monastery. 
Franciscan Sister Clare Matthiass, of the Institute of Religious Life, spoke of the mutual support offered 
to the religious.
 
02/13/15 at 13:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan Burke, and Thom Price 
taught on current events making news. Topics covered according to EWTN revolved around the HHS 
mandate and the legal issues regarding it.
 
03/06/15 at 13:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan Burke, and Thom Price 
taught on current events making news. Topics covered according to EWTN were net neutrality and the 
practice of fasting.
 
03/13/15 at 13:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan Burke, and Thom Price 
taught on current events making news. Topics covered according to EWTN were news from Rome, Italy 
and a call to interior well-being.
 
ISSUE: PUBLIC INTEREST
 
01/04/15 at 08:30...EWTN Bookmark...30 minutes...Host Doug Keck's weekly book review show 
discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest book release. On this program, author Fr. 
Jacques Philippe was on to discuss his books entitled Called to Life and The Way of Trust and Love. 
The first book dealt with how to find true happiness. The second book dealt with the interior life lessons 
from Therese of Lisieux.
 
01/11/15 at 08:30...EWTN Bookmark...30 minutes...Host Doug Keck's weekly book review show 
discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest book release. On this program, author 
Regis Martin was on to discuss his book entitled The Beggar’s Banquet. The book dealt with a retreat 
for inner growth and healing.
 
02/01/15 at 08:30...EWTN Bookmark...30 minutes...Host Doug Keck's weekly book review show 
discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest book release. On this program, author 
Gary Zimak was on to discuss his books entitled Listen to Your Blessed Mother and A Worrier’s Guide 
to the Bible. The first book dealt with having a good relationship, and possessing an attitude of gratitude. 
The second book dealt with anxiety, stress, despair, etc.
 
02/08/15 at 08:30...EWTN Bookmark...30 minutes...Host Doug Keck's weekly book review show 
discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest book release. On this program, author Fr. 
Emmerich Vogt was on to discuss his book entitled The Freedom to Love. The book looks at addictions 
in our lives and recovery from them.
 
03/08/15 at 08:30...EWTN Bookmark...30 minutes...Host Doug Keck's weekly book review show 
discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest book release. On this program, author 



Cristina Borges and Illustrator Michaela Harrison were on to discuss their book entitled, Of Bells and 
Cells. The book introduces children to the history and lifestyle of monasticism.
 
03/15/15 at 08:30...EWTN Bookmark...30 minutes...Host Doug Keck's weekly book review show 
discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest book release. On this program, author 
Susan Conroy was on to talk about her book entitled, Coming to Christ: Resting in His Love. The book 
aids the reader to find solace in the interior life.

ISSUE: LOCAL PROGRAMMING “Faith Alive”

Weekly 30-minute program airing Wednesdays at 8:30pm, Saturdays at 6:00pm and Sundays at 1:30pm. 
Host Rodney Schuster, Executive Director of Catholic Charities in the Toledo Diocese interviews guests 
about how their faith is being lived out.

1/7/15 and 1/14/15 - Deacon Bill Turrentine explained his efforts in teaching the benefits and theology 
of Natural Family Planning.

1/21/15 – Jeffery Willbarger, director of the Daughter Project discussed the efforts to assist and house 
female victims of sex trafficking in our area.

1/26/15 - Peter Range, Respect Life Coordinator for Catholic Charities discussed parish and diocesan 
plans for March For Life in Washington DC and in the Toledo area. Also discussed other respect life 
issues.

2/4/15 – John Maher and Andrea Slivka, organizers of the Glass City Marathon discussed the marathon 
and explained how to register.

2/11/15 – Roxanne Sandals, director of Miriam House in Norwalk, OH discussed how the Miriam 
House assiste the needy in their area.

2/18/15 – Randy Albright, musician, singer and songwriter discussed his Catholic faith and reversion, 
and about his upcoming appearance at the April 28th Universal Initiative Foundation fundraising dinner 
for maimed Albino children in Tansania.

3/4/15 - Jeff Barefoot discussed the upcoming Toledo Men’s Conference and how the event, on March 
14th, will help strengthen the spirituality of men in our area. Keynote speakers will be Dr. Ray 
Guarendi, Marcus Grodi and Dr. Jeffery Morrow.

3/25/15 – Kevin Moebius discussed his vocation and life in the seminary as he follows his call to the 
Holy Priesthood.

ISSUE: LOCAL PROGRAMMING “The Bishop’s Corner”

30 minutes, airing Thursdays at 8:00pm, Fridays at 11:00am and Saturdays at 12:00pm
Host Ron Miller interviews Bishop Daniel Thomas and asks questions submitted by listeners. The 
program begins with Gospel reading and reflection.



1/8/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding youth and how common core curriculum impacts 
Catholic education, plans for adding Luminous mysteries to Rosary Cathedral, praying for the ill, and 
holy days of obligation.

1/15/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding male-only priesthood, spirituality of religious 
orders, evangelization, building the faith in the diocese and right to life.

1/22/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding Toledo diocesan participation in the March For Life 
in Washington, confirmation of children, Latin Mass, Knights of Columbus regalia and race relations.

1/29/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding priestly spirituality, proper way to address the 
Bishop, family prayer and upcoming Philadelphia conference on the family, Lenten preparations, 
“lukewarm” Catholics and faith building in children.

2/5/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding deathbed anointing, faith and morals, indulgences for 
praying the Rosary.

2/12/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding making a good confession, ways to mark the 
penitential season of Lent, disciplines of the Church, fasting, leavened and unleavened bread, 
infant/child baptism by relatives, how to come back to the Church.

2/19/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding prayer, fasting and almsgiving, indulgences-
especially during Lent, sand in holy water fonts, when Lent officially ends, governmental funding for 
charitable work, marriage ceremonies in Church vs outside, saints and reception of the Eucharist on 
tongue

2/26/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding Latin Mass, Gregorian chant in the Liturgy, the 
Rosary’s de-emphasis post Vatican II, priestly ordination of a permanent Deacon after the death of a 
spouse, prayers for vocations, supporting holy families, school tuition methods, sanctity of marriage.

3/5/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding Consecrated life, Stations of the Cross, encouraging 
vocations and Marian devotion.

3/12/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding Sunday Lenten abstinence, almsgiving, 
reconciliation and communal penance services.

3/19/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding sacramental confession, Total Consecration To 
Jesus Through Mary, Divine Mercy, formulas for prayer and Confirmation.

3/26/15 - The Bishop addressed questions regarding praying to the Holy Spirit, evangelizing fallen-away 
Catholics, developing a closer relationship with Mary, devotional music and pilgrimage to World 
Meeting of Family in September.

ISSUE: LOCAL PROGRAMMING “Faith With Reasons”

Weekly 60 minute live show airing Wednesdays from 4-5pm and replayed at 10:00am Saturdays. Hosts 
Ron Finn and Deacon Joe Malenfant interview guests and welcome callers and e-mail questions 
regarding Catholic teachings.



1/7/15 - GUEST: Fr. James Kubicki, National Director Apostleship of Prayer.
Father Kubicki shared the Pope’s prayer intentions for January, and offered suggestions for enhancing 
daily prayer in light of New Year’s resolutions.

1/14/15 - GUEST: Peter Range, Coordinator of Respect Life Program for Diocese of Toledo.
Peter explained diocesan plans for upcoming (this Thursday) March for Life in Washington DC, and 
talked about local related events, as well as other respect life issues, including his own witness about his 
disabled father.

1/21/15 - GUEST: Monsignor Kenneth Morman, Pastor of St. Paul the Apostle parish in Norwalk OH.
Msgr. Morman explained how the entire Bible is the inspired word of God, how the Bible came to be 
organized, what books are included and why, and ways to use it in daily reflection.

1/28/15 - GUEST: Fr. Jacob Gordon, Pastor of St. Joseph, St. Adalbert & St. Hedwig in Toledo.
Father explained the history of the Mass and the difference between Ordinary and Extraordinary form, 
High Mass, Low Mass and Solemn High Mass. We also discussed the parts of the Mass and where the 
Latin Mass can be celebrated.

2/4/15 - GUEST: Rev. Monsignor Charles Singler, Director of Diocesan Office of Vocations, Divine 
Worship.
Discussion on the reception of ashes on Ash Wednesday, the 3 pillars of Lent – prayer, fasting and 
almsgiving – and how our priests and deacons prepare.

2/11/15 - GUESTS: Brad Bonham, Principal St. John Jesuit High School, and Christopher Knight, 
Superintendent of Toledo Catholic Schools.
Discussion about the academic advantages of a Catholic education, as well as how our diocesan schools 
are dedicated to faith formation and development of the total person in each student. Also talked about 
the latest educational tools and ways to assist with tuition.

2/18/15 - GUEST: Dr. Marcellino D’Ambrosio, author of “40 Days, 40 Ways- A New Look At Lent, 
who explained the history of our Lenten practices, origin of Lent, and shared practical daily activities 
and devotions detailed in his book. The second half of the show featured the recorded keynote address of 
Toledo Bishop Daniel Thomas at the Live In My Love marriage dinner delivered on February 14th.

2/25/15 - GUEST: Fr. Adam Hertzfeld, Pastor St. Joan of Arc Toledo and St. Richard, Swanton.
Father Adam explained how the Sacrament of Confession is applied, what conditions must exist, how 
we can receive the graces of God’s forgiveness and how to make a good confession. Also discussed: 
living in a culture that has lost its sense of sin, mortal and venial sin, and other related topics.

3/4/15 - GUEST: Monsignor Christopher Vasko, Judicial Vicar and Diocesan Tribunal, Dean and Pastor
Msgr. Vasko talked about how the 10 commandments guide us and teach us how to love and serve God. 
We also discussed the reason we give things up for Lent and other penances and practices.

3/11/15 - GUEST: Monsignor Charles Singler, Director of Divine Worship and Vocations of the 
Diocese of Toledo.
A discussion and teaching on the liturgical observances of Holy Week from Palm Sunday of the Passion 
Of The Lord to Easter Sunday. Tenebrae, Chrism Mass, Good Friday, Holy Saturday we all detailed.

3/18/15 - GUEST: Fr. James Kubicki, Apostleship of Prayer Director
Father shared the Pope’s monthly intentions and explained Solemnities, Feasts and Memorials and how 
the Church marks special days. Also discussed ISIS threats against Pope Francis and talked about how 
to best observe our Lenten obligations to Prayer, Fasting and Almsgiving.



3/25/15 - SOLEMNITY OF THE ANNUNCIATION
GUESTS: Sr. Marilyn Marie Ellerbrock, SND and Rev. John Stowe, OSF Conv.
Rebroadcast of December 17, 2014 show. Guests described how discernment and formation take place 
in their respective orders.

ISSUE: LOCAL PROGRAMMING “Understanding Scripture with Father Dave

30 minute feature airs Sundays at 8:00am, Wednesdays at 8:00pm, Fridays at 8:30am and Saturdays at 
11:00am. Fr. Dave Nuss, Pastor of Little Flower parish in Toledo OH presents and explains the 
upcoming Sunday scripture readings.


