
Order #1121907: Katz Media../American B../AB PAC/6757
Date Action Line Comment By Total $ # Spots Expected GRP

05/16/24 2:56:57 PM Cash in Advance Removal [cleared cash in adv] CIA Clear
electronic payment processed

Natalie Terrance (natalie.terrance@cumulus.com)$2,625.00 15 0.00

05/16/24 2:52:48 PM Processed <sync process> Jennifer Coggin (jennifer.coggin1@cumulus.com)$2,625.00 15 0.00
05/16/24 2:50:50 PM Approved  Natalie Terrance (natalie.terrance@cumulus.com)$2,625.00 15 0.00
05/16/24 2:50:44 PM Approval Workflow [Centralized AR - Business Office

Approval Needed Default]
Natalie Terrance (natalie.terrance@cumulus.com)$2,625.00 15 0.00

05/16/24 2:17:06 PM Approval Workflow [Sales Manager - Ready Default] Elizabeth Pembleton (elizabeth.pembleton@cumulus.c$2,625.00 15 0.00
05/16/24 2:16:30 PM Ready for approval ELECTRONIC PAYMENT RECEIVED

and proof sent to Region9AR on 5-16-24
Elizabeth Pembleton (elizabeth.pembleton@cumulus.c$2,625.00 15 0.00

05/16/24 1:54:16 PM New order created Imported EC Order Marcy Kester (marcy.kester@cumulus.com)$2,625.00 15 0.00

 [Sorted by: Date]
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Name: 

Product Desc: 

Estimate: 6757

AB PAC

Flight Dates: 

Order / Rev: 

Original Date / Rev: 

1121907

05/21/24 - 05/26/24

05/16/24 / 05/16/24

American Bridge PAC

Katz Media Group

Primary AE: Katz Chicago

Billing Cycle: 

Billing Calendar: 

Billing Type: 

Agency Commission: 

EOM/EOC

Broadcast

15%

Cash

Demographic: 

Revenue Code 1: 

Product Codes: 

W35+

Issues/Propositions

AGY-AVAIL

WMGS-FM

Name: 

Buying Contact: 

Billing Contact: Erica Cooper

125 West 55th Street

New York, NY  10019

Priority: P-100

Order Separation: 00:30:00

Alt Order #: 37294098

Sales Office: K-7.5

Sales Region: N-Katz75

Advertiser External ID: 

Agency External ID: 

Order Type: GENERAL

New Business End:

ORDER

Month # Spots Gross Amount

Totals 

Net Amount Rating

May 2024 15 $2,625.00 $2,231.25 0.00

$2,625.0015Totals $2,231.25 0.00

Start Date End Date # Spots Gross Amount Net Amount

Bill Plan

04/29/24 05/24/24 15 $2,625.00 $2,231.25

Account Executive Order %Start Date / End DateSales Office

Account Executives

Sales Region

Katz Chicago 100%Start Of Order - End Of OrderK-7.5 N-Katz75

Orders

Advertiser

Agency

GeneralUnit Code: POL-ISSRevenue Code 2: 

GENRevenue Code 3: 

Ln Start End Inventory Code Start/End Time Days Spots Rate TypeLen Spots AmountPriBreakCh Rtg

M-F AM Drive
M-F

RT - 

1 05/21/24 05/26/24 6:00 AM-10:00 AM-TWTF-- 1:00 3 $175.00 NM 3 $525.00P-30CMN WMGS 0.00

Start Date End Date Weekdays Spots/Week Rate Rating
05/21/24 05/27/24 -TWTF-- 3 $175.00Week: 0.00

M-F Midday
M-F

RT - 

2 05/21/24 05/26/24 10:00 AM-3:00 PM-TWTF-- 1:00 9 $175.00 NM 9 $1,575.00P-30CMN WMGS 0.00

Start Date End Date Weekdays Spots/Week Rate Rating
05/21/24 05/27/24 -TWTF-- 9 $175.00Week: 0.00

M-F PM Drive
M-F

RT - 

3 05/21/24 05/26/24 3:00 PM-7:00 PM -TWTF-- 1:00 3 $175.00 NM 3 $525.00P-30CMN WMGS 0.00

Start Date End Date Weekdays Spots/Week Rate Rating
05/21/24 05/27/24 -TWTF-- 3 $175.00Week: 0.00

Totals 15 $2,625.00
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Elizabeth Pembleton

From: Ron Giovanniello
Sent: Thursday, May 16, 2024 2:14 PM
To: Region9AR
Cc: Matt Raback; Elizabeth Pembleton; Beth Coughlin
Subject: FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: [EXT]AB PAC Estimate #6757 Proof of Payment

 
From: Cavallone, Allison <Allison.Cavallone@Katzmedia.com>  
Sent: Thursday, May 16, 2024 2:11 PM 
To: Ron Giovanniello <ron.giovanniello@cumulus.com> 
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] FW: [EXT] AB PAC Estimate #6757 Proof of Payment 
Hi Ron,  
Yes, please continue to run the same spot for the new estimate #6757. Please see below for proof of payment.  
 
Thanks so much!  
 
 

 

 

 

Notification of Electronic Payment 
 

 

 

This message confirms that AMPLIFY MEDIA has initiated an 
electronic payment to Katz Group Sales via FastPay's ePay solution. 
Please see the payment details below. 

 

 

  
 

Total Amount 

$50,137.25 
 

 

 
Company 
AMPLIFY MEDIA 

 

Vendor 
Katz Group Sales 

 

 
Memo 
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AB PAC PA Radio Est. #6757 05/21/24 - 05/24/24 
 

 

Estimate # 

Est. #6757 

 

 

 
 

  
 

 

  
 

Have questions about this payment? 
  

Please contact FastPay support at 
844-GET-EPAY or payments@gofastpay.com 

or Live Chat with a member of our team. 

 

 

  
 

 

 

  
FastPay 

844-GET-EPAY 
8201 Beverly Blvd, Suite 600 

LA / SF / NY / BOS / LDN 

  
 

 

 

 
 
 
 
Allison Cavallone 
Account Coordinator 
233 N. Michigan Avenue, Suite 3050 | Chicago, IL 60601 
allison.cavallone@katzmedia.com 

 


