
1271685 history
Date Action Line Comment By Total $ # Spots Expected GRP
04/04/24 3:24:37 PM Processed <async process> John Dillingham (john.dillingham@cumulus.com)$0.00 0 0.00
04/04/24 3:15:26 PM Approved  Jessica Lear (jlear@cumulus.com)$0.00 0 0.00
04/04/24 3:15:24 PM Approval Workflow [Centralized AR - Business Office

Approval Needed Default]
Jessica Lear (jlear@cumulus.com)$0.00 0 0.00

04/04/24 3:13:59 PM Approval Workflow [Sales Manager - Ready Default] John Rowe (jrowe@cumulus.com)$0.00 0 0.00
04/04/24 3:13:54 PM Ready for approval Ready, this order was incorrect.  The AE

charged ISSUES rates for a candidate.  I
have deleted all three lines.  There is a
new order that is replacing this one at the
correct rates.  The LUR for that order
does not apply since we are outside the
win

John Rowe (jrowe@cumulus.com)$0.00 0 0.00

04/04/24 3:12:15 PM Put in Edit Mode  John Rowe (jrowe@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00
04/04/24 10:38:27 AM Canceled Changes <user discard> Bill Schultz (bschultz@cumulus.com)$0.00 0 0.00
04/04/24 10:19:21 AM Ready for approval Delete order new order coming Bill Schultz (bschultz@cumulus.com)$0.00 0 0.00
04/04/24 10:18:59 AM Put in Edit Mode  Bill Schultz (bschultz@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00
04/01/24 2:31:33 PM Put in Edit Mode  John Rowe (jrowe@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00
04/01/24 2:30:11 PM Put in Edit Mode  John Rowe (jrowe@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00

04/01/24 10:08:01 AM Processed <async process> John Dillingham (john.dillingham@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00
04/01/24 9:19:48 AM Approved  Jessica Lear (jlear@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00
04/01/24 9:19:45 AM Approval Workflow [Centralized AR - Business Office

Approval Needed Default]
Jessica Lear (jlear@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00

04/01/24 9:17:05 AM Approval Workflow [Sales Manager - Ready Default] John Rowe (jrowe@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00
04/01/24 9:17:01 AM Ready for approval Ready corrected Rev 2 &3 John Rowe (jrowe@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00
04/01/24 9:16:02 AM Put in Edit Mode  John Rowe (jrowe@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00

03/29/24 12:40:08 PM Cash in Advance Removal [cleared cash in adv] cc payment
received - paid in full

Jessica Lear (jlear@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00

03/29/24 11:52:06 AM Processed <async process> John Dillingham (john.dillingham@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00
03/29/24 11:22:32 AM Approved  Jessica Lear (jlear@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00
03/29/24 11:22:29 AM Approval Workflow [Centralized AR - Business Office

Approval Needed Default]
Jessica Lear (jlear@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00

03/29/24 11:12:12 AM Approval Workflow [Sales Manager - Ready Default] Lori Goldapske (lgoldapske@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00
03/29/24 9:47:22 AM Ready for approval Ready Bill Schultz (bschultz@cumulus.com)$600.00 22 0.00
03/29/24 9:31:44 AM New order created <new order> Bill Schultz (bschultz@cumulus.com)$0.00 0 0.00
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Product Desc: 

Estimate: 

Green Lake Town Hall

Flight Dates: 

Original Date / Rev: 

04/19/24 - 04/25/24

03/29/24 / 04/04/24

Primary AE: Bill Schultz

Billing Cycle: 

Billing Calendar: 

Billing Type: 

Agency Commission: 

EOM/EOC

Calendar

0%

Cash

Demographic: 

Revenue Codes: 

Product Codes: 

A25-54

Candidates

DIR

WOSH-AM

Buying Contact: 

Billing Contact: 

525 N Peters Ave

Fond du Lac, WI  54937

Priority: P-100

Order Separation: 00:15:00

Alt Order #: 

Sales Office: L-APP

Sales Region: Local

Advertiser External ID: 

Agency External ID: 

Order Type: GENERAL

New Business End:

ORDER

Account Executive Order %Start Date / End DateSales Office

Account Executives

Sales Region

Bill Schultz 100%Start Of Order - End Of OrderL-APP Local

Order / Rev: 1271685Orders

Grothman/R/Congress-DirectName: Agency

Name: Grothman/R/Congress-DirectAdvertiser

GeneralUnit Code: POL-CANDRevenue Codes 2: 

POL-US CONGRESSRevenue Codes 3: 







From: Svoboda, Timothy <Timothy.Svoboda@mail.house.gov>
Sent: Thursday, March 28, 2024 9:13 AM
To: Bill Schultz <Bill.Schultz@cumulus.com>
Cc: Young, Noelle <Noelle.Young@mail.house.gov>
Subject: RE: [EXT]Radio Ads
 
Thanks!
 
This schedule looks good to me.
 
The NAB form is attached.
 
Do we pay online or is there another form to fill out?
 
From: Bill Schultz <Bill.Schultz@cumulus.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 28, 2024 9:33 AM
To: Svoboda, Timothy <Timothy.Svoboda@mail.house.gov>
Cc: Young, Noelle <Noelle.Young@mail.house.gov>
Subject: Re: [EXT]Radio Ads
 
Hi Tim,
Nice hearing from you.  Since the Congressman will be addressing issues we will need 
to use the issue rate card and I would suggest the following schedule:
All ads run April 19-April 25 until about 1 hour before the town hall meeting is to start.  I 
assume these are :30 second commercials.  
15 ads run 11a-3pm- Between Dan Bongino & Ben Shapiro @ $28
5 ads run 6a-10a- Phil Cianciola Show @ $35
2 ads 5a-6a Red Eye Radio@ $2.50
22 ads $600
 
Please approve and fill out the NAB form.  Also we will need cash in advance before the 
start of the schedule.
 
 
 
Bill Schultz
Account Executive
Cumulus Radio Station Group / Appleton Oshkosh
O: 920-230-0801
M: 920-419-0425
 
491 S Washburn St. Oshkosh, Wi. 54904
cumulusmedia.com
 

https://nam02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Furldefense.com%2Fv3%2F__http%3A%2Fcumulusmedia.com__%3B!!Bg5easoyC-OII2vlEqY8mTBrtW-N4OJKAQ!NIOmDWwoOO5-QCcu2nwaoBHvjk2iAlHQGODDzFFqB0fgIemGBEq-wkWvQ-f7TrHDbeYf_j09l_WfTZZ1qz35Jhc6UXvhDsupujE%24&data=05%7C02%7CBill.Schultz%40cumulus.com%7C39982dfb6bf94a93e0cd08dc4f31362f%7Ce5d6709fbecf4b058cee37f5a62617c4%7C0%7C0%7C638472320266775426%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=h56iMYcZLg8ap8zcobsR%2FT64rerYwsZyemUuMvqlCj0%3D&reserved=0

