
Order #1255659: We Can Do ../We Can Do ../Issue Adve../
Date Action Line Comment By Total $ # Spots Expected GRP
03/04/24 4:09:13 PM Cash in Advance Removal [cleared cash in adv] received ck#1340

$3035 paid in full
Jessica Lear (jlear@cumulus.com)$740.00 17 0.00

03/04/24 3:40:26 PM Processed <async process> John Dillingham (john.dillingham@cumulus.com)$740.00 17 0.00
03/04/24 3:32:58 PM Approved  Jessica Lear (jlear@cumulus.com)$740.00 17 0.00
03/04/24 3:32:41 PM Approval Workflow [Centralized AR - Business Office

Approval Needed Default]
Jessica Lear (jlear@cumulus.com)$740.00 17 0.00

03/04/24 3:15:01 PM Approval Workflow [Sales Manager - Ready Default] John Rowe (jrowe@cumulus.com)$740.00 17 0.00
03/04/24 3:14:18 PM Ready for approval Ready John Rowe (jrowe@cumulus.com)$740.00 17 0.00

03/04/24 12:26:43 PM Unapproved please upload the NAB form as well Jessica Lear (jlear@cumulus.com)$740.00 17 0.00
03/04/24 12:00:09 PM Ready for approval Ready Bill Schultz (bschultz@cumulus.com)$740.00 17 0.00
03/04/24 11:50:19 AM New order created <new order> Bill Schultz (bschultz@cumulus.com)$0.00 0 0.00

 [Sorted by: Date]
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Name: 

Product Desc: 

Estimate: 

Issue Advertising

Flight Dates: 

Order / Rev: 

Original Date / Rev: 

1255659

03/11/24 - 03/29/24

03/04/24 / 03/04/24

We Can Do Better

We Can Do Better

Primary AE: Bill Schultz

Billing Cycle: 

Billing Calendar: 

Billing Type: 

Agency Commission: 

EOM/EOC

Calendar

0%

Cash

Demographic: 

Revenue Code 1: 

Product Codes: 

A25-54

Issues/Propositions

DIR

WOSH-AM

Name: 

Buying Contact: 

Billing Contact: Len Kachinsky

832 Neff Court

Neenah, WI  54956

Priority: P-100

Order Separation: 00:15:00

Alt Order #: 

Sales Office: L-APP

Sales Region: Local

Advertiser External ID: 

Agency External ID: 

Order Type: GENERAL

New Business End:

ORDER

Month # Spots Gross Amount

Totals 

Net Amount Rating

March 2024 17 $740.00 $740.00 0.00

$740.0017Totals $740.00 0.00

Start Date End Date # Spots Gross Amount Net Amount

Bill Plan

03/01/24 03/29/24 17 $740.00 $740.00

Account Executive Order %Start Date / End DateSales Office

Account Executives

Sales Region

Bill Schultz 100%Start Of Order - End Of OrderL-APP Local

Orders

Advertiser

Agency

GeneralUnit Code: POL-ISSRevenue Code 2: 

GENRevenue Code 3: 

Ln Start End Inventory Code Start/End Time Days Spots Rate TypeLen Spots AmountPriBreakCh Rtg

M-F AM Drive
M-F (6:00 AM-10:00 AM)

1 03/11/24 03/15/24 6:00 AM-10:00 AMMTWTF-- 1:00 6 $50.00 NM 6 $300.00P-50CMN WOSHA 0.00

Start Date End Date Weekdays Spots/Week Rate Rating
03/11/24 03/17/24 MTWTF-- 6 $50.00Week: 0.00

M-F Midday
M-F

2 03/18/24 03/22/24 10a-3p MTWTF-- 1:00 6 $40.00 NM 6 $240.00P-50CMN WOSHA 0.00

Start Date End Date Weekdays Spots/Week Rate Rating
03/18/24 03/24/24 MTWTF-- 6 $40.00Week: 0.00

M-F PM Drive
M-F

3 03/25/24 03/29/24 3p-7p MTWTF-- 1:00 5 $40.00 NM 5 $200.00P-50CMN WOSHA 0.00

Start Date End Date Weekdays Spots/Week Rate Rating
03/25/24 03/31/24 MTWTF-- 5 $40.00Week: 0.00

Totals 17 $740.00







From: Len Kachinsky <lkachinsky@core.com>
Sent: Saturday, March 2, 2024 6:11 PM
To: Bill Schultz <Bill.Schultz@cumulus.com>
Subject: Re: [EXT]We Can Do Better advertising on Cumulus
 

You don't often get email from lkachinsky@core.com. Learn why this is important ​

Bill-- Schedule is fine.  I expect the Rust ad to inspire lots of hysteria from the 
LGBtQ folks even though it only targets free speech and not them. If you get 
inquiries, my name is releaseable as the principal behind We Can Do Better.

Check is made out.  Money is in my attorney trust account to cover it for We 
Can Do Better.  Check No. 1340.

I am a bit laid up right now so if you could pick it up, that would be great.  I live 
by Fritse Park in Fox Crossing.  When would you like to pick it up?  I can put it 
taped on the front door.

On 3/2/2024 4:29 PM, Bill Schultz wrote:
Hi Len,
The phone number I received was (829) 841-6706.  Didn't know if you left Neenah to 
retire in D.R.  At any rate:  
Your total for your schedule right now is only $1,430.  Here is my proposed schedule to 
be close to your $3,000 budget

Schedule runs 3/11- 3/29

Week 1 M-F 6a-10a- 6x on WVBO ($100 per ad), 6x on WOSH ($50 per ad), 6x on 
WNAM ($50 per ad) $1,200 total

Week 2 M-F 10a-3p - 6x on WVBO ($80 per ad), 6x on WOSH ($40 per ad), 6x on 
WNAM ($40 per ad) $960 total

Week 3 M-F 3p-7p - 5x on WVBO ($90 per ad), 6x on WOSH ($40 per ad), 6x on 
WNAM ($45 per ad) $875 total

Total $3,035

No problem on us doing the production and rotating the ads as you desire.  For now, 
this confirmation by email will do for confirming the total.  I need a check before I can 

https://aka.ms/LearnAboutSenderIdentification


run a copy of the orders for you.  Will this email do for the confirmation of the order?  
Once I place the order, I can send you an official confirmation.  With political ads, my 
hands are tied, and I need the payment before I can run the orders.  Make the check out 
to: Cumulus.  

If this is okay, reply back to confirm and then let me know when you will be dropping off 
the check.  I prefer you dropping off the check, or I can pick it up.  I live in Neenah.  Let 
me know.  

Bill Schultz
Account Executive
Cumulus Radio Station Group / Appleton Oshkosh
O: 920-230-0801
M: 920-419-0425
 
491 S Washburn St. Oshkosh, Wi. 54904
cumulusmedia.com
 


