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Product

Oct - Nov 2020

Contract Dates

Original Date / Revision

10/19/20 - 11/03/20

10/15/2010/15/20Metzger for State Senate

Property Sales OfficeAccount Executive

National - DirectShari Lynch_L03371

Billing Cycle Billing Calendar Cash/Trade

EOM/EOC Broadcast Cash

And:

WRRV-FM
2 Pendell Road
Poughkeepsie, NY  12601
(845) 471-1500

WRRV-FM

Contract Agreement Between:

CONTRACT
Alt Order #

 / 

Contract / Revision

2126955  / 

Estimate #

Special Handling

Advertiser

Agy Code Product 1/2Advertiser Code

Agency Ref Advertiser Ref

Demographic

Households

BrownMillerGroup
222 Broadway 19th Floor
New York, NY  10038

Ch*Line Start Date End Date Description
Start/End
Time Days Week Rate TypeLength

Spots/
Spots Amount

1 10/19/20 11/03/20 M-F AM Drive 6a-10a :30 NM 28 $1,344.00N WRRV
Start Date End Date Weekdays Spots/Week Rate
10/19/20 10/25/20 22222-- 10 $48.00Week: 
10/26/20 11/01/20 22222-- 10 $48.00Week: 
11/02/20 11/08/20 44----- 8 $48.00Week: 

Totals 28 $1,344.00

Time Period # of Spots Gross Amount Net AmountAgency Comm.

09/28/20 10 $480.00 $408.0010/25/20- ($72.00)

10/26/20 18 $864.00 $734.4011/03/20- ($129.60)

$1,142.40$1,344.0028Totals ($201.60)

Signature: Date: 

(* Line Transactions:  N = New, E = Edited, D = Deleted)
Notwithstanding to whom bills are rendered, advertiser, agency and service, jointly and severally, shall remain obligated to pay to station the amount of any bills rendered by station within the time specified and until

payment in full is received by station.  Payment by advertiser to agency or to service or payment by agency to service, shall not constitute payment to station.  Station will not be bound by conditions. printed or
otherwise contracts, insertion orders, copy instructions or any correspondence when such conflict with the above terms and conditions.  Two week advance cancellation notice is required unless otherwise specified.
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Michele Franks

From: Shari Lynch
Sent: Thursday, October 15, 2020 10:15 AM
To: Michele Franks; Robyn Scarchilli; Marisa Bisaccia; Kristin Cummings
Cc: Jason Finkelberg; Sandi Mancuso
Subject: FW: Metzger Radio Ads
Attachments: Metzger NAB-PB-19 Form - Candidate Advertisements.pdf

Hi all – 
 
Attached is the schedule approval and the NAB for the Metzger campaign.   
 
You can charge the credit card and process the below order. 
 
THANKS!! 
 
 

You can actually air as follows: 

10/19‐10/25 – 2x per day = 10x AM Drive 

10/26‐ 11/1 – 2x per day = 10x AM Drive 

11/2‐11/3 – 4x per day = 8x AM Drive 

  

28x (:30’s) @ $48 gross = $1,344 gross, $1142.40 net due. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
Shari Lynch 
Townsquare Media 
(848) 221‐8143 (O) 
(732) 995‐6586 (M) 
 

 
Townsquare Media does not discriminate in advertising sales based on race or ethnicity. Any provision in any order or agreement for advertising that 
purports to discriminate on the basis of race or ethnicity, even if handwritten, typed or otherwise made a part of a particular contract, will be rejected. 
 

From: Lacey Seidman <lacey@jenmetzger.com>  
Sent: Thursday, October 15, 2020 10:12 AM 
To: Shari Lynch <shari.lynch@townsquaremedia.com> 
Subject: Fwd: Metzger Radio Ads 
 
Thank you for the clarification, Shari!   
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If we're paying net, the schedule below is approved, and the NAB is attached to this email. Leah, our 
campaign manager left the start day blank. 
Please let me know if you need anything else from this end. And thanks again for your patience. 
Best, 
Lacey 
 

I just reviewed the political rate card and, yes, $48 is the gross rate for WRRV. 

  

$1355 gross will net down to $1152 net. 

  

You can actually air as follows: 

10/19‐10/25 – 2x per day = 10x AM Drive 

10/26‐ 11/1 – 2x per day = 10x AM Drive 

11/2‐11/3 – 4x per day = 8x AM Drive 

  

28x (:30’s) @ $48 gross = $1,344 gross, $1142.40 net due. 

 

‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐ Forwarded message ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐ 
From: Leah Goldman <leah@jenmetzger.com> 
Date: Wed, Oct 14, 2020 at 9:10 PM 
Subject: Re: Metzger Radio Ads 
To: Lacey Seidman <lacey@jenmetzger.com> 
 

Here you go!   
 
Only thing I left blank was the first day it will be shown. 

 

‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐ Forwarded message ‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐ 
From: Shari Lynch <shari.lynch@townsquaremedia.com> 
Date: Thu, Oct 8, 2020 at 9:05 AM 
Subject: RE: Metzger Radio Ads 
To: Lacey Seidman <lacey@jenmetzger.com> 
 

Hi – 
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We will need the “paid for by Jen Metzger for congress, etc.” and this is Jen and I approved” 

 Federal Candidates:  I’m Joe Smith and I “approve this message” 
 All Candidates and Issues: Is who paid for the message identified in the ad.  “This is Jen and I approved 

this ad, paid for by Metzger for State Senate” 

  

Also, I attached a NAB form, in case you need it. 

  

Thanks! 

  

Shari 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

Shari Lynch 

Townsquare Media 

(848) 221‐8143 (O) 

(732) 995‐6586 (M) 

  

  

Townsquare Media does not discriminate in advertising sales based on race or ethnicity. Any provision in any order or agreement for 
advertising that purports to discriminate on the basis of race or ethnicity, even if handwritten, typed or otherwise made a part of a particular 
contract, will be rejected. 
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From: Lacey Seidman <lacey@jenmetzger.com>  
Sent: Thursday, October 8, 2020 8:58 AM 
To: Shari Lynch <shari.lynch@townsquaremedia.com> 
Subject: Re: Metzger Radio Ads 

  

Good morning, Shari!   

  

For your political ads, is "Paid for by..." sufficient? Or do you need the race IDed? 

  

Thank you! We should have it delivered in the coming days. 

  

Best, 

Lacey 

  

On Thu, Sep 24, 2020 at 11:04 AM Lacey Seidman <lacey@jenmetzger.com> wrote: 

Thanks so much fo this, Shari. I'll be in touch soon!  

Best, 

Lacey 

  

On Mon, Sep 21, 2020 at 2:11 PM Shari Lynch <shari.lynch@townsquaremedia.com> wrote: 

I just reviewed the political rate card and, yes, $48 is the gross rate for WRRV. 

  

$1355 gross will net down to $1152 net. 

  

You can actually air as follows: 

10/19‐10/25 – 2x per day = 10x AM Drive 

10/26‐ 11/1 – 2x per day = 10x AM Drive 
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11/2‐11/3 – 4x per day = 8x AM Drive 

  

28x (:30’s) @ $48 gross = $1,344 gross, $1142.40 net due. 

  

  

Shari 

  

  

  

  

  

Shari Lynch 

Townsquare Media 

(848) 221‐8143 (O) 

(732) 995‐6586 (M) 

  

  

Townsquare Media does not discriminate in advertising sales based on race or ethnicity. Any provision in any order or 
agreement for advertising that purports to discriminate on the basis of race or ethnicity, even if handwritten, typed or otherwise 
made a part of a particular contract, will be rejected. 

  

From: Lacey Seidman <lacey@jenmetzger.com>  
Sent: Monday, September 21, 2020 1:15 PM 
To: Shari Lynch <shari.lynch@townsquaremedia.com> 
Subject: Metzger Radio Ads 

  

Hello, Shari‐ Lacey from Sen. Jen Metzger's team here.   

Putting my other hat on for a moment and writing to you from this non‐Government account 
to get the ball rolling on ads for the Senator's campaign.   
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The campaign has budgeted $1,152 for :30 ads to be delivered to WRRV listeners 8 times per 
week (once or twice a day) during weekday mornings, 10/19 ‐ 11/3. That's assuming the rate 
is still $48 each, but if there are specials I'm unaware of, please let me know. 

Looking forward to working with you on this! 

Lacey 

  

‐‐  

Lacey Seidman  

lacey@jenmetzger.com 

  

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 

  

  

  

Internet Email Warning 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open 
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  

  

  

Internet Email Warning 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments 
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  

  

  

Internet Email Warning 
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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