
ISSUES AND PROGRAMS LIST
4th Quarter – October 1 to December 31, 2016

WRDI/Nappanee, IN
*Note:  All times listed are Eastern

ISSUE: HEALTH
 
10/03/16 at 13:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, 
answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. On today’s 
show, help for parents to avoid self-blame when assessing their parenting and other personal 
endeavors .
 
10/04/16 at 13:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, 
answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. Dr. Ray 
explains how to seek and recognize genuinely healthy, helpful advice.

11/16/16 at 13:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, 
answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. Dr. Ray 
discusses identifying and managing dementia.
 
11/17/16 at 13:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, 
answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. Dr. Ray 
discusses how greater awareness leads to gratefulness.

12/28/16 at 13:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, 
answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. Dr. Ray 
discussed how to identify and manage personality disorders.
 
12/29/16 at 13:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, 
answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children. Dr. Ray 
helps callers who are struggling with meaning for existence and hoplessness.

ISSUE: EDUCATIONAL
 
10/07/16 at 18:00…Catholic Answers Live…60 minutes…Host Patrick Coffin and/or other Catholic 
Answer stand-in host educate listeners about the intricacies of Catholic Teaching and Faith. 
Topics covered included friendship and the heart of holiness.
 
10/14/16 at 18:00…Catholic Answers Live…60 minutes…Host Patrick Coffin and/or other Catholic 
Answer stand-in host educate listeners about the intricacies of Catholic Teaching and Faith. . 
Topics covered included unpacking Augustine’s Confessions. .
 
11/02/16 at 18:00…Catholic Answers Live…60 minutes…Host Patrick Coffin and/or other Catholic 
Answer stand-in host educate listeners about the intricacies of Catholic Teaching and Faith. 
Topics covered included purgatory and the Bible.
 



11/07/16 at 18:00…Catholic Answers Live…60 minutes…Host Patrick Coffin and/or other Catholic 
Answer stand-in host educate listeners about the intricacies of Catholic Teaching and Faith. 
Topics covered included in-depth discussion of the book of Ephesians.

12/02/16 at 18:00…Catholic Answers Live…60 minutes…Host Patrick Coffin and/or other Catholic 
Answer stand-in host educate listeners about the intricacies of Catholic Teaching and Faith. 
Topics covered included relativism and tolerance from a Catholic perspective.
                                                                                                                
12/13/16 at 18:00…Catholic Answers Live…60 minutes…Host Patrick Coffin and/or other Catholic 
Answer stand-in host educate listeners about the intricacies of Catholic Teaching and Faith. 
Topics covered included invitro fertilization and Catholic reproductive teaching.

ISSUE: PUBLIC INTEREST
 
10/07/16 at 16:00…Kresta in the Afternoon…120 minutes…Host Al Kresta’s daily current events 
show discusses the salient points of today’s news and other subjects of personal interest to 
Catholics. On this program, a recent survey shows that 1 in 14 Americans has lost a friend over 
this election. How would this election have been different if everyone applied the principles of the 
Year of Mercy?

10/10/16 at 16:00…Kresta in the Afternoon…120 minutes…Host Al Kresta’s daily current events 
show discusses the salient points of today’s news and other subjects of personal interest to 
Catholics. On this program, William Kilpatrick joins us for a “politically incorrect” look at Jihad.

11-09-16 at 15:00…The Drew Mariani Show…57 minutes… Guests Peter Grandich, Brian Burch, Ed 
Morrissey, Professor Teresa Collett, Dr. Gerard Lameiro, and Dr. Rachel Lu discuss post-election 
analysis, including a conversation with one man who persistently predicted that Donald Trump 
would win.

11/23/16 at 16:00…Kresta in the Afternoon…120 minutes…Host Al Kresta’s daily current events 
show discusses the salient points of today’s news and other subjects of personal interest to 
Catholics. On this program, Jarrett Stepman joins us to explain why the US uses an Electoral 
College rather than a popular vote.
 
11/28/16 at 16:00…Kresta in the Afternoon…120 minutes…Host Al Kresta’s daily current events 
show discusses the salient points of today’s news and other subjects of personal interest to 
Catholics.  On this show, one of the most brutal dictators in modern history has just died. Oddly 
enough, some will mourn his passing, and many an obituary will praise him.

12/02/16 at 16:00…Kresta in the Afternoon…120 minutes…Host Al Kresta’s daily current events 
show discusses the salient points of today’s news and other subjects of personal interest to 
Catholics. On this show, Euthanasia advocates claim the practice will only be used for terminally 
ill patients in pain and will not be abused. That claim doesn’t hold up when you look at recent 
stories from countries where the practice is legal. Al takes a look with Wes Smith.

12/15/16 at 16:00…Kresta in the Afternoon…120 minutes…Host Al Kresta’s daily current events 
show discusses the salient points of today’s news and other subjects of personal interest to 
Catholics. On this show, a leading expert in human embryology has predicted that the United 
Kingdom’s first “three-parent” child could happen as soon as next year.

12-20-16 at 15:30…The Drew Mariani Show…15 minutes…Guest: Professor Robert George talked 
about so-called SOGI laws – Sexual Orientation and Gender Identity laws – that will impact 
Catholics.


