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WJTA 88.9FM Holy Family Radio 

ISSUES AND PROGRAMS:  SECOND QUARTER 2018 
  

ISSUE:  YOUTH PROGRAMMING 
  

Show: 
Date 
Time: 
Duration: 

Call Me Catholic 
5/5/2018 
1pm 
30m 

The month of May always surprises us. In the Call Me 
Catholic Countdown, Peggy lists the top five things to look 
for in the coming month of May. Pam Hurwitz and her 
daughter Jyllian Rhodes are both highly respected youth 
ministry leaders in the diocese of Orange. They discuss their 
winning formula for building and growing programs for teens 
in our Church. Peggy continues her conversation with Pam 
and Jyllian as they discuss their new ministry “Family + Faith 
Collective“, a program to help families cultivate more faith 
and communication in their home. They also take calls from 
listeners with questions or comments about their 
experiences in youth ministry. 

Show: 
Date 
Time: 
Duration: 

Catholic Playlist 
4/9/2018 
10pm 
60m 

Playing the best and newest contemporary Christian music 
from Catholic artists, young listeners get a chance to hear 
music they won’t hear anywhere else on the radio. 

 

ISSUE:  FAMILY, PARENTING AND RELATIONSHIPS 
   

Show:          
Date 
Time:  
Duration:  

Register Radio 
5/19/2018 
4pm 
30m 

One of America’s venerable institutions for young men has 
changed itself forever. The Boy Scouts of America has 
abandoned its name, and we talk about what it means for 
Catholic families with Thomas McDonald. Plus, first, we 
catch up on all of the news from the Vatican, including an 
historic conference on the Inquisition. Join Jeanette DeMelo, 
and co-host, Matthew Bunson, for Register Radio. 

Show:          
Date 
Time:  
Duration:  

Call Me Catholic 
5/12/2018 
1pm 
30m 

Everyone rushes out to buy their mother flowers for Mother’s 
Day but do you know what each blossom means? In the Call 
Me Catholic Countdown, Peggy lists the top five flowers to 
give your Mother based on each variety’s symbolism. The 
Audiogirls are back! Entertainment pros Sylvia Aimerito and 
Lori Rae Martin discuss the latest news from their proactive 
profile ministry. Lori Rae and Sylvia continue their discussion 
with Peggy about ways we all can be a bold and active voice 
for the unborn. And take calls from listeners who have a 
question or comment. Peggy also challenges the Audiogirls 
to a game of “Catholic This or Catholic That?” 

 

ISSUE:  HEALTH 
  

Show:          
Date 
Time:  
Duration:  

Kresta in the Afternoon 
4/25/2018 
4pm 
60m 

On Monday, British citizens joyously welcomed the third 
child of Prince William of Cambridge and Duchess Kate 
Middleton. But on the same day this little boy entered the 
world, another little boy - Alife Evans - was taken off his 
ventilator despite international protest and an Italian offer to 
take him to Rome for care. Alfie has survived 36 hours, as 
late this afternoon British time. After 28 hours, doctors finally 
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fed him. But today hospital officials kicked out paramedics 
from an air ambulance waiting to take Alfie to Italy. We'll get 
more on this horrible story from Geneveive Marnon. 

Show:          
Date 
Time:  
Duration:  

Kresta in the Afternoon 
4/13/2018 
5pm 
60m 

Dr. Tom Catena is the only surgeon in a war-torn region of 
Sudan with nearly one million people. He’s on-call 24/7, 
serving the sick and injured of the mountainous area. How 
does he do it? “I take my role model as Jesus Christ. I think 
Christ is really calling us to give up our baggage -- whatever 
it is." His incredible work is the subject of a new 
documentary – the Heart of Nuba. We’ll talk with producer 
Ken Carlson. 

  
 

ISSUE:  EDUCATIONAL  
  

Show:          
Date 
Time:  
Duration: 

Call Me Catholic 
4/14/2018 
1pm 
30m 

The earliest Christians thrived through the generous 
hospitality of others. In the Call Me Catholic Countdown, 
Peggy explores the top five ways we can embody the spirit of 
Christian hospitality in our modern lifestyles. Tracy Bejotte, 
Chief Operating Officer of Caritas Communities, discusses 
how her organization brings Christian values to affordable 
housing communities throughout California. Tom Mauro, 
Chief Missions Officer for Caritas Communities, joins the 
conversation and shares the ways in which their non profit 
organization improves the lifestyles of affordable housing 
residents through enrichment programs for all ages. In 
Chatting with Catholics, Peggy takes her microphone to a 
classroom of second graders preparing for their First Holy 
Communion and asks the young students how they are 
getting ready for their big day. 

 
ISSUE:  PUBLIC INTEREST 
  

Show:          
Date 
Time:  
Duration:  

EWTN News Nightly 
6/13/2018 
9pm 
30m 

News and analysis from Washington, D.C. 

Show:          
Date 
Time:  
Duration:  

Morning Glory 
6/14/2018 
7am 
60m 

Morning Glory is blessed to have Father Patrick Mary with us 
discussing 25 years of the priesthood for our Father Joseph 
Mary Wolfe! Guests include Dr. Terrence Wright on Dorothy 
Day, Doug Eldridge on the FIFA World Cup kicking off today, 
and we talk 'Making Room for God' with Mary Elizabeth 
Sperry of the USCCB--all on a fun Thursday edition of 
Morning Glory! 

 


