






1

From: Angela Sullivan <[redacted]@ilfb.org>
Sent: Monday, September 28, 2020 2:03 PM
To: [redacted]
Cc: [redacted]
Subject: RE: {External} WNSV, WBEQam, WMIX am & fm

Importance: Low

Yes Ma’am! সহ঺঻ 

Angela~ 

From: Cebrina Hardy <[redacted]@ilfb.org>  
Sent: Monday, September 28, 2020 1:52 PM 
To: [redacted]
Cc: [redacted]
Subject: RE: {External} WNSV, WBEQam, WMIX am & fm 

Angela, 

Are payments still scheduled to go out on the 30th?  

Thank you,  

Cebrina Hardy 
Audio Services Business Manager 
Illinois Farm Bureau® 
309-557-3163
800-788-3163

From: [redacted]
Sent: Monday, September 28, 2020 1:50 PM 
To: [redacted]
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