
Quarterly Issues and Programs List for Station KWBC-College Station TX 
January 1-March 1, 2024 
 
(1) College Station (CSISD) bond election in May 2024 

 
Date and time  Program Name:  Duration: Summary of news story: 
 
2/4/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  1:09  College Station ISD school board decides to ask  

voters a third time to approve bond issues to pay for 
renovating and expanding athletic facilities at 
Consolidated and College Station High Schools. 

 
2/25/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  1:32  College Station ISD’s athletics director and two head  

football coaches shares reasons to consider voting for  
bond issues in May and new state rules that will lead  
to shortening and cancelling outdoor practices  
between July 1 and September 1. 

 
3/24/2024 at 8:20 a.m. College Station Recap  :31  College Station ISD school board members are told  

that starting soon will be the public information  
campaign for the May bond election 

          
 
(2) Other Issues addressed by the College Station (CSISD) school district 
 
Date and time  Program Name:  Duration: Summary of news story: 
 
1/14/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :56  College Station ISD’s annual review of campus  

enrollment numbers includes one elementary campus 
that is overcrowded while four other elementary 
campuses are underutilized. 

 
2/25/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :41  College Station ISD school board members hire fire  

new administrators, including a new assistant 
superintendent for teaching and learning. 

 
2/25/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :60  College Station ISD school board votes to complies  

with a new state law but decides to continue with its 
current policy regarding considering chaplains for paid 
and volunteer positions. 

 
3/24/2023 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :53  College Station ISD school board members approve  

adding a third band director at two high schools while 
administrators are study staffing changes for the next 
school year. 

 
3/24/2023 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :50  College Station ISD administrators tell school board  

members about obstacles as work starts on 
developing a budget for the next school year. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



(3) Issues addressed by the College Station city council 
 
Date and time  Program Name:  Duration: Summary of news story: 
 
1/7/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :60  College Station city council approves issuing $9  

million dollars in bonds to build more roads in the 
Southern Pointe residential municipal utility district. 

 
2/25/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :56  College Station city council members get a first year  

review of Amazon’s drone delivery service, which 
includes noise complaints from neighboring 
homeowners. 
 

3/3/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :33  College Station city council is asked to consider  
building a professional level disc golf course after the 
city of Bryan closes a recently opened facility 
following neighborhood opposition. 

 
 
(4) Issues involving Texas A&M University and the A&M System 
 
Date and time  Program Name:  Duration: Summary of news story: 
 
1/7/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :35  Texas A&M system board of regents approve  

construction of a $43 million dollar science, 
technology, engineering, and mathematics building on 
the RELLIS campus. 

 
1/7/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :48  Texas A&M’s president gives an update on complying  

with a new state law that eliminates diversity, equity, 
and inclusion (DEI) offices. 

 
1/14/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :33  Texas A&M system board of regents approves the  

first renovation of the A&M memorial student center 
annex in the building’s 50 year history. 

 
1/21/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :38  Texas A&M athletic director Ross Bjork leaves for a  

similar position at Ohio State. 
 
2/11/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :56  Texas A&M system board of regents approves closing  

the A&M campus in Qatar. 
 
2/18/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :51  Members of the Texas A&M faculty senate say A&M  

system officials apologize for the way new retiree 
health insurance was implemented. 

 
3/3/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :43  Texas A&M has its first permanent dean of the  

college of engineering in three years, while searches 
continues for leaders in five other schools or colleges. 

 
3/24/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :42  Texas A&M’s new athletic director is introduced. 
 

      

(5) Election and political issues impacting College Station 

 
Date and time  Program Name:  Duration: Summary of news story: 
 
1/14/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :38  Preview of meeting hosted by the Brazos County  

commission about election integrity. 
 
3/17/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :56  Summary of results from the March primary election. 
 
3/17/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  1:20  Brazos County’s election administrator reports to  

county commissioners on the state mandated partial 
ballot recount and operational issues of the March 
primary election. 

 



(6) College Station Business and Economic Development News 

 
Date and time  Program Name:  Duration: Summary of news story: 
 
1/7/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :46  Layne’s Chicken Fingers restaurant, founded in  

College Station, celebrates its 30
th

 anniversary. 
 
2/4/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  2:25  Speakers at the annual Bryan/College Station  

economic outlook conference included an update on 
home mortgage interest rates and projected home 
sales, and the reorganization of the Brazos Valley 
economic development corporation. 

 
3/24/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :37  The president of the local realtor’s association  

expects the median home price to increase from 
$302,000 to $345,000 dollars. 

. 

(7) College Station public safety issues 

 
Date and time  Program Name:  Duration: Summary of news story: 
 
1/7/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :57  Brazos County pays $500,000 dollars to settle a  

federal lawsuit filed by a former jail inmate who was 
assaulted by other inmates. 

 
2/25/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :41  The population at the Brazos County jail sets a record  

high. 
 
3/10/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  2:10  The Brazos County district attorney’s office comments  

on the College Station police department’s mistaken 
arrests of four men on burglary and assault charges, 
a story that the police department chose not to issue 
a statement or do an interview. 

 

 
(8) Unseasonable sub freezing temperatures in College Station 

 
Date and time  Program Name:  Duration: Summary of news story: 
 
1/14/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :23  Shelter established for residents needing a place  

during sub freezing temperatures and a request is  
made for volunteers and supplies. 

 
1/21/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :34  College Station firefighters rescue a pet tortoise from  

sub freezing temperatures.  
 
1/21/2024 at 7:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :37  Sub freezing temperatures have not changed the  

number of residents at the Twin City Mission 
homeless shelter. 

 
1/28/2024 at 8:30 a.m. College Station Recap  :43  College Station ISD school board members approve  

paying employees when school was cancelled due to 
sub freezing temperatures.  

 


