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1-Apr-2023 2:00 PM 2:00:00 General Conference
This program addressed religious education by sharing uplifting and 
inspiring messages from leaders of The Church of Jesus Christ of 
Latter-day Saints.

X

5-Apr-2023 6:30 PM 30:00 Random Acts #804

This program addressed community and civic engagement by   
showing the Random Acts team helping individuals through service 
projects that surprise the recipients. In this episode, Kari Craig, known 
for her dependable good mood and willingness to help anyone in 
need, especially in her work as a medical professional, is surprised 
with a trip to a local Scottish festival and more to celebrate her 
heritage. 

X

6-Apr-2023 8:00 PM 60:00 How I Got Here #102

This program addressed family and parenting by showing how young 
adults' lives are changed when they accompany their parents back to 
their countries of origin. In this episode, Michael and his dad, John, 
travel to Italy together for the first time. These two find themselves 
working together to explore the culture that has shaped each of them 
and which helps them reconnect in positive ways. 

X

8-Apr-2023 6:00 PM 1:35:00 Lamb of God: The Concert Film
This unique concert film addressed religious education as well as arts 
and culture through a performance of the sacred oratorio "Lamb of 
God".

X X

9-Apr-2023 11:00 AM 60:00 Grace Notes #211

This program addressed arts and culture as well as religious education 
by looking at how religious music has affected various artists and 
people around them. Here, artists discuss the resurrection of Jesus 
Christ and how the songs they perform focus on the renewal and 
rebirth given through the Atonement of Jesus Christ.

X X

9-Apr-2023 4:30 PM 1:35:00 The Chosen #308

This program addressed religious education by showing a depiction of 
the life and ministry of Jesus Christ and his apostles. While Jesus 
preaches to a group of thousands, the disciples realize the people are 
hungry and there is no food. Jesus miraculously feeds the people.

X

12-Apr-2023 7:00 PM 60:00 The Fixers #109

This program addressed community and civic engagement and 
diversity and inclusion by showing the Fixers helping One Heart 
Bulgaria, an organization that takes care of orphans. They build a 
horse arena and sensory obstacle course to give the orphans a new 
type of therapy. 

X X

16-Apr-2023 1:30 PM 30:00 Artful #110

This program addressed arts and culture and religious education by 
looking at how belief in God affects the work of artists. In this episode, 
Justin Taylor discusses how his faith shapes the way he approaches 
art and life.  Christian Bolt, a sculptor, strongly believes in inspiration 
from God.  He feels the One who can finish the human image is our 
Heavenly Father.  

X X
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23-Apr-2023 12:00 PM 60:00 Family Rules #103

This program addressed family and parenting by sharing ideas from 
parents and others on raising children. In this episode, the Anderson-
Kossens discuss how they strengthen their family through healthy 
living and daily fitness. The Burns family talk about how they work 
together as a team.

X

26-Apr-2023 12:30 PM 30:00 Making Good #510

The program addressed community and civic engagment by following 
those serving in their community. In this episode, Kirby goes to 
Overton, Nevada, to help Windy's Ranch & Rescue save abandoned 
and mistreated pot-bellied pigs. Kirby learns how the pets are able to 
make the lives of the people who care for them better. 

X

27-Apr-2023 7:00 PM 60:00 Relative Race #1105

This program addressed family and parenting by focusing on 
individuals who find lost family members. In this episode, Carolen 
meets a sister, and Nolin learns the truth about the circumstances 
surrounding his adoption. 

X

4-May-2023 6:00 PM 30:00 Gym Stars #417

This program addressed diversity and inclusion by sharing the stories 
of young gymnasts with various backgrounds. In this episode, Poppy is 
feeling the pressure of competing with the team for the first time. Back 
at the gym, Alida makes the life-changing decision to move from 
competing to coaching and must break the news to her coach. 

X

7-May-2023 2:30 PM 60:00 Come Follow Up #202320

This program addressed religious education by taking a deeper dive 
into the New Testament study resource Come, Follow Me . In this 
episode, Ben Lomu, Melissa Inouye, and Jason Whiting discuss 
Matthew 19-20, Mark 10, and Luke 18 and the subject, "What lack I 
yet?"

X

10-May-2023 9:00 PM 30:00 The Kindness Diaries #201

This program addressed community and civic engagement by 
following Leon Logothetis who travels the world with only a vintage 
motorbike and the kindness of strangers. Leon pays back in 
unexpected, inspiring ways. In this episode, Leon starts a new journey 
from Alaska to Argentina. He meets a man who invites various kinds 
of people struggling with issues into his life and loves them.

X

12-May-2023 9:30 PM 30:00 Random Acts #808

This program addressed community and civic engagement by   
showing the Random Acts team helping individuals through service 
projects that surprise the recipients. Savannah has organized an 
annual lemonade stand that has grown to raise thousands of dollars 
for the American Cancer Society. The hosts surprise her with the 
country music trip of her dreams. 

X

17-May-2023 7:00 PM 60:00 The Fixers #204

This program addressed community and civic engagement by showing 
the Fixers helping rebuild a basketball court in the small coastal town 
of Arecibo, Puerto Rico, that has fallen into disrepair. The Fixers 
rehabilitate the court and create murals that will draw in crowds and 
add beauty to the area. 

X
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21-May-2023 5:00 PM 30:00 Wizard of Paws #506

This program addressed diversity and inclusion by focusing on Derrick 
Campana building prosthetics and braces to help animals with 
disabilities achieve greater mobility.  In this episode, Derrick travels to 
Austin, Texas, to build a lift for Champion, a quadriplegic cow who was 
born with a twisted spine. Champion lives at Safe in Austin where kids 
with "superpowers" can cuddle and heal alongside a variety of "super 
powered" special needs animals. 

X

21-May-2023 6:00 PM 60:00 Worldwide Devotional for Young Adults 
#202302

This program addressed religious education and youth education by 
featuring inspirational messages from President Dallin H. and Sister 
Kristen Oaks. 

X X

23-May-2023 8:20 PM 45:00 Ruby and the Well #102

This program addressed community and civic engagement by 
featuring a teenager who is aware of the wishes of townspeople and 
works to help them meet their desires. In this episode, Ruby and her 
friends Sam and Mina fulfill the wish of the town librarian. 

X

25-May-2023 8:00 PM 60:00 How I Got Here #108

This program addressed family and parenting by showing how young 
adults' lives are changed when they accompany their parents back to 
their countries of origin. In this episode, Carolina travels to Chile with 
her mom, Ines, to learn more about her heritage. Ines introduces 
Carolina to the strong women in her family.

X

28-May-2023 4:00 PM 60:00 The Chosen #107
This program addressed religious education by showing a depiction of 
the life and ministry of Jesus Christ and his apostles. Nicodemus 
meets with Jesus by night. 

X

4-Jun-2023 1:00 PM 30:00 Grace Notes #302

This program addressed arts and culture and religious education by 
looking at how religious music has affected various artists and people 
around them. In this episode, Ben Rector talks about his desire to let 
worry and anxiety go and follow the Lord.  Michelle Williams discusses 
her reliance on Christ to sustain her through her trials.

X X

6-Jun-2023 7:30 PM 30:00 A Kind of Spark #109

This program addressed diversity and inclusion as well as family and 
parenting and youth education by showing autistic teen Addie, with the 
support of her sisters, learning to deal with various life circumstances 
and find her voice. In this episode, Addie and her sister Keedie are 
both at low points following their confrontations with Miss Murphy and 
turn to each other for healing. 

X X X

7-Jun-2023 6:00 PM 30:00 Making Good #505

This program addressed community and civic engagement and 
diversity and inclusion by following those serving and interacting with 
various people in their community. In this episode, Kirby goes to San 
Diego to work with Life Rolls On, an organization dedicated to 
improving the quality of life for people living with various disabilities 
through adaptive surfing and skating. 

X X
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10-Jun-2023 5:00 AM 30:00 Street Vet #110

This program addressed diversity and inclusion by showing Dr. Kwane 
helping people who have fallen on hard times by giving medical 
assistance to their pets. In this episode, Dr. Kwane examines an older 
dog whose teeth are infected, but its owner disappears before he can 
perform the surgery. At Venice Beach, Kwane and Genesis meet an 
albino python and a kind-hearted couple.

X

14-Jun-2023 9:30 PM 30:00 The Kindness Diaries #212

This program addressed community and civic engagement by 
following Leon Logothetis, who travels the world with only a vintage 
motorbike and the kindness of strangers.  Leon pays back in 
unexpected, inspiring ways. After arriving in Argentina, Leon stays with 
a homeless family. He also meets a Haitian student with a selfless 
heart. 

X

17-Jun-2023 2:00 PM 30:00 Gym Stars #404

This program addressed diversity and inclusion and youth education 
by sharing the stories of gymnasts from various backgrounds. In this 
episode, Din has to overcome injury ahead of an international 
competition. Tumbling duo Shakiem and Seb part ways as Seb leaves 
the gym for the football pitch.

X X

18-Jun-2023 12:00 PM 60:00 Family Rules #201

This program addressed family and parenting by sharing ideas from 
parents and others on raising children. In this episode, the Meredith 
family shares how their family prepares for an emergency.  Dr. Matt 
Townsend talks about how to help children develop emotional 
resilience.  The Cutler family embraces the chaos of lively kids and 
finds ways to facilitate using their energy together.  Parenting expert 
Ralphie Jacobs talks about how to focus on the positive in parenting.

X

24-Jun-2023 4:30 PM 30:00 Wizard of Paws #104

This program addressed diversity and inclusion by helping animals 
with disabilities achieve greater mobility. Derrick Campana improves 
and saves lives through the prosthetics and braces he custom builds 
for animals. In this episode, Derrick makes a special prosthetic for 
Ferdie, a goat who had his back leg amputated after a bad accident. 

X

25-Jun-2023 3:30 PM 30:00 Music & the Spoken Word
This program addressed arts and culture as well as religious education 
by featuring inspirational music performed by the Tabernacle Choir at 
Temple Square as well as uplifting messages.

X X

27-Jun-2023 7:57 PM 30:00 Amelia Parker #106

This program addressed family and parenting by showing families 
working on their relationships with each other. In this episode, Cleo 
tries to adjust to her little Charlie not being a baby anymore. 
The program also addressed youth education by showing a teen 
learning to deal with various life circumstances. Amelia must stand up 
for herself when she's pressured to join the soccer team. 

X X
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