
WBIX 1260 am, Boston 

Second Quarter – April 2023 

Issues/Programs Report 

  
The station identified the points as a result, faced by our community this quarter. 

 

A- Traffic update on the main streets and avenues of the state, providing services 

to the community on what are the best options for the driver to reach his 

destination. 

B- Weather and temperature with the daily weather forecast for the current day 

and the following day, bringing rain and snowstorm possibilities to the community 

and the expected heat and medium seasons. 

C- Information about stock exchanges and the financial market in general, with 

the quotations of currencies and commodities for those who have “business” 

inside and outside the country.  

D- Updates on immigration issues for the community 

E- Information on national and foreign policy, updating all points about the 

pandemic and COVID-19 numbers for the community.  

F- Interviews and cultural tips on everyday family themes and social and 

entertainment events for the community  

G- Sports information from Brazilian clubs and the world 

H- Faith and Bible study 
 
I – Immigration information with lawyers  
  



 The station has a broadcast schedule dealing with each of the issues mentioned 

above. The schedule that addresses each issue is shown below: 

A, B, C, F, G, and H - Happy Day from 6:00 am to 7:00 am starting April 3rd to 7th 
- 10th to 14th – 17th to 21st – 24th to 28th. 
  
This program goes on air during the period above with 1 hour of duration, hosted 
by Pastor Aguinaldo Prudente with live interaction of Pastor Messias 
Nascimento, and listeners. 
 

A, B, C, D, E, and F - Bom Dia Nossa Rádio from 7:00 am to 10:00 am starting 
April 3rd to 7th - 10th to 14th – 17th to 21st – 24th to 28th. 
 

  
This program goes on air for a period of 3 hours of duration. Hosted by Pastor 
Glauber Morare, and co-hosts Lombardi Junior, Marcio Foffu, and the political 
scientist Priscila Souza, bringing information from all the details of the items 
mentioned above. 
  
 A, B, and F – Nossa Manhã from 10:00 am to 12:00 pm starting April 3rd to 7th - 
10th to 14th – 17th to 21st – 24th to 28th. 
  
This program is hosted by Leonardo Cruz with the information mentioned above, 
with interviews and guests from the community.  
  
D and F - Direto da Redação from 12:00 pm to 2:00 pm starting April 3rd to 7th - 
10th to 14th – 17th to 21st – 24th to 28th. 
 
This program is hosted by Marcio Foffu, with information about immigration, 
politics, pandemics, and general topics. 
 

B, C, D, E, and F - A Tarde é Nossa from 2:00 PM to 4:00 PM starting April 3rd 
to 7th - 10th to 14th – 17th to 21st – 24th to 28th. 
 
 

  
This program is hosted by Arnaldo Ribeiro and brings all the topics mentioned 
above, with interviews and coverage from community events, also interviews 
from doctors and politicians from the community. 
  
G - Nosso Esporte from 4:00 pm to 6:00 pm starting April 3rd to 7th - 10th to 14th 
– 17th to 21st – 24th to 28th. 



Hosted by Lombardi Junior, with reports from Leonardo Cruz, this program brings 
sports news from all the sports, with coverage of sporting events. 
 
H - Conexão Nossa Radio - from 6:00 pm to 7:00 pm starting April 3rd to 7th - 
10th to 14th – 17th to 21st – 24th to 28th. 
 
This program goes on air during the period above with 1 hour of duration, hosted 
by Pastor Messias Nascimento with live interaction of Pastor Aguinaldo Prudente 
and listeners. This program brings general news and faith messages. 
 
 
D and F - Balanço Nossa Radio from 7:00 pm to 8:00 pm starting April 3rd to 7th 
- 10th to 14th – 17th to 21st – 24th to 28th. 
 
This program is hosted by Arthur Braga, with information about immigration, 
politics, pandemics, and general topics. 
 

 
E, F, G, H, and I – Programação Noturna Semanal - from 08:00 pm to 12:00 
am starting April 3rd to 7th - 10th to 14th – 17th to 21st – 24th to 28th. 
  
Variety of programs that each day brings topics such as politics, sports, 
interviews with people from the community, and faith messages. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 



WBIX 1260 am, Boston 

Second Quarter – April 2023 

Issues/Programs Report 

  
The station identified the points as a result, faced by our community this quarter. 

 

A- Traffic update on the main streets and avenues of the state, providing services 

to the community on what are the best options for the driver to reach his 

destination. 

B- Weather and temperature with the daily weather forecast for the current day 

and the following day, bringing rain and snowstorm possibilities to the community 

and the expected heat and medium seasons. 

C- Information about stock exchanges and the financial market in general, with 

the quotations of currencies and commodities for those who have “business” 

inside and outside the country.  

D- Updates on immigration issues for the community 

E- Information on national and foreign policy, updating all points about the 

pandemic and COVID-19 numbers for the community.  

F- Interviews and cultural tips on everyday family themes and social and 

entertainment events for the community  

G- Sports information from Brazilian clubs and the world 

H- Faith and Bible study 
 
I – Immigration information with lawyers  
 
 



The station has a broadcast schedule dealing with each of the issues mentioned 

above. The schedule that addresses each issue is shown below: 

A, B, C, F, G, and H - Happy Day from 6:00 am to 7:00 am starting May 1st to 5th 
- 8th to 12th – 15th to 19th - 22nd to 26th - 29th - 31st. 
  
This program goes on air during the period above with 1 hour of duration, hosted 
by Pastor Aguinaldo Prudente with live interaction of Pastor Messias 
Nascimento, and listeners. 
 

A, B, C, D, E, and F - Bom Dia Nossa Rádio from 7:00 am to 10:00 am starting 
May 1st to 5th - 8th to 12th – 15th to 19th - 22nd to 26th - 29th - 31st. 
  
This program goes on air for a period of 3 hours of duration. Hosted by Pastor 
Glauber Morare, and co-hosts Lombardi Junior, Marcio Foffu, and the political 
scientist Priscila Souza, bringing information from all the details of the items 
mentioned above. 
  
 A, B, and F – Nossa Manhã from 10:00 am to 12:00 pm starting May 1st to 5th - 
8th to 12th – 15th to 19th - 22nd to 26th - 29th - 31st. 
  
This program is hosted by Leonardo Cruz with the information mentioned above, 
with interviews and guests from the community.  
  
D and F - Direto da Redação from 12:00 pm to 2:00 pm starting May 1st to 5th - 
8th to 12th – 15th to 19th - 22nd to 26th - 29th - 31st. 
 
This program is hosted by Marcio Foffu, with information about immigration, 
politics, pandemics, and general topics. 
 

B, C, D, E, and F - A Tarde é Nossa from 2:00 PM to 4:00 PM starting May 1st to 
5th - 8th to 12th – 15th to 19th - 22nd to 26th - 29th - 31st. 
 

  
This program is hosted by Arnaldo Ribeiro and brings all the topics mentioned 
above, with interviews and coverage from community events, also interviews 
from doctors and politicians from the community. 
  
G - Nosso Esporte from 4:00 pm to 6:00 pm starting May 1st to 5th - 8th to 12th – 
15th to 19th - 22nd to 26th - 29th - 31st. 
 

Hosted by Lombardi Junior, with reports from Leonardo Cruz, this program brings 
sports news from all the sports, with coverage of sporting events. 



 
H - Conexão Nossa Radio - from 6:00 pm to 7:00 pm starting May 1st to 5th - 8th 
to 12th – 15th to 19th - 22nd to 26th - 29th - 31st. 
 
This program goes on air during the period above with 1 hour of duration, hosted 
by Pastor Messias Nascimento with live interaction of Pastor Aguinaldo Prudente 
and listeners. This program brings general news and faith messages. 
 
 
D and F - Balanço Nossa Radio from 7:00 pm to 8:00 pm starting May 1st to 5th 
- 8th to 12th – 15th to 19th - 22nd to 26th - 29th - 31st. 
 
This program is hosted by Arthur Braga, with information about immigration, 
politics, pandemics, and general topics. 
 

 
E, F, G, H, and I – Programação Noturna Semanal - from 08:00 pm to 12:00 
am starting May 1st to 5th - 8th to 12th – 15th to 19th - 22nd to 26th - 29th - 31st. 
  
Variety of programs that each day brings topics such as politics, sports, 
interviews with people from the community, and faith messages. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

 



WBIX 1260 am, Boston 

Second Quarter – April 2023 

Issues/Programs Report 

  
The station identified the points as a result, faced by our community this quarter. 

 

A- Traffic update on the main streets and avenues of the state, providing services 

to the community on what are the best options for the driver to reach his 

destination. 

B- Weather and temperature with the daily weather forecast for the current day 

and the following day, bringing rain and snowstorm possibilities to the community 

and the expected heat and medium seasons. 

C- Information about stock exchanges and the financial market in general, with 

the quotations of currencies and commodities for those who have “business” 

inside and outside the country.  

D- Updates on immigration issues for the community 

E- Information on national and foreign policy, updating all points about the 

pandemic and COVID-19 numbers for the community.  

F- Interviews and cultural tips on everyday family themes and social and 

entertainment events for the community  

G- Sports information from Brazilian clubs and the world 

H- Faith and Bible study 
 
I – Immigration information with lawyers  
 
 



The station has a broadcast schedule dealing with each of the issues mentioned 

above. The schedule that addresses each issue is shown below: 

A, B, C, F, G, and H - Happy Day from 6:00 am to 7:00 am starting June 1st to 
2nd - 5th to 9th – 12th to 16th - 19th to 23rd - 26th - 30th. 
  
This program goes on air during the period above with 1 hour of duration, hosted 
by Pastor Aguinaldo Prudente with live interaction of Pastor Messias 
Nascimento, and listeners. 
 

A, B, C, D, E, and F - Bom Dia Nossa Rádio from 7:00 am to 10:00 am starting 
June 1st to 2nd - 5th to 9th – 12th to 16th - 19th to 23rd - 26th - 30th. 
  
This program goes on air for a period of 3 hours of duration. Hosted by Pastor 
Glauber Morare, and co-hosts Lombardi Junior, Marcio Foffu, and the political 
scientist Priscila Souza, bringing information from all the details of the items 
mentioned above. 
  
 A, B, and F – Nossa Manhã from 10:00 am to 12:00 pm starting June 1st to 2nd - 
5th to 9th – 12th to 16th - 19th to 23rd - 26th - 30th. 
  
This program is hosted by Leonardo Cruz with the information mentioned above, 
with interviews and guests from the community.  
  
D and F - Direto da Redação from 12:00 pm to 2:00 pm starting June 1st to 2nd - 
5th to 9th – 12th to 16th - 19th to 23rd - 26th - 30th. 
 
This program is hosted by Marcio Foffu, with information about immigration, 
politics, pandemics, and general topics. 
 

B, C, D, E, and F - A Tarde é Nossa from 2:00 PM to 4:00 PM starting June 1st 
to 2nd - 5th to 9th – 12th to 16th - 19th to 23rd - 26th - 30th. 
 

  
This program is hosted by Arnaldo Ribeiro and brings all the topics mentioned 
above, with interviews and coverage from community events, also interviews 
from doctors and politicians from the community. 
  
G - Nosso Esporte from 4:00 pm to 6:00 pm starting June 1st to 2nd - 5th to 9th – 
12th to 16th - 19th to 23rd - 26th - 30th. 
 

Hosted by Lombardi Junior, with reports from Leonardo Cruz, this program brings 
sports news from all the sports, with coverage of sporting events. 



 
H - Conexão Nossa Radio - from 6:00 pm to 7:00 pm starting June 1st to 2nd - 5th 
to 9th – 12th to 16th - 19th to 23rd - 26th - 30th. 
 
This program goes on air during the period above with 1 hour of duration, hosted 
by Pastor Messias Nascimento with live interaction of Pastor Aguinaldo Prudente 
and listeners. This program brings general news and faith messages. 
 
 
D and F - Balanço Nossa Radio from 7:00 pm to 8:00 pm starting June 1st to 2nd 
- 5th to 9th – 12th to 16th - 19th to 23rd - 26th - 30th. 
 
This program is hosted by Arthur Braga, with information about immigration, 
politics, pandemics, and general topics. 
 

 
E, F, G, H, and I – Programação Noturna Semanal - from 08:00 pm to 12:00 
am starting June 1st to 2nd - 5th to 9th – 12th to 16th - 19th to 23rd - 26th - 30th. 
  
Variety of programs that each day brings topics such as politics, sports, 
interviews with people from the community, and faith messages. 
 
 
 
  

 


