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1. The Legislative Gazette 4/4/23 4:30pm 30 min. 
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today: We speak with Blair Horner 
of NYPIRG about what the late budget means for 
New Yorkers.  We also discuss differing opinions 
over whether to change New York’s bail reform 
laws.   Issues: Politics, Bail reform

2. Lynn’s Warriors  4/5/23  3:00pm 60 min.  Weekly 
program.  Lynn Shaw discusses human trafficking  
and how prevalent it is in our country.  Today’s 
guest: Genevieve Meyer, a child bride survivor and 
founder of The Resiliency Foundation, discusses her 
experiences and her efforts to abolish child brides 
… which is still very prevalent.  Issues: Human 
Trafficking, Child brides

3.  This ‘N’ That.  4/6/23  9:00am 60 min.  Weekly 
program.  Local attorney and community activist 
Denise Ward takes calls and talks about local New 
Rochelle issues as well as national and state issues.  
Today’s topic: We discuss Governor Hochul’s New 
York Housing Compact proposal that would require 
800,000 new homes be built throughout the state in 
the next decade.  Issue: Housing

4. The Media Project. 4/9/23 10:00am 30 min. Weekly 
program focusing on issues concerning the media in 
the past week. Today:  We talk about media 
coverage of Donald Trump’s arraignment in 
Manhattan, cameras in court and the Dominion 



Systems lawsuit against Fox.  Issues: The Media, 
The Court system

5. In The City 4/11/23 9:00am 60 min. Airs once per 
month. Hosted by newly-hired New Rochelle City 
Manager Kathleen Gill and new Deputy City Manager 
Adam Selgado … discussing the latest news in and 
around the City Of New Rochelle.  Today:  We 
discuss plans to bring more retail and park space in 
the downtown New Rochelle area.  We also update 
the listeners on the ongoing road construction 
throughout the city in conjunction to all the 
downtown development.  And we update listeners 
on the Echo Bay Development Project  Issues: 
Development, Infrastructure improvements

6. Westchester Consumer Report w/Jim Maisano. 
4/11/23 11:00am 60 min.  Weekly program.  Jim 
Maisano, Westchester County Director of Consumer 
Protection, hosts this weekly program covering 
issues local consumers need to be aware of.  
Today’s topic: We discuss how much traditional TV 
content, especially sports, is moving to streaming 
platforms … and the prospect of a consumer 
subscribing so many different streaming platforms 
could prove more costly in the long run. Issues:  
Consumer issues, Media, Technology

7. Westchester Rising 4/13/23 10:00am 60 min. 
Weekly program.  Hosted by Rising Media Columnist 
Eric Schoen focusing on Westchester issues.  
Today’s topics: We discuss the parking problems in 
the city of Yonkers, especially Ridge Hill Shopping 



Center.  We also discuss the parking issues 
countywide in Westchester and the pushback from 
residents on the new parking apps.  Issues: Parking

8. The Greenburgh Report 4/14/23 10:00am 60 min. 
Weekly program. Greenburgh Town Supervisor Paul 
Feiner discusses the issues surrounding the Town of 
Greenburgh.  Today’s guest:  Jordan Cormiere, 
Director of The Youth Shelter Program of 
Westchester discusses the organization and how it 
provides an alternative to incarceration for eligible 
young adults who have had run-ins with the law.  
Issue: Youth incarceration

9. The Legislative Gazette. 4/14/23 4:30pm 30 min.  
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today:  Today we discuss 
Governor Hochul saying the state will create a 
stockpile of an abortion drug after a Texas judge’s 
recent ruling that outlaws a similar pill.  We speak 
with New York State Assemblywoman Amy Paulin, 
Chair of the Assembly Health Committee, about her 
plans to expand abortion access in the state.  And 
we talk about the recent wave of swatting incidents 
at schools. Issues: Abortion, Schools

10. The Media Project 4/16/23 10:00am  30 min.  
Weekly program focusing issues facing the media in 
the past week.  Today we discuss the ongoing 
lawsuit between Dominion Voting Systems and Fox 
News … as well as the case of the Wall Street 
Journal reporter detained by Russian authorities.  
Issues:  The Media



11. This Week with Janine Rose 4/17/23 1:00pm 60 
min. Weekly program focusing on the latest 
headlines in the news.  Today’s topic:  We discuss 
the recent mass shootings in the country and the 
need for gun control.  Issues: Gun Control

12. The HomeTown Hour 4/20/23 11:00am 60 min. 
Weekly program. HomeTown Media publisher 
Howard Sturman discusses issues around the Sound 
Shore area of Westchester as well as state and 
national issues.  Todays’ topics:  We discuss how 
New York State has not yet passed their annual 
budget.  We also discuss how a national guard 
airman was able to get access to classified national 
security documents and post them on the internet. 
Issues: Politics, National security

13. Your Community In Action 4/21/23 1:00pm 60 
min. Weekly program. Host Arlene Salman 
interviews non-profit organizations.  Today’s guest: 
Julie Roccowitz, Head of the Senior Program and 
Youth Daycamp at Beth El Synagogue discusses the 
different senior services and activities they provide 
… as well as the summer program they provide for 
the local youth.  Issues:  Senior issues, Youth 
activities

14. The Legislative Gazette 4/21/23 4:30pm, 30 min.  
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today we take a look at what’s 
holding up the New York state budget now nearly 
three weeks late.  We talk with State Comptroller 
Tom DiNapoli about whether he has any input when 



it comes to budget negotiations.  And we discuss 
how public schools in New York will no longer be 
able to use Native American names, mascots and 
imagery.  Issues: Politics, Schools

15. Time To Talk 4/24/23 9:00am 30 min. Weekly 
program.  Host Jen Graziano discusses dealing with 
the death of a loved one and planning for one’s 
affairs and estate.  Today’s guest: Ryan Heard, 
Founder Of Care Giver Smart Solutions discusses 
helping you monitor your loved ones as they age in 
place. Issues: Aging In Place

16. Westchester: Yesterday, Today & Tomorrow  
4/24/23  11:30am 60 min. Bi-weekly program 
featuring many of the local Westchester 
organizations making a difference in the 
community.  Today’s topic: Historian Linda Tarant-
Reid discusses the upcoming Juneteenth celebration 
in New Rochelle as well as giving the history and 
significance of the day.  Issue: Black History

17. The Legislative Gazette 4/25/23 4:30pm 30 min. 
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State. Today:  We discuss Governor 
Hochul saying she and legislative leaders have a 
conceptual agreement on the budget.  And we have 
a conversation with the head of the state 
Democratic party about President Biden announcing 
this week that he’ll run for re-election.  Issues: 
Politics



18. The Media Project 4/26/23 10:00am 30 min. 
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 
media.  Today we discuss the problems finding 
reporters to work in journalism. Issue: The Media

19. Don’t Worry Murray 4/26/23 2:00pm 60 min. 
Weekly program.  Famed criminal attorney 
discusses crime all the time.  Today’s topic: Length 
of incarceration. We discuss the new bail laws and if 
we are sentencing individuals to extremely long jail 
sentences.  Issues:  Bail reform

20. Building Knowledge 4/28/23 11:00am 60 min. 
Weekly program.  Host Jeff Hanley from the 
Building Institute discusses the many different 
development projects and new business initiatives 
taking place in Westchester.  Today’s topic: We look 
at 1st quarter real estate sales in the region and 
forecast what could be ahead in those sectors .  
Issue: Real estate

21. The Legislative Gazette 5/4/23 4:30pm 30 min.  
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today we discuss state lawmakers 
passing a $229 billion dollar state budget over a 
month late.  We speak with John Kaehny of 
Reinvent Albany about how transparent the budget 
process was.  And we take a closer look at funding 
for higher education in this year’s budget. Issues: 
Politics, Education



22.  The Media Project  5/7/23 10:00am 30 min. 
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 
media.  Today we talk about journalists’ concerns 
about press freedoms. Issue:  The Media

23.   The Legislative Gazette  5/10/23  4:30pm 30 
min.  Weekly programming re-capping the past 
week’s news in New York State.  Today we talk with 
Ed Cox, the Chair of the State Republican party 
about bail reform changes in the budget.  And we 
discuss a new study that finds the Empire State 
second in the nation when it comes to electric 
vehicle readiness. Issue: Bail reform, Electric cars

24. All Around The Town 5/11/23 12:00pm 60 min. 
Bi-weekly program.  Hosted by Ron Tocci, Director 
Of The Westchester Office Of Veterans’ Services.  He 
discusses issues concerning the Veterans as well as 
local issues.  Today’s topic:  We discuss the 
upcoming deadline of Title 42 and the possibility of 
migrants being transported to New York State’s 
suburban communities. Issues: Migrant Crisis

25. The Legislative Gazette 5/18/23 4:30pm 30 min. 
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today:  We discuss County leaders 
across the state sounding the alarm over what they 
call a growing migrant crisis.  Issue: Migrant crisis

26. The Media Project 5/21/23 10:00am 30 min. 
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 
media.  Today we talk the fallout from the town hall 



with Donald Trump.  And we discuss the perils of 
the “impartial middle” in journalism..  Issue: The 
Media

27. The Legislative Gazette 5/26/23 4:30pm 30 min.  
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today we discuss Governor Kathy 
Hochul being caught in the middle as the migrant 
crisis intensifies.  And we talk about Senate 
Majority Leader Chuck Schumer stopping in Albany 
to call for an adjustment in the Medicare Wage 
index.  And we talk about the EPA providing an 
update on the cleanup of toxic PCBs from the 
Hudson River. Issue: Migrant crisis, Medicare, 
Environment

28. The Media Project  5/28/23  10:00am  30 min.  
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 
media.  Today we talk how bogus stories can make 
their way into the press.  And we talk about the 
correct way to write the obituary of a public official.  
Issues:  The Media

29. Rise Up 5/30/23 3:00pm 60 min. Weekly 
program.  Jim Killoran, Executive Director for the 
Fuller Center NY hosts this weekly program and 
discusses the organization’s latest building and 
relief efforts.  Today’s topic:  Jim discusses the 
upcoming 70th anniversary of the end of The Korean 
War that will be recognized from this point forward 
every year in New York State on July 28th … and the 
effort to make it recognized nationally.  Also … Jim 
talks about the effort he and his organization, The 



Fuller Center, are doing to provide housing to all 
Veterans.    Issue: Volunteerism, Veterans’ issues

30.  Divorce Dialogues 5/31/23 5:00pm 30 min.  Bi-
weekly program. Collaborative divorce attorney 
Katherine Miller discusses the topic of marriage and 
divorce.  Today’s topic: “Nesting” … a co-parenting 
arrangement where the children of a divorced 
couple stay in the house and the parents move in 
and out on a rotating basis. Issue: Divorce, Co-
Parenting

31. The Power Hour- Black Westchester On The Air 
6/5/23 11:00am 60 min.  Black Westchester 
Magazine publisher Damon Jones and Editor-in-
Chief A.J. Woodson co-host this program geared to 
the Black community.  Today’s topic:  We discuss 
how the Black man and Black woman need to start 
learning how to work together as one. Issues: 
Issues That Affect The Black Community

32. The New Rochelle Public Library On The Air 
6/6/23 12:00pm 60 min.  Monthly program.  Haina 
Just-Michael & Executive Director Of the New 
Rochelle Public Library Tom Geoffino host this 
monthly program discussing the many resources 
and activities going on at the New Rochelle Public 
Library.  Today’s topics:  We discuss the New 
Rochelle Public Library summer reading program.  
We also talk about the community outreach the 
Library has with many of the local community 
organizations.  And we discuss the tutoring program 
the Library provides. Issue: Community, Education



33. The Legislative Gazette 6/7/23 4:30pm 30 min.  
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today we discuss supporters of a 
bill that would legally give terminally ill people the 
option to end their lives making a last-minute pitch 
to lawmakers.  We also speak with Sarah Rogerson, 
Albany Law Professor and Director of the 
Immigration Law Clinic on migrants being sent 
upstate from New York City. Issues: Aid in Dying, 
Migrant crisis

34. The Attorney General’s Report 6/9/23  1:00pm 
60 min.  Monthly program.   Andy Aujla from the 
Westchester Office Of The New York State Attorney 
General’s Office hosts this monthly show reporting 
the latest news from the Attorney General’s Office 
and providing useful consumer protection 
information.  Today’s topics:  We discuss scam calls. 
We also talk about the Attorney General’s Health 
Helpline, which takes complaints against healthcare 
insurance companies.  We also discuss being aware 
of dating website scams, price gouging and vacation 
rental scams. Issues: Consumer Protection, 
Healthcare

35. The Legislative Gazette 6/9/23 4:30pm 30 min.  
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today we mark the end of the 
legislative session, and find out what made it 
through the final negotiations.  Issue: Politics

36. The Media Project  6/11/23  10:00am  30 min.  
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 



media.  Today we talk about how high school sports 
coverage can save democracy.  Issues:  The Media, 
Politics, Sports

37. The Legislative Gazette 6/16/23  4:30pm.  30 
min.  Weekly program re-capping the past week’s 
news in New York State.  We take a look at how the 
issues of housing and criminal justice fared this 
legislation session.  We speak with the Republican 
minority leader of the state assembly about his take 
on the session so far, and what comes next.  And 
we discuss New York’s Independent System 
operator saying rapid electrification is causing a 
surge in power demand.  Issues: Housing, Criminal 
justice, Electric power demand

38. The Media Project 6/18/23 10:00am 30 min.  
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 
media.  Today we talk about coverage of the 
indictment of former President Donald Trump.  Also 
we discuss how to cover a UFO whistleblower.  
Issue:  The Media

39. The Legislative Gazette 6/23/23  4:30pm.  30 
min.  Weekly program re-capping the past week’s 
news in New York State.  We discuss a new financial 
forecast released by the governor’s budget office 
showing future deficits doubling next year.  We also 
talk about the Olympic Regional Development 
Authority responding to a recent report raising 
questions about investments in its facilities. Issue:  
Economy



40. The Media Project 6/25/23  10:00am 30 min.  
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 
media.  Today we talk about ProPublica’s 
investigation into Supreme Court Justice Samuel 
Alito and the Wall Street Journal’s decision to 
publish an op-ed from Alito.  We also discuss 
artificial intelligence and the Oceangate 
submersible. Issues: The Media, Artificial 
Intelligence

41. The Legislative Gazette  6/30/23  4:30pm.  30 
min.  Weekly program re-capping the past week’s 
news in New York State.  We speak with New York 
Lieutenant Governor Antonio Delgado about the 
Hate and Bias Prevention Unit that he is leading.  
Also, we sit down with the Special Agent in Charge 
of the Internal Revenue Service’s Criminal 
Investigation New York Field Office.  Issues: Hate 
and Bias, IRS Crimes 


