
             WVOX 4TH            QUARTERLY ISSUES REPORT

                October 1, 2019  -  December 31, 2019

1. The Legislative Gazette 10/4/19 4:30pm 30 min. 
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today: We discuss the state’s new 
proposed limits for PFOA and other chemicals in 
drinking water.  Also we discuss the state 
comptroller’s revelation that 25 of the state’s local 
governments are in some form of fiscal stress.  
Issues: Government, Environment

2.  This ‘N’ That.  10/7/19  9:00am 60 min.  Weekly 
program.  Local attorney and community activist 
Denise Ward takes calls and talks about local New 
Rochelle issues as well as state issues.  Today’s 
topic:  The suspension of The New Rochelle Football 
coach.  Concerned listeners respond.  Issues: 
Education, Community

3. The Media Project. 10/7/19 10:00am 30 min. 
Weekly program focusing on issues concerning the 
media in the past week. Today:  We talk about the 
fully operational right wing media machine and how 
it’s working in the Impeachment Inquiry. Issues: 
Media, Politics

4. The Larchmont/Mamaroneck Report 10/8/19 
9:00am 60 min. Airs 3 times per month. Hosted by 
former Mamaroneck Town Supervisor Valerie Moore 
O’Keeffe and former Larchmont Mayor Ken Bialo.  
Discussion on the closing of many retail brick and 
mortar stores in Westchester. Issues:  Business, 
Economy



5. Westchester Consumer Report w/Jim Maisano. 
10/8/19 11:00am 60 min.  Weekly program.  Jim 
Maisano, Westchester County Director of Consumer 
protection, hosts this weekly program covering 
issues local consumers need to be aware of.  Today’s 
topic:  The latest legislation that will hopefully 
combat robocalls.  Also … only 5 months away and 
many retailers and businesses are not prepared for 
the plastic bag ban in New York State.  Also … the 
county’s continuing crackdown on unlicensed 
contractors and landscapers. Issues:  Consumer 
issues

6. Westchester Rising 10/10/19 10:00am 60 min. 
Weekly program.  Hosted by Rising Media 
Newspaper Editor-in-Chief Dan Murphy focusing on 
Westchester issues.  Today we discuss local political 
races for this election cycle. Issues: Politics

7. The Greenburgh Report 10/11/19 10:00am 60 min. 
Weekly program. Greenburgh Town Supervisor Paul 
Feiner discusses the issues surrounding the Town of 
Greenburgh.  Today, we discuss the latest hate 
crimes that have risen throughout the Greenburgh 
area and Westchester County in general.  Issues: 
Community, Crime, Anti-Semitism

8. The Legislative Gazette. 10/11/19 4:30pm 30 min.  
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today:  We discuss an action plan 
adopted this week by a state commission that 
oversees the 2020 census and why it has immigrant 



rights groups up in arms.  Also … we discuss Federal 
lawmakers’ announcement of a new package of bills 
to improve limo safety.  Issue:  Immigration

9.  Conversations with Claudia McDonnell 10/14/19 
11:00am 60 min. Monthly program.  Catholic New 
York columnist Claudia McDonnell hosts.  Topic 
today:  The latest revelations of sexual abuse in the 
Church is discussed.  Issues: Religion, Crime

10. In The City 10/15/19 9:00am 60 min. Monthly 
program.  New Rochelle City Manager Chuck Strome 
discusses the latest developments and issues 
concerning the City Of New Rochelle and takes 
listener phone calls.  Today’s topic: The proposed 
2020 budget for New Rochelle is discussed.  Also … 
an update on the last New Rochelle City Council 
meeting. And the problem with deteriorating roads 
in the Sound Shore community is discussed.  Issues: 
Community, Public Works

11. The Legislative Gazette 10/18/19 4:30pm 30 
min. Weekly program re-capping the past week’s 
news in New York State.  Today: We discuss a new 
poll that finds the majority of New Yorkers approve 
of the impeachment inquiry into President Trump.  
Also we talk about the Trump Administration’s 
proposal to roll back regulations of the Clean Air Act 
and possible dangers. Issues:  Politics/Environment

12. The Media Project 10/20/19 10:00am 30 min. 
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 



media.  Today: We talk about Governor Cuomo using 
the N-word live on the radio. Issues:  Media, Politics

13. This Week with Janine Rose 10/21/19 1:00pm 60 
min. Weekly program.  We discuss the latest on the 
national political scene We look at the current 
Democratic Presidential hopefuls.  And the latest on 
the impeachment discussions. Issues: National 
Politics 

14. The HomeTown Hour 10/24/19 11:00am 60 min. 
Weekly program. HomeTown Media publisher 
Howard Sturman discusses issues around the Sound 
Shore area of Westchester.  Todays’ topic:  The 
proposed pay raises for the Westchester County 
legislators and County employees.  We also discuss 
the many departments in Westchester County 
government that many deem “unnecessary”. Issues: 
Government, Politics

15. Your Community In Action 10/25/19 1:00pm 60 
min. Weekly program. Host Arlene Salman 
interviews non-profit organizations.  Today’s guest 
and topic: Gwen Salmo from Friends Of Karen 
discusses her organization that helps support 
critically ill children and their families. Issue:  Non-
profit 

16. The Legislative Gazette 10/25/19 4:30pm, 30 
min.  Weekly program re-capping the past week’s 
news in New York State.  Today we discuss state 



Republicans blasting the public financing 
commission.  Issue: Politics

17. The Media Project  10/27/19  10:00am  30 min.  
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 
media.  Today we talk about how New York may 
pass a law to help save local news.  Also … the 
future of Facebook and whether they have a 
responsibility as journalists.  Issue:  Media

18. Time To Talk 10/30/19 12:00pm 30 min. Weekly 
program.  Host Jen Graziano discusses dealing with 
the death of a loved one and planning for one’s 
affairs and estate.  Today’s topic:  Estate Planning… 
planning one’s affairs in advance, including legal and 
financial affairs as well as planning for one’s funeral.  
Issues: Death & dying, Estate planning

19. The Legislative Gazette 11/1/19 4:30pm 30 min. 
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State. Today:  We give an update on the 
commission formed to create a public financing 
system in New York.  We also discuss the likelihood 
that the head of the state Democrats and the 
Governor plan to eliminate fusion voting. Issue: 
Politics

20. Don’t Worry Murray 11/6/19 2:00pm 60 min. 
Weekly program.  Famed criminal attorney discusses 
crime all the time.  Today’s topic: The proposed 
criminal justice reforms, including bail reform and 
discovery changes are discussed. Issues:  Criminal 
law and the legal system.



21. Building Knowledge 11/8/19 1:00pm 60 min. 
Weekly program.  Host Jeff Hanley from the Building 
Institute discusses the many different development 
projects and new business initiatives taking place in 
Westchester.  Today’s topic: The new laws and 
guidelines for keeping your company’s website ADA 
compliant.  Issue: Business

22. The Legislative Gazette 11/8/19 4:30pm. 30 min. 
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today: We cover some of the major 
election results and discuss how early voting 
impacts elections.  We also talk about vaping and 
the state health department saying they still don’t 
know what’s causing vaping related illness. Issues:  
Politics, Health

23. The Media Project 11/10/19  10:00am 30 min.  
Today we discuss the failures of the Freedom of 
information Law and consider whether going 
nonprofit can save daily newspapers. Issue:  Media

24. The Legislative Gazette 11/15/19 4:30pm 30 
min.  Weekly program re-capping the past week’s 
news in New York State.  Today we discuss officials 
wanting to delay new criminal justice laws set to 
take effect in the new year  We also talk about New 
York GOP Congressman Peter King announcing he’ll 
retire at the end of his term.  And we speak with 
Congressman Delgado about his bipartisan bill for 
local veteran cemeteries. Issues: Criminal justice, 
Veterans’ issues

25.  The Media Project  11/17/19 10:00am 30 min. 
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 



media.  Today we talk about media coverage of the 
House impeachment hearings.  Also … toughening 
up student journalists.  Issue:  Media 

26.   The Legislative Gazette  11/22/19  4:30pm 30 
min.  Weekly programming re-capping the past 
week’s news in New York State.  Today we discuss 
the fear mayors across New York share that they 
won’t be able to pay for criminal justice law changes 
coming in the new year.  We also talk about the 
many candidates entering the race for 
Congresswoman Nita Lowey’s seat. Issues: Criminal 
justice, Politics

27. The Media Project 11/24/19  10:00am.  30 min.  
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 
media.  Today we talk about whether President 
Trump has put journalists’ lives in danger.  We also 
discuss the precarious state of local news. Issue:  
Media

28. All Around The Town 11/26/19 12:00pm 60 min. 
Bi-weekly program.  Hosted by Westchester County 
Office Of Veterans Affairs Ron Tocci.  He discusses 
issues facing New Rochelle residents as well as 
Veterans’ issues.  Today’s topic:  A re-cap of the 
Veteran’s Day celebrations across the county.  An 
update on the never-ending saga on the future of 
the New Rochelle armory.  And we discuss the 
changing façade of New Rochelle’s downtown area 
with less “Mom and Pop” businesses and more high-
rise residential buildings.  Issues: Community, 
Veterans’ issues, Development



29. The Legislative Gazette 11/29/19 4:30pm 30 
min. Weekly program re-capping the past week’s 
news in New York State.  Today:  We discuss New 
York state’s public campaign finance commission 
voting to put strict new limits on the abilities of 
minor parties to qualify to be on the ballot.  We also 
talk about why the commission seems to be going 
after fusion voting.  And … we also discuss a new 
major league baseball proposal impacting minor 
league teams.  Issues: Politics, Voting, Sports

30. The Media Project 12/1/19 10:00am 30 min. 
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 
media.  Today talk about the standards for radio and 
television news.  Issue: Media 

31. Your Community Today 12/3/19 1:00pm 60 min. 
Bi-weekly program. Ralph Gregory interviews non-
profit and charitable organizations.  Today’s guest: 
Tom Gabriel, President & CEO OF United Way Of 
Westchester & Putnam discusses their mission to 
provide financial stability to needy families in the 
area. Issues:  Non-profit, charitable issues.

32. The Legislative Gazette 12/6/19 4:30pm 30 min.  
Weekly program re-capping the past week’s news in 
New York State.  Today we discuss the state facing 
an over 6 billion dollar budget deficit.  We also talk 
about the Public Financing Commission’s official list 
of recommendations and reaction from third parties.  
And we also take a look at new legislation 
surrounding veterans and military sexual trauma.  
Issues: Government, Veterans’ issues, Sexual Abuse



33. The Media Project  12/8/19  10:00am  30 min.  
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 
media.  Today we talk about how journalists now 
have to engage with their audience to rebuild trust.  
We also discuss crowd sourcing.  Media,

34. Rise Up 12/10/19 3:00pm 60 min. Weekly 
program.  Jim Killoran, Executive Director for the 
Fuller House hosts this weekly program and 
discusses the organization’s latest building efforts.  
Today he discusses their most recent build-a-thon 
efforts in Westchester County for people in need of a 
home.  Volunteerism, Housing

35.  Divorce Dialogues 12/11/19 5:00pm 60 min.  Bi-
weekly program. Collaborative divorce attorney 
Katherine Miller discusses the topic of divorce.  
Today’s topic: How to go about knowing the signs 
and coming to a realization that your marriage may 
be over.  Divorce and The Family

36. The Power Hour- Black Westchester On The Air 
12/16/19 11:00am 60 min.  Black Westchester 
Magazine publisher Damon Jones and Editor-in-Chief 
A.J. Woodson co-host this program geared to the 
Black community. State.  Today we discuss the 
outgoing administration in the City Of Mount Vernon 
and look ahead to the new administration with guest 
Mayor-Elect Shawyn Patterson-Howard..  
Government, Politics



37. The New Rochelle Public Library On The Air 
12/17/19 12:00pm 60 min.  Monthly program.  
Haina Just-Michael hosts this monthly program 
discussing the many resources and activities going 
on at the New Rochelle Public Library.  Today’s 
topic:  We talk about the many programs available 
to residents of all ages and the online portal that 
allows one to participate right from their own home.  
Issue: Community

38. The Legislative Gazette 12/20/19 4:30pm 30 
min.  Weekly program re-capping the past week’s 
news in New York State.  Today we discuss New 
York banning single use plastic bags beginning 
March 1st. We talk about the controversy over the 
state’s new green light law.  And finally we discuss 
the new U.S. Mexico-Canada agreement. Issues: 
Environment., International affairs

39. The Media Project  12/22/19  10:00am  30 min.  
Weekly program focusing on issues facing the 
media.  Today we talk about coverage of the 
impeachment and trusting the news media in the 
Trump era. Issue:  Media

40. The Attorney General’s Report 12/24/19  1:00pm 
60 min.  Weekly program.   Gary Brown from the 
Westchester Office Of The New York State Attorney 
General’s Office hosts this monthly show reporting 
the latest news from the Attorney General’s Office 
and providing useful consumer protection 
information.  Today’s topics:  The latest phone, e-
mail and internet scams, including holiday scams.  
Issue: Consumer Protection issues



41. The Legislative Gazette 12/27/19 4:30pm 30 
min.  Weekly program re-capping the past week’s 
news in New York State.  Today we discuss whether 
the state will legalize cannabis for recreational use 
in 2020.  And we take a look at how law 
enforcement agencies are preparing for criminal 
justice reforms taking effect January 1 in New York 
State.  Issues: Drug legislation, Criminal justice


