
10/12/22 1 1Page ofPrint Date

Product

10.12-18.22

Contract Dates

Original Date / Revision

10/12/22 - 10/18/22

10/11/2210/11/22Thomas Marcelle for NYS Supreme Court Judge

Property Sales OfficeAccount Executive

Local PoughkeepsieHouse Poughkeepsie

Billing Cycle Billing Calendar Cash/Trade

EOM/EOC Broadcast Cash

And:

WPDH-FM
2 Pendell Road
Poughkeepsie, NY  12601
(845) 471-1500

WPDH-FM

Contract Agreement Between:

CONTRACT
Alt Order #

 / 

Contract / Revision

3658882  / 

Estimate #

Special Handling

Advertiser

Agy Code Product 1/2Advertiser Code

Agency Ref Advertiser Ref

Demographic

Households

Collaborations
403 River Street
Troy, NY  12181

Ch*Line Start Date End Date Description
Start/End
Time Days Week Rate TypeLength

Spots/
Spots Amount

1 10/12/22 10/18/22 M-F AM Drive 6a-10a :30 NM 20 $1,120.00N WPDH
Start Date End Date Weekdays Spots/Week Rate
10/10/22 10/16/22 --WTF-- 10 $56.00Week: 
10/17/22 10/23/22 MT----- 10 $56.00Week: 

2 10/12/22 10/18/22 M-F Midday 10a-3p :30 NM 20 $1,120.00N WPDH
Start Date End Date Weekdays Spots/Week Rate
10/10/22 10/16/22 --WTF-- 10 $56.00Week: 
10/17/22 10/23/22 MT----- 10 $56.00Week: 

3 10/12/22 10/18/22 M-F PM Drive 3p-7p :30 NM 10 $490.00N WPDH
Start Date End Date Weekdays Spots/Week Rate
10/10/22 10/16/22 --WTF-- 5 $49.00Week: 
10/17/22 10/23/22 MT----- 5 $49.00Week: 

Totals 50 $2,730.00

Time Period # of Spots Gross Amount Net Amount

09/26/22 50 $2,730.00 $2,730.0010/18/22-

$2,730.00$2,730.0050Totals

Signature: Date: 

(* Line Transactions:  N = New, E = Edited, D = Deleted)
Notwithstanding to whom bills are rendered, advertiser, agency and service, jointly and severally, shall remain obligated to pay to station the amount of any bills rendered by station within the time specified and until

payment in full is received by station.  Payment by advertiser to agency or to service or payment by agency to service, shall not constitute payment to station.  Station will not be bound by conditions. printed or
otherwise contracts, insertion orders, copy instructions or any correspondence when such conflict with the above terms and conditions.  Two week advance cancellation notice is required unless otherwise specified.
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Michele Franks

From: Lisa Montanaro
Sent: Tuesday, October 11, 2022 12:35 PM
To: Becky Mickelson; HVOrders; Kristin Cummings
Subject: Re: Completed: Complete with DocuSign: wpdh tom marcelle 1005 thru 1011 (1).pdf

Hi Becky! 
 
2730 is the net amount  ‐ please adjust, rates are net 
 
Lisa 
 
 
Lisa M ontanaro 
Townsquare Media ‐ Hudson Valley 
Director of Sales 
(o): (845) 478‐1058 
(c):  (845) 430‐5735 

 
Tow nsquare M edia does not discrim inate in advertising sales based on race or ethnicity.  Any provision in any 

order or agreem ent for advertising that purports to discrim inate based on race or ethnicity, even if handw ritten, 

typed, or otherw ise m ade a part of a particular contract, w ill be rejected. 

From: Becky Mickelson <Becky.Mickelson@townsquaremedia.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, October 11, 2022 12:19 PM 
To: Lisa Montanaro <Lisa.Montanaro@townsquaremedia.com>; HVOrders <HVOrders@townsquaremedia.com>; Kristin 
Cummings <Kristin.Cummings@townsquaremedia.com> 
Subject: RE: Completed: Complete with DocuSign: wpdh tom marcelle 1005 thru 1011 (1).pdf  
  
Hi Hi! 
  

This order is in, attached is confirmation সহ঺঻ 
  

From: Lisa Montanaro <Lisa.Montanaro@townsquaremedia.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, October 11, 2022 11:11 AM 
To: HVOrders <HVOrders@townsquaremedia.com>; Kristin Cummings <Kristin.Cummings@townsquaremedia.com> 
Subject: Fw: Completed: Complete with DocuSign: wpdh tom marcelle 1005 thru 1011 (1).pdf 
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See below he is authorizing the card ending in xxx7446‐  $2,730 charge today.  
  
Lisa M ontanaro 

Townsquare Media ‐ Hudson Valley 
Director of Sales 
(o): (845) 478‐1058 
(c):  (845) 430‐5735 

 
Tow nsquare M edia does not discrim inate in advertising sales based on race or ethnicity.  Any provision in any 

order or agreem ent for advertising that purports to discrim inate based on race or ethnicity, even if handw ritten, 

typed, or otherw ise m ade a part of a particular contract, w ill be rejected. 

From: Paul Donnelly <paulcollab@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, October 11, 2022 12:01 PM 
To: Lisa Montanaro <Lisa.Montanaro@townsquaremedia.com> 
Subject: Re: Completed: Complete with DocuSign: wpdh tom marcelle 1005 thru 1011 (1).pdf  
  
Approved  
  
On Tue, Oct 11, 2022, 11:33 AM Lisa Montanaro <Lisa.Montanaro@townsquaremedia.com> wrote: 

Thanks Paul, same spot?  Also, these are the rates for 30, you calculated off of 60s ‐ so below and let me 
know if approved + authorization on card for $2,730 charge today.  
  

The linked image cannot 
be d isplayed.  The file may  
have been mov ed, 
renamed, or deleted.  
Verify that the link poin ts  
to the correct file and  
location.

 
  

The linked 
be d isplaye
have been 
renamed, o
Verify that 
to the corr
location.

 
  
  
  
  
  
  
 
Thank you! 
  
Lisa 
  
  
Lisa M ontanaro 
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Townsquare Media ‐ Hudson Valley 
Director of Sales 
(o): (845) 478‐1058 
(c):  (845) 430‐5735 

The linked 
be d isplaye
have been 
renamed, o
Verify that 
to the corr
location.

 
Tow nsquare M edia does not discrim inate in advertising sales based on race or ethnicity.  Any provision in any 

order or agreem ent for advertising that purports to discrim inate based on race or ethnicity, even if handw ritten, 

typed, or otherw ise m ade a part of a particular contract, w ill be rejected. 

From: Paul Donnelly <paulcollab@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, October 10, 2022 7:00 PM 
To: Lisa Montanaro <Lisa.Montanaro@townsquaremedia.com> 
Subject: Re: Completed: Complete with DocuSign: wpdh tom marcelle 1005 thru 1011 (1).pdf  
  
New order  
  
On Wed, Oct 5, 2022, 9:54 AM Lisa Montanaro via DocuSign <dse_NA3@docusign.net> wrote: 

 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
DocuSign

 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 

Your document has been completed 
  

VIEW COMPLETED DOCUMENT

Lisa Montanaro  
Lisa.Montanaro@townsquaremedia.com

All parties have completed Complete with DocuSign: wpdh tom marcelle 1005 thru 
1011 (1).pdf. 
Hi Please Sign the third page - thank you!
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Do Not Share This Email 
This email contains a secure link to DocuSign. Please do not share this email, link, or access code 
with others. 

Alternate Signing Method 
Visit DocuSign.com, click 'Access Documents', and enter the security code: 
6AF8CC69DABD4209B2279BE6389D5DAB3  

About DocuSign 
Sign documents electronically in just minutes. It's safe, secure, and legally binding. Whether you're 
in an office, at home, on-the-go -- or even across the globe -- DocuSign provides a professional 
trusted solution for Digital Transaction Management™.  

Questions about the Document? 
If you need to modify the document or have questions about the details in the document, please 
reach out to the sender by emailing them directly. 
 
Stop receiving this email 
Report this email or read more about Declining to sign and Managing notifications. 
 
If you are having trouble signing the document, please visit the Help with Signing page on our 
Support Center. 

Download the DocuSign App  

This message was sent to you by Lisa Montanaro who is using the DocuSign Electronic Signature Service. If you would rather not 

receive email from this sender you may contact the sender with your request. 

 

  

Internet Email Warning 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize 
the sender and know the content is safe.  
  

  

Internet Email Warning 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize 
the sender and know the content is safe.  
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