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Show: Morning Air 

Date: July 3, 2013 

Time: 6:00am 

Topic: “8 Key Areas to Build a Better Leadership System” 

Guest: Dr. Ray Benedetto 

Length: 25 minutes 

Summary: Ray Benedetto, DM, is a retired USAF colonel. Ray founded a consulting firm that helps 
leaders build high-performing, character-based cultures in addition to his teaching leadership and 
strategic planning for the University of Phoenix Chicago Campus MBA program. 

 

Show: The Drew Mariani Show 

Date: Monday, July 8, 2013 

Time: 2:30-2:45pm 

Topic: Sonya’s Law 

Guest: Sue Armacost 

Length: 15 minutes 

Summary: Sue Armacost from Wisconsin Right to Life joined the show to talk about Sonya’s Law.  
Wisconsin Governor Scott Walker signed the bill, which would require women seeking an abortion to 
get an ultrasound.  Sue talked about the latest as now abortion providers are suing to prevent the law 
from taking effect. 

 

 



Show: The Drew Mariani Show 

Date: Friday, July 12, 2013 

Time: 2:30-3:00pm 

Topic: HHS Mandate 

Guest: Dr. Anne Hendershott 

Length: 30 minutes 

Summary: Dr. Anne Hendershott talked about the latest in regards to the HHS Mandate and religious 
freedom.  She addressed the importance of the laity being informed and active on this issue.  She also 
took calls from listeners. 

 

Show: The Drew Mariani Show 

Date: Wednesday, July 24, 2013 

Time: 4:00-4:45pm 

Topic: Economy 

Guest: Peter Grandich 

Length: 45 minutes 

Summary: With the stock market hitting new highs, Peter Grandich joined the show to talk about the 
economy.  He discussed Detroit declaring bankruptcy, gold rising and the latest unemployment numbers.  
Peter took several calls from listeners and talked about where he sees us headed. 

 

Show: The Drew Mariani Show 

Date: Friday, August 2, 2013 

Time: 2:15-2:30pm 

Topic: Travel Alert 

Guest: James Carafano 



Length: 15 minutes 

Summary: With the U.S. issuing a global travel alert, James Carafano came on the show to talk about 
what it means.  He talked about why the alert was issued, who it affects and how long it possibly will 
last.  James talked about the terror threat and took calls from listeners.   

 

Show: Morning Air 

Date: Tuesday, August 6, 2013 

Time: 6:30am 

Topic: Healing Sexual Wounds 

Guest: Dawn Eden 

Length: 20 minutes 

Summary: Dawn Eden is the bestselling author of The Thrill of the Chaste, which is in its eleventh 
printing and has been translated into Spanish, Polish, and Chinese.  Born into a Jewish family in New 
York City, she lost her faith as a teenager and became an agnostic.  In her early thirties, she experienced 
a dramatic conversion to Christianity that led her to enter the Catholic Church.   

 

Show: Morning Air 

Date: Wednesday, August 7, 2013 

Time: 7:30am 

Topic: Success & Leadership 

Guest: Dave Durand 

Length: 25 minutes 

Summary: Dave Durand is an author, speaker and personal success coach.  He has trained over 100,000 
professionals in sales, marketing, business leadership and athletics.  He is the founder of ProBalance Inc. 
and Dave Durand Coaching Systems.  Dave’s latest book is “Say This (Instead of That): How to Build 
Trust and Motivate Others with the Right Choice of Words.   

 



Show: Morning Air 

Date: Wednesday, August 14, 2013 

Time: 6:00 am 

Topic: Raising Kids in an iCulture 

Guest: Kate Wicker 

Length: 25 minutes 

Summary: Kate Wicker is an author of Weightless: Making Peace with your Body. Kate is a 24/7 
mother who’s in the business of hazardous waste removal, prescribing kisses for scraped knees, growing 
babies, nurturing souls, and looking for God (and runaway baby socks) in the trenches of motherhood.  
Raising kids in an iCulture- how do we handle technology in our children’s lives? She stressed 
underestimating a child’s sense of responsibility in and overestimating technology’s ability to lure a 
child in and tempt them. 

 

Show: The Drew Mariani Show 

Date: Tuesday, August 27, 2013 

Time: 2:00-2:30pm 

Topic: Common Core 

Guest: Dr. Duke Pesta 

Length: 30 minutes 

Summary: Dr. Duke Pesta joined the show to talk about Common Core.  He discussed what the 
curriculum entails, states that have implemented it and what it could mean for the future of education.  
Dr. Pesta took several calls from listeners and addressed some of the most frequently asked questions.  

 

 

Show: Morning Air 

Date: Tuesday, August 27, 2013 

Time: 7:00 am 



Topic: How to Defend Your Home from an Impending Foreclosure 

Guest: Joaquin Benitez 

Length: 25 minutes 

Summary: Joaquin Benitez immigrated to North America from El Salvador as a teenager.  After 
struggling financially for many years and subsequently losing his home to foreclosure, he pursued 
higher education and earned a diploma in Civil Engineering.  The Foreclosure Phenomenon is his first 
book. He talked about the biggest roadblocks to defending your home against impending foreclosure? 

 

Show: Morning Air 

Date: Wednesday, August 28, 2013 

Time: 6:00 am 

Topic: College Costs and Student Debt 

Guest: John Zmirak 

Length: 25 minutes 

Summary: John Zmirak, editor in chief of Choosing the Right College and CollegeGuide.org received 
his B.A> from Yale University and a PH.D. in English from Louisiana State University.  He has taught 
at LSU, Tulane, and the Thomas more College of Liberal Arts.  The author of several books, Zmirak has 
worked extensively as a journalist, writing for publications ranging from USA Today to Investor’s 
Business Daily.  He lives in his native New York City. 

Everyone knows that student loans have hit an all-time high.  According to John Zmirak, there is a way 
to get a good solid college education without drowning oneself in debt. 

 

 

Show: Morning Air 

Date: Thursday, Sept 3, 2013 

Time: 6:10 am 

Topic: Understanding Alcohol Intoxication 



Guest: Rhonda Martin 

Length: 20 minutes 

Summary: Rhonda Martin is a Board Certified Licensed Professional Clinic Counselor and Board 
Certified in Homeland Security, specializing in Anxiety Disorders.  Author of the award-winning book 
“Stuck”, a guide for kids and parents dealing with panic, anxiety and obsessive compulsive disorders.   

 

Show: The Drew Mariani Show 

Date: Tuesday, September 3, 2013 

Time: 2:30-3:00pm 

Topic: Immigration  

Guest: Jason Adkins 

Length: 30 minutes 

Summary: Jason Adkins was on the show to talk about immigration reform as many dioceses held 
Immigration Sunday.  Jason spoke about the need to raise awareness and the role people of faith play in 
this national debate.  He also addressed several questions from listeners on the topic. 

 

Show: The Drew Mariani Show 

Date: Thursday, September 12, 2013 

Time: 4:00-4:30pm 

Topic: Syria 

Guest: Dr. Leon Aron 

Length: 30 minutes 

Summary: Dr. Leon Aron came on the show to discuss the latest with Syria.  He talked about Syria’s 
willingness to hand over their chemical weapons, because of a proposal from Russia.  He addressed 
possible outcomes of the resolution and took calls from listeners. 

 



Show: Morning Air 

Date: Monday, Sept 16, 2013 

Time: 7:30 am 

Topic: Alcohol Abuse, Binge Drinking and Your Kids 

Guest: Barry Adkins 

Length: 25 minutes 

Summary: Barry Adkins grew up in Kalispell, Montana.  After graduating from high school, Barry 
worked on commercial fishing boats in Alaska until he moved to Arizona where he now resides with his 
wife, children, and grandchildren. The death of his son, Kevin, radically changed his life and he set out 
on a mission to help teenagers understand the negative effects of binge drinking and to help parents 
understand their teenagers and deal with adolescent behaviors that can have a serious, lasting impact on 
the lives of their families.  Barry Adkins endured the tragic loss of his son, Kevin, and emerged a 
stronger, more deeply committed person who, through his own grief, found a way to help others. 

 

Show: The Drew Mariani Show 

Date: Thursday, September 19, 2013 

Time: 4:00-4:15pm 

Topic: Debt Ceiling 

Guest: James Capretta 

Length: 15 minutes 

Summary: James Capretta joined Drew to talk about the budget and healthcare.  He talked about raising 
the debt ceiling and a possible government shutdown, what it would mean and who it would affect.  He 
took calls from listeners and also addressed Obamacare going into effect October 1.   


