
South Carolina Public Radio Community Issues List 

(First Quarter 2024 – January, February, March) 

South Carolina News Stories 

WRJA/WJWJ/WLJK/WHMC/WNSC/WLTR/WEPR/WSCI 

Mondays 6:45 a.m., 8:45 a.m., Tuesdays 1:33 p.m., Wednesdays 9:30 a.m. 
(WNSC-FM, WRJA-FM, WJWJ-FM, WHMC-FM, WLJK-FM) 2:30 p.m. 

(WEPR-FM, WSCI-FM, WLTR-FM), Thursdays 5:44 p.m.; Saturdays 8:35 
a.m., Sundays 5:35 p.m. 

Shows listed in reverse play order. 

SC News 

Folks facing homelessness get a voice in Rock Hill – their own 

Scott Morgan 

March 29, 2024 

A workshop for those experiencing homelessness is giving voice to writers who are already finding 
connections. 

LISTEN • 6:29 

SC News 

SC House passes wide-ranging energy bill 

Russ McKinney 

March 28, 2024 

While meant to ensure South Carolina avoids future energy crises, critics claim the bill gives electric 
utility companies a “blank check” to build mega-projects financed by rate-payers. 

SC News 

Charleston's new mayor believes city challenges can be overcome 

Victoria Hansen 

March 28, 2024 
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Charleston Mayor William Cogswell begins to confront flooding, sea level rise and affordable 
housing during his first three months in office. 

LISTEN • 4:00 

Politics 

Voters could be asked to do away with electing SC's top accountant after $3.5B error 

Maayan Schechter 

March 27, 2024 

South Carolina lawmakers want to make the state's top financial accountant, called the comptroller 
general, an appointed position rather than elected. But first they need approval from voters. 

SC News 

Despite rumors, Spartanburg Soup Kitchen is not closing its doors 

Scott Morgan 

March 27, 2024 

Rumors that Spartanburg Soup Kitchen would be closing got so bad, some staff couldn't always 
keep up with their work. 

LISTEN • 0:48 

SC News 

SC victims rights advocates look for criminal justice reform amid 'semi-crisis’ in funding 

Scott Morgan 

March 21, 2024 

The Third Annual Victims Matter at the South Carolina Statehouse Thursday called for state 
stopgap dollars to offset a drop in federal VOCA funding. 

March 21, 2024 

One of the largest manufacturing plants to be built in our state recently held their groundbreaking 
ceremony in the Midlands and we have their top local representative on the phone to tell us more. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

SC News 
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SC Ports Authority plans to expand with purchase of former North Charleston paper mill site 

Victoria Hansen 

March 20, 2024 

The South Carolina Ports Authority announced plans Tuesday to buy the old WestRock paper mill 
site in North Charleston as it looks to expand port capacity. The 280-acre waterfront property sits 
adjacent to its North Charleston terminal. 

Politics 

SC's Clyburn, focused on Biden's bid, files for reelection after House leadership exit 

Maayan Schechter 

March 18, 2024 

Congressman Jim Clyburn on Monday, March 18, 2024, filed for reelection to the U.S. House. He is 
the only Democrat in South Carolina's congressional delegation. 

Politics 

Seeking office in SC in 2024? Candidate filing for Statehouse, other seats opens Saturday 

Maayan Schechter 

March 15, 2024 

The filing opens at noon March 16 and will run through noon April 1. Some county election offices 
might be closed on March 29 for Good Friday. 

LISTEN • 0:40 

SC News 

South Carolina NAACP won the right to publish current eviction data. The data are finally out 

Scott Morgan 

March 14, 2024 

In 2022, a federal judge ruled that barring NAACP and ACLU from scraping the Public Index was 
illegal. So NAACP built a database of current eviction numbers. On Thursday, those numbers went 
public. 

SC News 

Family of Hilton Head Island woman who fought developers reaches settlement 
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Victoria Hansen 

March 14, 2024 

Family of 94-year-old Josephine Wright says they've reached a settlement in the battle to preserve 
their ancestral land dating back to the Civil War. 

SC News 

Two Lowcountry Democrats launch campaigns in 1st Congressional District race 

Victoria Hansen 

March 14, 2024 

Democrats Mac Deford and Michael B. Moore seek to unseat Republican Nancy Mace in the coastal 
1st Congressional District. 

SC News 

North Charleston's first African American mayor leans on lessons in faith and sacrifice 

Victoria Hansen 

March 12, 2024 

North Charleston first new mayor in nearly 30 years says the struggles and sacrifices of his past will 
help him shape the city's future as its first African American mayor. 

LISTEN 4:00 

SC News 

Strong storms and flood risk this weekend, followed by brief temperature drop 

William Maxham 

March 7, 2024 

Strong storms and flood risk this weekend, followed by brief temperature drop. 

SC News 

Anderson County expands its Library Board. That worries library supporters 

Scott Morgan 

March 7, 2024 
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On Tuesday, Anderson County joined Pickens County in adding seats to the Library Board. Some 
advocates say adding more voices is a way to censor materials. County officials say there is no 
political motive. 

Politics 

SC high court weighs private school voucher law as House leaders push expansion proposal 

Maayan Schechter 

March 6, 2024 

The South Carolina Supreme Court on Wednesday, March 6, 2024, heard arguments over a state law 
that offers families meeting certain poverty thresholds public money to pay for private school 
tuition, among other education-related needs. 

SC News 

With her campaign suspended, Nikki Haley's biggest ally says it's time to back Trump 

Scott Morgan 

March 6, 2024 

U.S. Rep. Ralph Norman was the only major Republican in South Carolina to back Nikki Haley's 
presidential campaign. Now he's encouraging her to ally with Donald Trump, despite what often was 
a war of insults. 

LISTEN • 0:40 

Politics 

Kittredge elected next SC Supreme Court chief justice 

Russ McKinney 

March 6, 2024 

Justice John Kittredge will succeed Chief Justice Don Beatty, who is the court's only Black justice. 
Beatty will retire from the court this summer. 

SC News 

What is build-to-rent, and why is much of SC nervous about it? 

Scott Morgan 

March 5, 2024 
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Build-to-rent, or BTR, refers to house developments – neighborhoods – that are built by developers 
with deep pockets. 

LISTEN • 11:22 

SC News 

SC accounting error gets renewed focus over $1.8B sitting in state bank account 

Russ McKinney 

March 5, 2024 

State Sen. Larry Grooms, R-Berkeley, introduced a resolution that directs the state treasurer to 
freeze $1.8 billion sitting in a state account until lawmakers can sort the money out. 

LISTEN • 4:00 

SC News 

SC House considers sweeping energy bill that critics argue is not ‘silver bullet’ to state’s needs 

Russ McKinney 

March 1, 2024 

SC lawmakers say they want to ensure utilities can produce enough energy to meet needs of the fast-
growing state 

LISTEN • 3:59 

SC News 

Aiken just saw one of the country's only upticks in mortgage originations 

Scott Morgan 

February 29, 2024 

Data from ATTOM Data Services show that as U.S. mortgage loan totals dipped in all but five U.S. 
metro areas in the fourth quarter of 2023. Aiken/Augusta was one of the five. 

SC News 

Jasper County may extend 270-day moratorium on building 

Scott Morgan 

February 27, 2024 
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Jasper County put a nine-month timeout on some large commercial and residential projects. A few 
weeks before it expires, officials want more time to weigh what development means in a growing, 
mostly rural county. 

LISTEN • 0:45 

SC News 

It's Election Day in SC: Polls open in 1st-in-South GOP presidential primary 

Maayan Schechter 

February 24, 2024 

South Carolina ETV and SC Public Radio will air comprehensive live results coverage across its 
statewide television and radio network from 7 to 9 p.m. Feb. 24, 2024. 

SC News 

Sen. Tom Davis would like a word about Medicaid expansion in South Carolina 

Scott Morgan 

February 23, 2024 

South Carolina is one of 10 holdouts against Medicaid expansion. Attitudes towards expansion, 
however, might be changing. 

SC News 

Music 

Piano “plays well with others” on Hilton Head 

Bradley Fuller 

February 22, 2024 

The keyboard instrument’s collaborative side is set to be showcased in a range of performances at 
this year’s BravoPiano! Festival, presented by the Hilton Head International Piano Competition. 

LISTEN • 13:55 

Scott Morgan 

February 21, 2024 

Families in Richland One School District live in a community beset by poverty, eviction, and 
homelessness. A grassroots effort to help parents deal runs through May. 
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LISTEN • 3:59 

Russ McKinney 

February 21, 2024 

South Carolina lawmakers are taking sweeping action to consolidate, with the goal to hopefully 
improve the delivery of health care services in the state. 

SC News 

'Something needs to change.' Woman denied abortion in South Carolina challenges ban 

Victoria Hansen 

February 20, 2024 

State law has been interpreted as banning abortion after six weeks of pregnancy. Planned 
Parenthood argues the ban is vague and shouldn't apply until at least three weeks later in pregnancy. 

LISTEN • 4:40 

SC News 

First federal gender-based hate crime trial starts in South Carolina over trans woman’s killing 

February 19, 2024 

Mike Switzer interviews John Warner, a serial entrepreneur and founder of Innoventure in 
Greenville, S.C. John shares his personal experience recently with medical technology in our state. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Politics 

Clyburn steps down from House Dem leadership, says he'll run for reelection 

Maayan Schechter 

February 16, 2024 

"Events of the last several years have made it clear that the greatness of America is at peril, and the 
threats to our continued pursuit of ‘a more perfect Union’ are real," U.S. Rep. Jim Clyburn said in a 
Feb. 14, 2024, statement. 

Politics 

Lawmakers set to negotiate proposal that would loosen gun restrictions in South Carolina 
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Maayan Schechter 

February 16, 2024 

The S.C. House voted Tuesday, Feb. 13, 2024, to reject Senate-approved changes to the lower 
chamber's so-called "constitutional carry" bill that would loosen gun restrictions in South Carolina. 

SC News 

Bill addressing predatory lending practices stymied in SC Senate 

Scott Morgan 

February 15, 2024 

The bill to redefine the climate in which short-term lenders operate in the state made it further than 
any bill of the kind since the Great Recession, but still not far enough. 

Music 

Edgar Meyer and son George showcase musical kinship at USC 

Bradley Fuller 

February 15, 2024 

The renowned bassist and rising violinist prepare to take the stage at Johnson Hall on Saturday for a 
performance featuring a duo the father-son team wrote together and other selections of a not-quite-
so-classical sort—including fiddle tunes. 

LISTEN • 14:24 

SC News 

SC Senate approves Medical Marijuana bill 

Russ McKinney 

February 14, 2024 

After being approved by the Senate in 2022, the leadership in the House allowed the measure to die 
on a procedural ruling without any debate or official votes. 

SC News 

Trump leads big in latest Winthrop Poll, but there’s an asterisk 

Scott Morgan 
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February 14, 2024 

The former president has a large cushion over former Gov. Nikki Haley heading into the GOP 
primary. But independents likely to vote on Feb. 24 are 50/50. 

LISTEN • 0:44 

SC News 

Foreclosure rates in Spartanburg, Columbia led U.S. cities in January 

Scott Morgan 

February 13, 2024 

South Carolina's foreclosure filing rates ballooned between January and the previous January. The 
trend was bolstered by the two highest foreclosure rates among U.S. cities of 200,000-plus. 

LISTEN • 0:44 

SC News 

Calhoun Democrat 2nd legislator to seek redrawn Midlands-based SC Senate seat 

Maayan Schechter 

February 13, 2024 

South Carolina Rep. Russell Ott, D-Calhoun, announced on Tuesday, Feb. 13, 2024, that he will file 
in March to run for the redrawn state Senate District 26. 

SC News 

Early voting in SC GOP's presidential primary starts Monday. Here's what you need to know 

Maayan Schechter 

February 9, 2024 

Early-voting centers will be closed Sunday, Feb. 18 and Monday, Feb. 19 for Presidents Day. 

SC News 

Round 2: SC Senate debates medical marijuana bill after House blew up ex-proposal in smoke 

Maayan Schechter 

SC News 

https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/sc-news
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/sc-news/2024-02-13/foreclosure-rates-in-spartanburg-columbia-led-u-s-cities-in-january
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/people/scott-morgan
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/sc-news
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/sc-news/2024-02-13/legis-ottsenate
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/people/maayan-schechter
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/sc-news
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/sc-news/2024-02-09/gop-earlyvoting
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/people/maayan-schechter
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/sc-news
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/sc-news/2024-02-08/legis-medicalmarijuana
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/people/maayan-schechter
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/sc-news


SCDEW and Department of Corrections partner to connect employers with formerly incarcerated 
workforce 

Vince Kolb-Lugo 

February 7, 2024 

The state Department of Corrections and the Department of Employment and Workforce 
(SCDEW) are partnering to help ex-felons find gainful employment. 

LISTEN • 12:24 

SC News 

New SC Senate bill aimed at predatory lending practices heads to committee hearing 

Scott Morgan 

February 7, 2024 

The bill seeks to limit how certain short-term lenders can solicit new and maintain existing 
borrowers. 

LISTEN • 1:38 

SC News 

Special order divides what's left of Alex Murdaugh's known assets 

Victoria Hansen 

February 6, 2024 

An order issued Monday dividing Murdaugh's money leaves nearly half to the victims of a fatal 2019 
boating accident. 

SC News 

Donald Trump deploys his oft-used playbook against women who bother him. For now, it's Nikki 
Haley 

SC News 

Inside the lending business practices the SC Senate is weighing 

Scott Morgan 

February 6, 2024 
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State Senate Bill 910 zeroes in on how installment lenders get and maintain their customers. Former 
lenders say its a lot of pressure. 

LISTEN • 8:23 

Music 

Colour of Music Festival brings Charlestonian home 

Bradley Fuller 

February 5, 2024 

The original version of Edmund Thornton Jenkins’ Lowcountry-inspired orchestral rhapsody is set 
to be performed for the first time in the composer’s home state on Saturday, part of a Gaillard 
Center presentation culminating the Colour of Music Festival's Black History Month Concert Series. 

LISTEN • 10:09 

SC News 

Joe Biden wins SC's 1st-in-nation Democratic primary 

Maayan Schechter 

February 3, 2024 

President Joe Biden on Saturday, Feb. 3, 2024, won the state's Democratic presidential primary. It 
was the first time Biden's name was on the ballot this cycle. 

SC News 

Former Olympic figure skater named as third student alleges sexual abuse at Irmo rink 

Victoria Hansen 

February 2, 2024 

A third student now claims sexual abuse by a former Olympic figure skater who coached in Irmo. 

SC News 

Former student sues College of Charleston for $10 million alleging hazing by fraternity 

Victoria Hansen 

February 1, 2024 
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Student says he was physically and mentally abused by fraternity and forced to drop out of school, 
losing tuition and scholarship money. 

SC News 

South Carolina homeowners are losing their equity 

Scott Morgan 

February 1, 2024 

New data show that fewer homes in the state are considered 'equity rich' than this time last year. 

LISTEN • 0:48 

SC News 

South Carolina voter totals are down, but women still outnumber men 

Scott Morgan 

January 31, 2024 

More women than men are registered to vote heading into South Carolina's presidential primaries. 
There are large gaps between the sexes among white and Black voters. 

LISTEN • 0:45 

SC News 

SC attorney general asks for $1.5M+ to help cut down on growing court caseloads 

Maayan Schechter 

January 31, 2024 

"Those backlogs are jeopardizing the safety of the citizens of South Carolina," U.S. House Speaker 
Murrell Smith, R-Sumter, said Wednesday, Jan. 31, 2024. 

SC News 

Bill to restructure DHEC advances in SC State Senate 

Russ McKinney 

January 31, 2024 
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If the bill becomes law, it would see the state departments of Mental Health, Disability and Special 
Needs, Health and Human Services, Alcohol and Other Drug Abuse, and the Office on Aging 
consolidate with DHEC’s Division of Public Health. 

SC News 

While South Carolina home prices finished 2023 in upswing, rents are lower than recent peaks 

Scott Morgan 

January 30, 2024 

Overall, it was slightly more expensive to buy a home in 2023 than it was in 2022. But renting right 
now is slightly cheaper than it's been for a while. 

LISTEN • 1:15 

SC News 

SC Senate continues debate on latest gun bill 

Russ McKinney 

January 29, 2024 

A debate regarding House Bill 3694, known as "Constitutional Carry," heads into the second week. 

SC News 

Before SC Dem primary, Biden thanks voters who propelled him to White House 4 years ago 

Maayan Schechter 

January 27, 2024 

President Joe Biden joined South Carolina Democrats Friday, Jan. 27, 2024, for a first-in-the-nation 
dinner fundraiser in Columbia, S.C. 

SC News 

Biden returns to SC as Dems aim to energize voters before 1st-in-nation primary 

Maayan Schechter 

January 26, 2024 

The South Carolina Democratic presidential primary is Feb. 3, 2024. 

Weather 
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Multi-day flash flood risk for the Upstate 

William Maxham 

January 25, 2024 

Several inches of rain expected through Saturday evening, raising concerns for flash flooding. 

SC News 

McMaster blasts labor unions, says he'll fight dispute on SC coast 'to the gates of hell' 

Maayan Schechter 

January 24, 2024 

"Our aerospace, vehicle and tire manufacturers are no longer the sole targets for labor organizers. 
Our thriving hospitality and tourism industry along our coast now finds itself a target," S.C. Gov. 
Henry McMaster said Jan. 24, 2024. 

SC News 

READ ALONG: SC Gov. McMaster delivers 2024 State of the State 

Maayan Schechter 

January 24, 2024 

South Carolina Gov. Henry McMaster delivered his annual State of the State address on Jan. 24, 
2024. 

SC News 

Black voting rights group in Charleston this week, ahead of state's Democratic presidential primary 

Victoria Hansen 

January 24, 2024 

Members of the national voting rights group Black Voters Matter will spend the next three days in 
Charleston trying to rally support among Black voters ahead of next month’s Democratic 
presidential primary. 

SC News 

Installment lenders make their case to SC senators weighing reform. So far, it's been a little rough 

Scott Morgan 
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January 23, 2024 

As State Senate Bill 910, aimed at protecting financially vulnerable people from predatory lending, 
courses through subcommittee, lawmakers crank up their scrutiny of the short-term lending industry 
with tough questions. 

LISTEN • 3:59 

SC News 

South Carolina sees 7th officer involved shooting in as many weeks 

Victoria Hansen 

January 22, 2024 

Blue lights and crime scene tape surrounded several blocks of a Charleston area suburb Sunday night 
as SLED was called out to investigate its seventh officer involved shooting in as many weeks. 

SC News 

Coldest air of the winter arrives tonight. Just how cold will it get? 

William Maxham 

January 19, 2024 

Sub-freezing lows are forecasted throughout the state both Friday night and Saturday night. Some 
areas could experience temperatures as low as the single digits. 

SC News 

A Tesla distribution center is coming to the Upstate 

Scott Morgan 

January 18, 2024 

The EV maker announced Thursday that it would open a distribution and logistics location in 
Fountain Inn, in Greenville County. 

LISTEN • 0:48 

SC News 

Alex Murdaugh has more to prove with limited witnesses in now confirmed retrial hearing 

Victoria Hansen 
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SC News 

Shallow roots and deep issues with water and soil in South Carolina 

Scott Morgan 

January 16, 2024 

A conversation with NRCS soil scientist Lance Brewington sheds light on why managing South 
Carolina's wet winters can help the state to not suffer troubles the West Coast is trying to solve. 

LISTEN • 3:59 

SC News 

In SC, Kamala Harris urges voter turnout as she stresses 'freedom is under profound threat' 

Maayan Schechter 

January 15, 2024 

Vice President Kamala Harris spoke at the S.C. NAACP's King Day at the Dome event in 
Columbia, S.C. on Monday, Jan. 15, 2024. 

SC News 

94-year-old Josephine Wright remembered for her fight to save Gullah Geechee land, her talents and 
generosity 

Victoria Hansen 

SC News 

Another Round of Severe Storms Friday 

William Maxham 

January 11, 2024 

Damaging Winds & Flash Flooding Possible 

SC News 

South Carolina lawmakers are considering whether nonbank lenders are violating fair trade laws 

Scott Morgan 

January 10, 2024 
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A bill filed by State Sen. Tom Davis (R-Beaufort) forgoes the effort to set a rate cap in favor of 
outlawing marketing tactics used by installment lenders. 

LISTEN • 8:03 

SC News 

Spartanburg Coroner releases names of man and woman found in home with 1,000 degree furnace 

Scott Morgan 

January 9, 2024 

According to officials, the furnace in the basement of a city home was so hot, crews thought the 
basement was on fire. 

LISTEN • 0:45 

Weather 

Tornado Watch Until 6 PM 

William Maxham 

January 9, 2024 

Severe storms with damaging winds & tornadoes possible 

SC News 

Severe storms expected across the state Tuesday 

William Maxham 

January 8, 2024 

The areas of greatest concern for severe thunderstorms are the Lowcountry, Pee Dee and much of 
the Midlands, including Columbia, where the Storm Prediction Center places an ENHANCED risk 
of severe weather, a level 3 out of 5. 

SC News 

Alex Murdaugh's fight for a new trial will be televised this month 

Victoria Hansen 

January 5, 2024 
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Alex Murdaugh's defense team and the state submit briefs to the state Supreme Court this week as a 
new judge prepares to consider granting the convicted murderer a new trial because of jury 
tampering allegations. 

SC News 

Heavy rain across state tomorrow night into Saturday, chance for ice at highest elevations 

Megan Borowski 

January 4, 2024 

A strong storm system will be sweeping through a large part of the country this weekend. 

SC News 

Anderson County announces opioid settlement spending 

Scott Morgan 

January 2, 2024 

The county plans to allot more than $418,000 to a suite of drug education and treatment programs. 

LISTEN • 0:46 
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South Carolina Business Review 

WLTR/WSCI/WEPR/WRJA/WJWJ/WLJK/WHMC/WNSC 

@ 7:51 a.m., Monday thru Friday 

All shows 5:50 in length 

Shows listed in reversed order. 

 

Business 

New SC student loan program available 

Mike Switzer 

March 29, 2024 

A South Carolina nonprofit is launching a new program to help with student loan repayment. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Nonprofits face unique challenges filling job vacancies 

Mike Switzer 

March 28, 2024 

The labor market has been tight for some time now and our next guest says it has become very 
challenging for nonprofit organizations. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Targeting locomotives for emissions reductions 

Mike Switzer 

March 27, 2024 

The transportation industry continues to be the target for reducing the effects of climate change. 
Our next guest says that if the railroads want to eliminate their carbon footprint, they must 
decarbonize line haul locomotives. 
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LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Another Bitcoin bubble? 

Mike Switzer 

March 26, 2024 

Many exchange-traded funds (ETFs) are being assembled right now to invest in crypto, which, of 
course, increases demand. Could there be another major crypto bubble? 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

News Update from SCBiznews’ Jason Thomas 

Mike Switzer 

March 25, 2024 

An update of the news, events and issues that are trending right now across South Carolina's 
business community. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Large, valuable property recently conserved in SC 

Mike Switzer 

March 22, 2024 

Once upon a time, a $35 million property, highly desirable for development, would have been out of 
reach for conservationists. But recently, our next guest’s organization was able to accomplish exactly 
that with the purchase of a 4400-acre property on deep water along I-95 in our state. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Scout Motors breaks ground, on track for EV production 

Mike Switzer 

March 21, 2024 
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One of the largest manufacturing plants to be built in our state recently held their groundbreaking 
ceremony in the Midlands and we have their top local representative on the phone to tell us more. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

The debt collection industry in SC 

Mike Switzer 

March 20, 2024 

Debt collection companies oftentimes don’t have good reputations. But they do provide a necessary 
service or they wouldn’t exist. Sometimes, a company needs help collecting bad debts and 
sometimes the person or company owing the debt needs an affordable payment solution. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Post-divorce women face many financial challenges 

Mike Switzer 

March 19, 2024 

Most estimates show that a woman’s income is cut by 40% after divorce. Most studies also show 
that women are less likely to feel confident about investing than their male counter-parts and 
especially in the South where they are traditionally not the primary breadwinner. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

AI seen as major influence in SC industry 

Mike Switzer 

March 18, 2024 

Mike Switzer interviews John Warner, a serial entrepreneur and founder of Innoventure in 
Greenville, S.C. John talks about how he sees AI affecting business and industry in our state. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

USC law school adds focus on family and small business law 
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Mike Switzer 

March 15, 2024 

Mike Switzer interviews Benjamin Means, the John T. Campbell Chair in Business and Professional 
Ethics and director of the Family and Small Business Program at the Joseph F. Rice School of Law 
at the University of South Carolina in Columbia, S.C. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Women’s professional tennis adds to SC economy 

Mike Switzer 

March 14, 2024 

Mike Switzer interviews Bob Moran, tournament director of the Credit One Charleston Open 
coming March 30th through April 7th to Daniel Island, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Upstate software for builders recognized for technology integration 

Mike Switzer 

March 13, 2024 

Effective coordination and communication need to take place between general contractors, 
subcontractors, suppliers, and of course, the customer. Our next guest’s Upstate company came up 
with a software solution to do just that. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Investing in AI 

Mike Switzer 

March 12, 2024 

Is A.I. a good place to invest? While it has great promise, it also comes with great uncertainty. 

LISTEN • 5:49 
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Business 

Celebrating women in business in SC 

Mike Switzer 

March 11, 2024 

Mike Switzer interviews Alan Cooper, founder and editor of three online business news websites in 
South Carolina, who shares commentary for Women’s History Month regarding women and their 
career stories in S.C. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Raising awareness of brain injuries 

Mike Switzer 

March 8, 2024 

In case you didn’t know, March is Brain Injury Awareness Month. Our next guest’s organization is 
working to raise awareness about brain injuries and their impact on individuals and their careers and 
their communities. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Propeller company recognized by Innovision 

Mike Switzer 

March 7, 2024 

Our next guest says that practically all boats and ships use a 200-year-old technology when it comes 
to their propellers and that he has discovered a better way. And he appears to be proving it as our 
state’s Innovision Awards program recently recognized his company as a finalist in their small 
business category. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Winemaking in the South 

Mike Switzer 
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March 6, 2024 

While our state is not known for its wine, we are home to about a dozen wineries. One is run by our 
next guest and his wife, and their Upstate winery has been growing and expanding since the early 
days of the pandemic. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

SC labor market stays strong 

Mike Switzer 

March 5, 2024 

The talk of an economic slowdown or even recession seems to have abated for now, especially since 
the labor market continues to stay strong. So what is going on in employment these days? Will wages 
keep rising? Will the unemployment rate move higher? 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

USC names new director of economic development 

Mike Switzer 

March 4, 2024 

Mike Switzer interviews John Warner, a serial entrepreneur and founder of Innoventure in 
Greenville, S.C. John talks about USC’s new director of economic development, Stephen Cutler. 

LISTEN • 5:50 

Business 

SC Black farm invited to national agriculture cohort 

Mike Switzer 

March 1, 2024 

The National Minority Supplier Development Council (NMSDC) recently announced the formation 
of their latest cohort in their Acres program: Cultivating Equity in Black Agriculture, which trains 
and certifies Black farmers and ranchers as diverse suppliers, helping them access new markets. 

LISTEN • 5:49 
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Business 

SC oyster farm spurring growth in industry 

Mike Switzer 

February 29, 2024 

A local oyster farm is making a lot of headway in the industry through the relatively new practice of 
growing oysters in floating cages. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Lending resources for Black and low income entrepreneurs in SC 

Mike Switzer 

February 28, 2024 

Not all banks are willing to take the risks of making small business loans in economically depressed 
areas or to low-income entrepreneurs. Which is one reason our next guest’s nonprofit financial 
institution exists. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Do election years matter to investors? 

Mike Switzer 

February 27, 2024 

The latest numbers show that for the eight months leading up to elections, the S&P 500 has gone up 
almost 10% on average. Here's what one of our resident financial advisors has to say about those 
numbers. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

SC Business News Update from SCBiznews 

Mike Switzer 

February 26, 2024 
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An update of the news, events and issues that are trending right now across South Carolina's 
business community. Mike Switzer interviews Jason Thomas, executive editor of SCBizNews, the 
company that publishes the Columbia Regional Business Report, Charleston Regional Business 
Journal, GSA Business and SCBizNews magazine. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Hiring more women in SC manufacturing 

Mike Switzer 

February 23, 2024 

With the low unemployment rate continuing across our state, employers are becoming more and 
more competitive in their hiring and as a result, pressure is building at staffing agencies. Our next 
guest says that one answer may be an effort to place more women in manufacturing jobs 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Cervical imaging technology wins award 

Mike Switzer 

February 22, 2024 

S.C. company developing imaging technology for early-stage detection and analysis of cervical 
cancer earns InnoVision's Technology Development Award. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Are EVs really that environmentally friendly? 

Mike Switzer 

February 21, 2024 

With the electric vehicle industry set to become a big player in our state’s economy over the next 
few years, we thought it might be a good idea to check in with someone who has been involved in 
the EV world for many years. 

LISTEN • 5:49 
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Business 

Investing with the markets at all-time highs 

Mike Switzer 

February 20, 2024 

When the stock market is making all-time highs, the question on many investors’ minds is “Is now a 
good time to buy stocks?” Our next guest says that that is actually not the right question to ask. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Advanced optical medical technology available in SC 

Mike Switzer 

February 19, 2024 

Mike Switzer interviews John Warner, a serial entrepreneur and founder of Innoventure in 
Greenville, S.C. John shares his personal experience recently with medical technology in our state. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Alzheimer’s research initiative announced in SC 

Mike Switzer 

February 16, 2024 

For five decades now, our next guest’s organization has been pioneering medical genetics across not 
only our state, but the nation, as well. Last month, they kicked off their latest initiative, a major 
effort in Alzheimer's research. Mike Switzer interviews Dr. Steve Skinner, director of the 
Greenwood Genetics Center in Greenwood, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Advancing economic and financial literacy education in SC 

Mike Switzer 

February 15, 2024 
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You would think that in today’s world of the Internet (what we used to call the Information 
Superhighway), most people would be fairly knowledgeable about finances. But our next guest says 
there is still plenty of work to do. Mike Switzer interviews Chandler Jordan, the new executive 
director of the SC Council on Economic Education in Columbia, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Nonprofit summit coming to SC Feb 21-23 

Mike Switzer 

February 14, 2024 

Our next guest says that while our state’s recent economic growth and prosperity has grown it has 
also further increased existing disparities in our communities. Which is something their latest 
summit will be addressing. Mike Switzer interviews Dr. Shawn Edwards, the board chair at 
TogetherSC, host of the upcoming SC Nonprofit Summit, Feb 21-23 in Charleston, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Are equity-indexed annuities a good investment? 

Mike Switzer 

February 13, 2024 

Satire is defined as a genre of the arts in which abuses and shortcomings are held up to ridicule, 
often with the intent that some improvement would result. Our next guest hopes to provide us with 
a little satire today of what he sees as a popular fad in the financial services industry. And he’s 
hoping you will find the satire useful. Mike Switzer interviews Rick Van Der Noord, a certified 
financial planner in Greenville SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Rebranding SC as innovation HQ 

Mike Switzer 

February 12, 2024 

Our state’s leading economic development agency recently unveiled a new slogan and long-term 
plan that includes targeting sectors like advanced energy, electric vehicles, and life sciences for 
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further development. Mike Switzer interviews Harry Lightsey, secretary of the South Carolina 
Department of Commerce in Columbia, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Popular SC film festival returns Feb. 20-25 

Mike Switzer 

February 9, 2024 

Our state’s tourism industry continues to grow, and our next guest’s annual event continues to add 
to that growth. In fact, MovieMaker magazine recently named it as one of the best film festival 
destinations in the country. Mike Switzer interviews Ron Tucker, director of the Beaufort 
International Film Festival in Beaufort, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

SC sorghum seed company wins technology sustainability award 

Mike Switzer 

February 8, 2024 

From Pennsylvania to Mississippi, our next guest’s South Carolina agricultural technology 
company’s seeds are being planted, helping improve the profitability of local farms while reducing 
the carbon intensity of food and feed production. And this technology recently earned them the 
2023 Innovision Sustainability award. Mike Switzer interviews Zach Brenton, founder of Carolina 
Seed Systems in Florence, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Wildlife event returns to Charleston for 41st year 

Mike Switzer 

February 7, 2024 

Since 1983, our next guest’s nonprofit has been involved in furthering wildlife conservation and 
education in our region of the country with several programs throughout the year. The main event is 
coming soon to the Lowcountry and bringing with it a nice boost to the local economy. Mike 
Switzer interviews John Powell, president and CEO of the Southeastern Wildlife Exposition coming 
to Charleston Feb. 16-18. 
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LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Figuring out market movements in 2024 

Mike Switzer 

February 6, 2024 

Well, here we are, one month into a new year already, and investors are still confused about the 
financial markets. For a while, it looked like the tech bubble was over and that bonds were looking 
good again. But now, not many are sure. So we’ve asked one of our resident financial analysts to 
offer his take. Mike Switzer interviews Tyson Halsey, a chartered financial analyst with Income 
Growth Advisors in Daniel Island, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

BMW bringing new robots to SC facility 

Mike Switzer 

February 5, 2024 

Mike Switzer interviews John Warner, a serial entrepreneur and founder of Innoventure in 
Greenville, S.C. John tells us about BMW employing humanoid robots in their Spartanburg County 
plant. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

“Tired of lugging luggage” spawns new business 

Mike Switzer 

February 2, 2024 

Have you ever found yourself needing to check out of your hotel many hours before your flight and 
wondering what to do about your luggage while you got out and enjoyed the local sights one last 
time? Our next guest has and she decided to do something about it by forming her own luggage 
logistics service. And it was recently recognized with the 2023 InnoVision Small Business Award. 
Mike Switzer interviews Amanda Sheridan, founder and CEO of Charleston Bag Valet in 
Charleston, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 
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Business 

“Glass bubble” pills may replace injections 

Mike Switzer 

February 1, 2024 

If your doctor told you that the shot, he has been giving you is now available to be taken orally 
through tiny glass bubbles, would you give it a try? Well, it is actually a groundbreaking innovation 
pioneered by a South Carolina start-up biotech company that has earned an endorsement from the 
US National Science Foundation and the 2023 InnoVision Technology Integration Award. Mike 
Switzer interviews George Weeks, chief technology officer with SpheroFill in Aiken, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Small business lending hot in the Upstate 

Mike Switzer 

January 31, 2024 

The US Small Business Administration facilitates a lot of small business loans all across the country. 
A small Upstate bank actually broke into the top 25 list of SBA lenders last year with more than 
$177 million in SBA loans. That’s out of more than 1,500 banks nationwide. Mike Switzer interviews 
Beth Hallock, president of SBA lending at United Community Bank in Greenville, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

The uncertain business of economic forecasting 

Mike Switzer 

January 30, 2024 

It’s early in the year still, but as was the case last year, economic forecasts continue to be upended. 
The latest example just recently when a national jobs report came in stronger than expected and 
dampened prospects for interest rate cuts. Today we’ll check in with one of our resident economists 
to get his take. Mike Switzer interviews Frank Hefner, director of the Office of Economic Analysis 
and a professor of economics at the College of Charleston. 

LISTEN • 5:49 
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Business 

SC Business News Update from SCBiznews 

Mike Switzer 

January 29, 2024 

An update of the news, events, and issues that are trending right now across South Carolina's 
business community. Mike Switzer interviews Jason Thomas, executive editor of SCBizNews, the 
company that publishes the Columbia Regional Business Report, Charleston Regional Business 
Journal, GSA Business and SCBizNews magazine. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

New music learning software company in Midlands earns award 

Mike Switzer 

January 26, 2024 

For decades, there has been software available to help you learn to play musical instruments. Our 
next guest says they have now been able to incorporate machine learning into their gaming-style 
music learning software that is increasing the likelihood of students continuing their lessons. And 
this technology recently earned them the 2023 InnoVision Education Award. Mike Switzer 
interviews Mak Grgic, co-founder of Notey, Inc. in Cayce, SC. YouTube video of awards 
presentation - Notey presentation starts at 19:15 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

SC has new jobs financing chief 

Mike Switzer 

January 25, 2024 

We recently learned that one of our state agencies involved in job creation and retention has a new 
leader. Today, we have him on the phone. Mike Switzer interviews Jesse Smith, the new executive 
director of the South Carolina Jobs-Economic Development Authority (JEDA) in Columbia, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 
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Business 

German-American Business Summit coming soon 

Mike Switzer 

January 24, 2024 

With so many German businesses located in our state, it only makes sense that someone should host 
a conference focused on growing that relationship. And that’s exactly what our next guest’s 
institution has been doing for several years now. Mike Switzer interviews Paul Schwager, dean of the 
School of Business at the College of Charleston, host of the German American Business Summit on 
Feb. 7th. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Capitalizing on the 0% capital gains tax rate 

Mike Switzer 

January 23, 2024 

If you’ve been investing in the financial markets for a long time, you could have a portfolio that has 
grown significantly in value. Which could present a tax problem. Our next guest says there is a way 
to avoid some of these capital gains and it involves tax planning across generations. Mike Switzer 
interviews Stephen Maggard, a certified financial planner with Abacus Planning Group in Columbia, 
SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

SC smart innovation report released 

Mike Switzer 

January 22, 2024 

Mike Switzer interviews John Warner, a serial entrepreneur and founder of Innoventure in 
Greenville, S.C. John tells us about a smart innovation report for SC that he has compiled. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Addressing climate change at the local level 
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Mike Switzer 

January 19, 2024 

You may remember that late last year the United Nations held its annual climate conference, 
COP28, in Dubai, where world leaders addressed climate change and environmental challenges. Also 
attending that conference were 151 mayors from around the world including our next guest. Mike 
Switzer interviews Daniel Rickenmann, mayor of Columbia, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Nature Conservancy partners with City of Charleston, SC 

Mike Switzer 

January 18, 2024 

Our state has been blessed for many years now with a robust economy. We’ve weathered a financial 
crisis, a 1,000-year flood, and a pandemic. But can we weather the weather? One of our major cities 
is taking part in a nature-based program to improve and strengthen its level of resilience. Mike 
Switzer interviews Dale Morris, chief resilience officer for the City of Charleston, SC. Nature Based 
Exchange 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Entrepreneurial funding available through local accelerator program 

Mike Switzer 

January 17, 2024 

Entrepreneurial resources in our state continue to expand. Our next guest’s accelerator, for example, 
is looking for applicants from around South Carolina for its next spring cohort. Their goal, in 
particular, is to address the gap in venture capital access for women, minority, veteran, and other 
underfunded demographics. Mike Switzer interviews Millicent Lann, program director at the 
Benedict College Statewide Investment Accelerator, part of the Tyrone Adam Burroughs School of 
Business and Entrepreneurship. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Bitcoin and the blockchain 
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Mike Switzer 

January 16, 2024 

With Bitcoin all over the news lately, we thought it might be worthwhile to dig a little deeper into 
blockchain technology, how it works exactly, and what is the role of Bitcoin in a blockchain anyway? 
Mike Switzer interviews Ashton Lawrence, a certified financial planner with Mariner Wealth 
Advisors in Greenville, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Three SC organizations lauded for their SC improvement efforts 

Mike Switzer 

January 15, 2024 

Mike Switzer interviews Alan Cooper, founder and editor of three online business news websites in 
South Carolina: MidlandsBiz, UpstateBizSC, and LowCountryBizSC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Upstate SC Internet company recognized for community service 

Mike Switzer 

January 12, 2024 

InnoVision Awards is a nonprofit organization dedicated to the advancement of innovation and 
technology in our state. And each year, as their name implies, they recognize companies, 
organizations, and individuals toward that end. 2023’s Community Service Award was recently 
announced, and our next Internet solutions company was the recipient. Mike Switzer interviews 
Kent Winrich, chief technology officer with Open Broadband in Greenville, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Real estate photo editing software solution excites investors 

Mike Switzer 

January 11, 2024 
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I didn’t know this but apparently, photographers and videographers in the real estate industry have a 
hard time finding skilled editors to help them improve the quality of their photos and videos. So our 
next guest’s company created a software solution that resulted in an investment of a quarter million 
dollars from SC Launch. Mike Switzer interviews Moses Nickerson, co-founder and CEO of 
Pixlmob in Greenville, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Vertical farming arrives at SC prison 

Mike Switzer 

January 10, 2024 

We’ve interviewed a few companies over the years in the vertical farming industry, also known as 
CEA or controlled environment agriculture, which usually involves growing plants (mostly greens) 
in a controlled indoor environment. We recently learned that our next guest’s company was selected 
to install a vertical farm at a local prison, the first time this has been done onsite at a correctional 
institution in the U.S. Mike Switzer interviews Don Taylor, founder and CEO of AmplifiedAG in 
Charleston, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Lowering the stress of navigating financial markets 

Mike Switzer 

January 9, 2024 

As we start a new year, it’s natural to have concerns about whether the financial decisions you made 
last year or will be making this year, are the best ones for you and your family. Especially when stock 
and bond market environments like we’ve seen the last couple of years happen, which can shake the 
confidence of even the most seasoned investors. Our next guest has some suggestions for us on 
how to be more confident in financial decision-making. Mike Switzer interviews David Turner, a 
certified financial planner in Greenville, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Artificial intelligence making waves in SC industry 

Mike Switzer 

https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/business
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/show/south-carolina-business-review/2024-01-10/indoor-greenhouses-arrive-at-sc-prison
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/people/mike-switzer
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/business
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/show/south-carolina-business-review/2024-01-09/lowering-the-stress-of-navigating-financial-markets
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/people/mike-switzer
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/business
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/show/south-carolina-business-review/2024-01-08/artificial-intelligence-making-waves-in-sc-industry
https://www.southcarolinapublicradio.org/people/mike-switzer


January 8, 2024 

Mike Switzer interviews John Warner, a serial entrepreneur and founder of Innoventure in 
Greenville, S.C. John tells us about AI’s presence in industry in our state. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Historic preservation shaping residential design 

Mike Switzer 

January 5, 2024 

Thanks to many old, empty, commercial buildings and tax credits, historic preservation continues to 
be a significant part of local economic development. Our next guest says that this preservation work 
is also starting to influence residential design. Mike Switzer interviews Dale Marshall, president of 
Architrave in Columbia, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Increasing revenue from existing customers 

Mike Switzer 

January 4, 2024 

Another new year is underway and many salespeople are putting into action their plan for growing 
sales in this new year. Our next guest is a 20-year sales veteran who says that growing the revenue 
from your existing customers can be as important as prospecting. Mike Switzer interviews Jermaine 
Edwards, a business growth consultant in Columbia, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Charleston marketing company named best place to work 

Mike Switzer 

January 3, 2024 

We interview companies in our state each year who have been recognized by one publication or 
another as a best place to work. But I believe this is the first time we’ve seen one receive this award 
from an outdoor lifestyle magazine, and for a company that is not even in that line of work. Mike 
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Switzer interviews Lee Deas, founder of Obviouslee, a global marketing company in Charleston, SC, 
recently recognized as a "Best Place to Work" by Outside Magazine, coming in at #20 out of more 
than 50 companies nationwide. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

Planning for a better year financially 

Mike Switzer 

January 2, 2024 

Now that we’re into a brand new year, many people begin to think about getting their financial 
house in order so today we have one of our resident certified financial planners with us to help. 
Mike Switzer interviews John Cooper with Greenwood Capital in Greenwood, SC. 

LISTEN • 5:49 

Business 

2023 USC Economic Outlook Conference - Excerpt 10 

Mike Switzer 

January 1, 2024 

Today is our final excerpt from the most recent University of South Carolina Darla Moore School of 
Business Economic Outlook Conference. Today’s excerpt comes from South Carolina 
Representative Gary S. Brewer Jr., during the panel discussion on the coming infrastructure 
expansion and its role in South Carolina's long-run economic competitiveness. 
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Health Focus 

WRJA/WJWJ/WLJK/WHMC/WNSC/WLTR/WEPR/WSCI 

Mondays 6:45 a.m., 8:45 a.m., Tuesdays 1:33 p.m., Wednesdays 9:30 a.m. 
(WNSC-FM, WRJA-FM, WJWJ-FM, WHMC-FM, WLJK-FM) 2:30 p.m. 

(WEPR-FM, WSCI-FM, WLTR-FM), Thursdays 5:44 p.m.; Saturdays 8:35 
a.m., Sundays 5:35 p.m. 

Shows listed in reverse play order. 

All shows 4:00 (Four Minutes) in length. 

Healthcare 

Optimizing sleep provides important health benefits 

Bobbi Conner 

March 26, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Andrea Rinn about optimizing sleep to reap important 
health benefits. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Pain management research involving wearable technology 

Bobbi Conner 

, March 25, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Bashar Badran about research to determine the effectiveness 
of using non-invasive wearable technology to help with pain management. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Vestibular migraines 

Bobbi Conner 

March 19, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Habib Rizk about vestibular migraines. 
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LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Lifestyle changes to help lose weight and keep the weight off 

Bobbi Conner 

March 18, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Patrick O’Neil about lifestyle changes that can help lose 
weight and keep the weight off. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Understanding behavioral symptoms of dementia 

Bobbi Conner 

March 12, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Randi Curtiss about behavioral symptoms of dementia. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Saying Yes to treatment for mental health conditions 

Bobbi Conner 

March 11, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Tracy Stecker about helping individuals say yes to treatment 
for mental health issues. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Common medications that may cause symptoms of memory problems 

Bobbi Conner 

March 5, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Amy Hebbard about certain medications that may cause 
symptoms of memory problems, especially in older adults. 
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LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

High blood pressure and heart health 

Bobbi Conner 

March 4, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Christine Holmstedt about high blood pressure and heart 
health. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Managing stress after diagnosis of a chronic health condition 

Bobbi Conner 

February 27, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Wendy Balliet about managing stress after diagnosis of a 
chronic health condition. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Cognitive behavioral therapy for children with anxiety disorders 

Bobbi Conner 

February 26, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Ashley Early about cognitive behavioral therapy for children 
with anxiety disorders. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Rare diseases in SC 

Bobbi Conner 

February 20, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Patrick Flume about rare diseases in S.C. 
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LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Health benefits of taking a brief walk after eating 

Bobbi Conner 

February 19, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Aundrea Loftley about the health benefits of taking a brief 
walk after eating. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Exercise in neuro-recovery following a stroke 

Bobbi Conner 

February 13, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Chris Gregory about the benefits of exercise in neuro-
recovery, following a stroke. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Alcohol & heart health 

Bobbi Conner 

February 12, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Ashley Waring about the latest research about alcohol 
consumption and heart health. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Healthy routines and habits to help prevent depression 

Bobbi Conner 

February 6, 2024 
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This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Christopher Pelic about healthy routines and habits to help 
prevent depression. Dr. Pelic is a Professor of Psychiatry, and he’s the lead physician at MUSC’s 
Health, Wellness and Human Performance Institute at MUSC. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Fever in newborns and infants 

Bobbi Conner 

February 5, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Ian Kane about the importance of seeking immediate 
medical care for newborn babies and infants younger than two months who develop a fever. Dr. 
Kane is an Associate Professor of Pediatrics and a pediatric emergency physician at MUSC Shawn 
Jenkins Children’s Hospital. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Lifestyle routines to help manage osteoarthritis 

Bobbi Conner 

January 30, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Shelli Dills about lifestyle choices and routines that can help 
manage osteoarthritis. Dr. Dills is an Assistant Professor in the Department of Orthopaedics and 
Physical Medicine and she’s a non-surgical orthopaedic and sports medicine physician at MUSC. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

ECHO research study about child health & development 

Bobbi Conner 

January 29, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Melinda Jarnecke about MUSC’s role in a national research 
initiative to study environmental exposures early in life, that may affect children’s health and 
development in the long term. Melinda is the ECHO Program Manager in the Department of Public 
health Sciences at MUSC. 
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LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Thyroid cancer 

Bobbi Conner 

January 23, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Jyotika Fernandes about thyroid cancer. Dr. Fernandes is a 
Professor of Endocrinology and Director of the Endocrine Tumor Clinic at Hollings Cancer Center 
at MUSC. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Managing atrial fibrillation in the first year after diagnosis 

Bobbi Conner 

January 22, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Anne Kroman about managing and adjusting to atrial 
fibrillation in the first year after diagnosis. Dr. Kroman is an Assistant Professor in the College of 
Medicine and she’s a cardiac electrophysiologist at MUSC. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Penicillin allergy testing during pregnancy 

Bobbi Conner 

January 16, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Emily Campbell about penicillin allergy testing during 
pregnancy. Dr. Campbell is an Assistant Professor of Pediatrics who specializes in allergies and 
immunology at MUSC Children’s Health. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Age-related hearing loss & hearing aids 

Bobbi Conner 
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January 15, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Hannah Burrick about age-related hearing loss and hearing 
aids. Dr. Burrick is a Clinical Instructor of Audiology and an audiologist who specializes in adult and 
geriatric hearing loss and hearing aids at MUSC. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Hereditary cancer and genetic testing 

Bobbi Conner 

, January 9, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Kevin Hughes about hereditary cancer and genetic testing. 
Dr. Hughes is Director of Cancer Genetics at Hollings Cancer Center at MUSC. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

Heart health for women 

Bobbi Conner 

January 8, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Ashley Waring about heart health for women. Dr. Waring is 
an Assistant Professor in the College of Medicine and she’s a cardiologist with a focus on 
cardiovascular disease prevention at MUSC. 

LISTEN • 3:58 

Healthcare 

ADHD in young children 

Bobbi Conner 

January 2, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Dr. Kasey Hamlin-Smith about ADHD in young children. Dr. 
Hamlin-Smith is a psychologist and Associate Professor of Developmental-Behavioral Pediatrics at 
MUSC. 

LISTEN • 3:58 
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Healthcare 

Diabetes prevention 

Bobbi Conner 

January 1, 2024 

This week Bobbi Conner talks with Leah Hopkins about diabetes prevention. Leah is a Nurse 
Practitioner specializing in diabetes management and the Lead Clinician of the WADE program 
focused on diabetes prevention and weight management at MUSC. 

LISTEN • 3:58 
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