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Community / Culture

/ Family
Strengthening

Jan Stork from Make-A-Wish Foundation co-hosted the hour on
Happi 92.7 discussing what the organization does for the
community.

4/11/22 8:00 AM 1 hour total

Community / Culture
/ Family

Strengthening

Jan Stork and Courtney Nientimp from Make a Wish Foundation
promoted their future Wish events

4/28/22 8:40 AM 10 minutes

Community / Culture
/ Family

Strengthening

The band First To Eleven were in the studio promoting the Mutt
Gala Fundraiser for the Humane Society.

4/29/22 8:30 AM 15 minutes

Community / Culture
/ Family

Strengthening

Interview with Emily Smicker from Erie Zoo, promoting their Mane
Event, their biggest single day fundraiser planned for June 25.

6/21/22 8:40 AM 6 minutes

Community / Culture
/ Family

Strengthening

Interview with Aaron Lonki from the City of Erie, about Celebrate
Erie, an annual community day.

6/22/22 8:40 AM 6 minutes

Community / Culture
/ Family

Strengthening

Gloria Knox, founding partner of Perry Square Alliance, was a guest
on Insider to talk about this 501C3 organization she began that has
as its purpose contributing to downtown Erie by maintaining and
improving its downtown gemstone, Perry Square itself.

6/26/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes

Economy / Finance

Insider guest President and CEO of Erie's largest employer, Erie
Insurance, Tim Necastro, talked about the process of moving into
the new Thomas B. Hagen building, as well as Erie Insurance's
investments in downtown Erie, including the Children's Museum,
renovations of Perry Square buildings, upgrades in Richford Arms,
the new building at 5th and State, and so many other projects that
are part of the Erie Refocused plan.

4/3/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes

Economy / Finance

VisitErie President and CEO John Oliver was a guest on Insider to
talk about its new marketing plan "Make your Escape" to bring
more visitors to Erie this summer and all year round.  He also talked
about the new attractions…climbing gym, expanded Children's
Museum, More activity on the waterfront with rooftop spots.

5/15/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes

Economy / Finance

Bill Gloekler and Michael Sullivan were guests on Insider…they are
part of a group in Erie formed to try and help steer some of the
thinking and planning for how to regulate short term rentals like
AIR BNB and VRBO.

6/5/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes

Economy / Finance

Brian Slawn, Director at  Ben Franklin Technology Partners, and
Jordan Fuller of the Erie Regional Chamber and Growth
Partnership, were guests on Insider.  They gave updates on the
region's Entrepreneurial Ecosystem.

6/12/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes

Education

Guests on Insider Billy Sabatini, Captain of the Brig Niagara, and
Rebecca Grimaldi, Director of Development for the Flagship Tall
Ships Erie, talked about the educational mission of the Brig Niagara,
the Mariners' Ball fundraiser, and the Tall Ships Festival that will
return to Erie in August.

5/8/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes

Education
Olivia Wickline from Erie Children's Museum was in the studio to
discuss upcoming educational opportunities for children.

6/6/22 8:00 AM 1 hour total

Education

The Pennsylvania State System of Higher Education, our workforce
needs, and the need to keep the cost  of education affordable for
low and middle income families was the topic addressed by Insider
guest Chancellor Daniel Greestein, responsible for 14 higher
education campuses across the state.

6/19/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes



Education
Kate Phillips, board member of the Iroquois School District, was a
guest on-air to talk about the Food Truck Festival, raising money for
the Iroquois School District Foundation

6/24/22 8:40 AM 6 minutes

Health Concerns
Boo Hagerty of the Hamot Health Foundation was a guest on Happi
to talk about the Seeds of Hope Luncheon and how it helps
promote wellness to the community.

4/21/22 8:40 AM 6 minutes

Health Concerns

Amanda Monocello, a behavioral health clinician with AHN
Behavioral Health, specializing in perinatal and postpartum mood
and anxiety disorders, was a guest on Insider.  She talked about
how to recognize symptoms of these disorders, and how to access
the help that has become available locally.

5/1/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes

Health Concerns
Randy Newport of the Women's Care Center was interviewed
regarding the Center's Walk for Life on May 21.

5/19/22 8:40 AM 6 minutes

Health Concerns

Insider guest Gina R.l Klofft, division director for the American
Heart Association in Erie, Crawford, and Warren counties talked
about the many aspects of heart and brain health, especially during
the time of Covid.  Volunteerism, Fund Raising for Research, and
Education were the key areas she touched on during the interview.

5/29/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes

Health Concerns
AJ Moore from Lake Erie Speedway was in the studio to talk about
their Wine, Brew, Spirits, and Food Truck Fest planned for July
30th, with proceeds benefiting the Autism Society of PA.

6/24/22 6:15 AM 6 minutes

Health Concerns
Blood Bank Executive Director Deana Rosen;than was interviewed
on the importance of giving blood.

6/30/22 8:40 AM 6 minutes

Pet Care and
Protection

Happi held a Bianchi Honda remote broadcast with the Erie
Humane Society, discussing adoptable animals at the shelter.

4/22/22 12:00 PM 2 hours

Pet Care and
Protection

Nicole Leone, Executive Director of Erie Humane Society, co-hosted
an hour of Happi, discussing the EHS mission and promoting their
fundraiser, the Mutt Gala.

4/25/22 8:00 AM 1 hour total

Pet Care and
Protection

Representatives from Erie Humane Society are regular guests on
the morning show for Wet Nose Wednesdays to talk about pet care
and pet adoption, featuring one of their rescued animals.

4/6
4/20
4/27
5/4

5/11
5/18
6/1

6/15
6/22
6/29

7:50 AM
5 minutes each

time

Public Education/
Government

Rachel Knapp, ENN Washington reporter, was interviewed about
the Ukraine situation and how ordinary citizens can help.

4/8/22 8:40 AM 7 minutes

Public Education/
Government

ENN Washington Correspondent Rachel Knapp, on assignment in
Poland, was interviewed from Poland on Insider, sharing how she
partnered with local business Logistics Plus to get an onsite
experience of the Ukrainian refugees fleeing to Poland.  She spoke
of her first hand experiences and her impressions of what the
chaos war and flight bring.

4/10/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes

Public Education/
Government

Insider guests Ken Sturm and Doug Roxberry talked about Nation of
Patriots' national effort to pay tribute to all branches of the Armed
Forces, Patriot Tour.  They talked about how the motorcycle
community became involved with this annual national event, and
how viewers can participate or donate to a fund for needy
veterans.

4/17/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes
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Public Education/
Government

Guests on Insider were Mike Ruzzi who has been sharing veterans'
stories and coordinating preparations for the Wall That Heals for
months, retired Major General Mike Dunlavy, US Army, and retired
Major Loe Pfadt, Army National Guard and committee member for
the Wall That Heals.  They discussed the aftermath of the VietNam
War and how the vets were neglected and disrespected when they
returned home.  They talked about the healing that is even yet
going on and will be carried on further with this Memorial Day
Weekend observances, and especially the tribute that the Wall That
Heals brings to our community.

5/22/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes

Public Education/
Government

Mike Ruzzi of Erie News Now was in the studio discussing the Wall
that Heals, the Viet Nam Memorial that will be brought to Erie on
Memorial Day weekend.

5/2/2022
5/24/2022

8:00 AM
8:00 AM

1 hour each time

Safety Concerns

Brian Polito, Erie Public Schools Superintendent, and Daryl Craig,
leader of the Blue Coats Community Group were guests on Insider.
Their interview was spurred in part by the recent shooting at Erie
High.  They discussed the measures that have been taken and are
underway to ensure a safe learning environment for all the children
of Erie.

4/24/22 6:00 AM 30 minutes
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