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KYSR provides its listeners with programming and public service announcements 

that address issues of concern to our local community. Among the issues 

determined to be of most concern to the community during the preceding 

calendar quarter were:  

• Animal Care: Mercy for Animals works to create a society where all 

animals are treated with compassion and respect. They serve as a voice 

for animals through proactive consumer education initiatives, cruelty 

investigations, corporate outreach and legal advocacy. Since founding 

MFA over a decade ago, the organization has grown into a leading 

national force in the prevention of cruelty to famed animals and 

promotion of compassionate food choices and policies. 

MercyForAnimals.org  

  

• Arts : Since 2011, 11:11 ACC has produced the Canoga Park Art Walk 

which brings over 200 artists, artisans, musicians and performers into 

the streets of Downtown Canoga Park. The artwalk season begins May 2015 

and is held on the Third Thursday of each month, June through 

September. A Creative Collective focuses on encouraging collaboration 

between artists and their community including public art festivals, 

creative based workshops, youth oriented programming, mentorship and 

collaboration with public and private organizations and government and 

service based community organizations. Their next event is on March 7, 

it's a woodblock printmaking lecture and workshop. 

  

• Education: National organization that is all 529 savings plan that 

shares information. Website helps parents and students to plan ahead 

and learn how to save money for college. Student load debt is at the 

highest ever: 1 trillion dollars. 

  

• Education & Literacy: CyberPatriot is the National Youth Cyber 

Education Program. There are three main programs within CyberPatriot: 

the National Youth Cyber Defense Competition, AFA CyberCamps and the 

Elementary School Cyber Education Initiative. CyberPatriot was 

conceived by the Air Force Association (AFA) to inspire high school 

students toward careers in cybersecurity or other science, technology, 

engineering, and mathematics (STEM) disciplines critical to our 

nation's future. For more information, visit www.uscyberpatriot.org 

  

• Empowerment: The month of March is Women's History Month. Research 

underscores that women leaders who achieve high levels of success bring 

core strengths to bear in their leadership. But formidable barriers 

stand in the way of many women who desire to lead, not the least of 

which are personal courage, confidence and capacity. Women Up's Rising 



- Women Leaders program aims to reduce these barriers by providing 

promising women leaders training in transformation leadership. For more 

information, visit www.womenup.org  

  

• Event Fundraiser: This is IHop's 10th annual free pancakes fundraiser 

on National Pancake Day- March 3rd. Participating IHOP Restaurants plan 

to give away free pancakes from 7am to 10pm to celebrate this "Decade 

of Giving." Leading up to Pancake Day, IHOP has been selling "Miracle 

Balloons" for $1 and $5 to benefit Children's Miracle Network 

Hospitals. Their goal this year is to raise $3.5 million for charity. 

  

• Family & Social Impact: The Autism Movement therapy is Autism therapy 

through dance. The organization is focused on serving the autism 

community by supporting autism research. This is an interhemispheric 

sensory integration technique incorporating movement and music in 

collaboration with positive behavior support strategies to assist 

individuals with autism spectrum disorders in meeting and achieving 

their speech and language, social and academic IEP goals.  

  

• Family Impact: The Women Shelter of Long Beach a domestic violence 

agency in Long Beach that provides services to victims of domestic 

violence of any age. They service anyone who needs help, including 

people of the LGBT community. Teen Dating Violence Awareness Month is 

February and they're having their event on Friday, February 27th from 

6-9:30pm at the Art Exchange in Long Beach. WomenShelterLB.org  

  

• Global: Wells Bring Hope drills wells to bring safe water and 

sanitation to rural villages in West Africa. Only US based safe water 

system that educates women in microfinance. Can't read, write, count. 

They are now able to spend time to learn instead of walking to find 

water.  

  

• Health & Wellness: The Pediatrics Cancer Research Foundation's mission 

is to raise funds to improve the care and quality of life and survival 

rate of children with malignant diseases. One of their largest 

fundraisers of the year is their half marathon called "Reaching for the 

Cure". The event will be on March 28th and 29th in Irvine.  

  

• Health & Wellness & Fundraiser: This Tour de Pier is organized to raise 

funds for the cancer community. The Hirshberg Foundation for Pancreatic 

Cancer Research, The Uncle Kory Foundation and Cancer Support 

Community. The 3rd Annual Tour de Pier is a unique fundraising event 

that brings one of the hottest indoor fitness activities " stationary 

cycling " to the gorgeous outdoors of Manhattan Beach 5/17/15. Ride in 

place with an ocean view! 

  

• Health / Fundraiser: The Lazarex Cancer Foundation builds a bridge to 

hope, dignity, and life for cancer patients and their families. They 

provide assistance with costs for FDA clinical trial participation, 

identification of clinical trial options, community outreach and 

education. One man on a mission: Cycle 75 miles a day through 18 states 

for 3 1/2 months to raise funds and awareness in support of pancreatic 

cancer patients.  

  



• Humanity : Paul Avila and his son, Pauly, 18, who cannot see or talk, 

plan to distribute AM-FM headphones to the homeless on Skid Row this 

holiday season in honor of Pauly's love of music. Avila purchased about 

50 AM-FM headsets with his own money and passed them out over 

Thanksgiving break. Radio headsets because they do not require a person 

to download songs like a MP3 player would.  

  

• Military: Jersey Mike's Subs is working with Operation Gratitude, which 

is an organization that provides care packages to our service men and 

women all over the world. Customers can go into any Jersey Mike's store 

during the month of March to support Operation Gratitude. Operation 

Gratitude, visit www.operationgratitude.com  

  

• Music & Arts: Education Through Music is a non-profit organization that 

puts music back into disadvantaged schools as a part of the core 

curriculum for every child. They started in 2006 by serving two schools 

and 800 kids. This year is their ninth year where they are serving 16 

schools and over 7,000 children. Their mission is to insure that 

children can learn music as a part of their overall education. They 

work in schools all over the Los Angeles County. ETMLA.org  

  

• Youth Advocacy: Sticks N Stonz was created to empower kids in their 

ability to do what they love and not let bullying of any kind get in 

their way. It was created after Amanda saw her 9-year-old cry because a 

little league umpire said he lacks style on the baseball field, and 

then her son was continuously bullied on the baseball field.  

  

 

Section I  

LOCAL PROGRAMMING  

Section I lists regularly-scheduled and special programs that represent the 

station's issue-responsive programming providing the most significant 

treatment of the issues listed above for the calendar quarter.  

ISSUE  
PROGRAM 

/ TITLE 
DESCRIPTION  GUEST  DATE/TIME  DURATION  

Global  

Community 
Council - 
01/02/15 - 
01/05/15 Seg 
1  

Acres of Love is an organization 
that rescues kids in South Africa. 
They give kids who are orphaned 
or abandoned a family. In South 
Africa, there are about 3.8 million 
kids who are orphaned and 1 in 5 
kids are without a home. The 
founder of the organization lived in 
South Africa in 1999 and brought 
kids into their house to take care of 
kids. And now they have 27 
homes. For more information, 
people can visit 
www.acresoflove.org.  

Acres Of 
Love  

01/04/2015 
06:16 AM  

010:08 



ISSUE  
PROGRAM 

/ TITLE 
DESCRIPTION  GUEST  DATE/TIME  DURATION  

Empowerment  

Community 
Council - 
01/02/15 - 
01/05/15 Seg 
2  

Monica started volunteering for the 
LAPD when she was in high 
school and had the opportunity to 
speak to the community. She found 
a lot of people were worried about 
their kids being bullied. Speak Out 
Against Bullying started in 2011 by 
Monica who wanted to help kids 
who were being bullied. She visits 
different schools and talks to kids 
who are going through a hard time. 
Speak Out Against Bullying is on 
GoFundMe right now to raise 
money for a new computer  

Speak Out 
Against 
Bullying  

01/04/2015 
06:26 AM  

019:14 

Health & 
Wellness  

Community 
Council - 
01/02/15 - 
01/05/15 Seg 
3  

The Jessie Reese Foundation was 
started by Eric's daughter Jessie 
when she was fighting cancer. She 
had a burden for kids fighting 
cancer who couldn't leave the 
hospital. She was an outpatient but 
wanted to help the kids who 
couldn't go home. After Jessie 
passed away, Eric and his wife 
continue to deliver "joy jars" to 
kids in hospitals and put smiles on 
their faces. For more information, 
visit www.negu.org and they can 
also donate.  

Jessie Rees 
Foundation  

01/04/2015 
06:45 AM  

010:18 

Global  

Community 
Council - 
01/02/15 - 
01/05/15 Seg 
1  

Acres of Love is an organization 
that rescues kids in South Africa. 
They give kids who are orphaned 
or abandoned a family. In South 
Africa, there are about 3.8 million 
kids who are orphaned and 1 in 5 
kids are without a home. The 
founder of the organization lived in 
South Africa in 1999 and brought 
kids into their house to take care of 
kids. And now they have 27 
homes. For more information, 
people can visit 
www.acresoflove.org.  

Acres Of 
Love  

01/11/2015 
06:16 AM  

010:08 

Empowerment  

Community 
Council - 
01/02/15 - 
01/05/15 Seg 
2  

Monica started volunteering for the 
LAPD when she was in high 
school and had the opportunity to 
speak to the community. She found 
a lot of people were worried about 
their kids being bullied. Speak Out 
Against Bullying started in 2011 by 

Speak Out 
Against 
Bullying  

01/11/2015 
06:26 AM  

019:14 



ISSUE  
PROGRAM 

/ TITLE 
DESCRIPTION  GUEST  DATE/TIME  DURATION  

Monica who wanted to help kids 
who were being bullied. She visits 
different schools and talks to kids 
who are going through a hard time. 
Speak Out Against Bullying is on 
GoFundMe right now to raise 
money for a new computer.  

Health & 
Wellness  

Community 
Council - 
01/02/15 - 
01/05/15 Seg 
3  

The Jessie Reese Foundation was 
started by Eric's daughter Jessie 
when she was fighting cancer. She 
had a burden for kids fighting 
cancer who couldn't leave the 
hospital. She was an outpatient but 
wanted to help the kids who 
couldn't go home. After Jessie 
passed away, Eric and his wife 
continue to deliver "joy jars" to 
kids in hospitals and put smiles on 
their faces. For more information, 
visit www.negu.org and they can 
also donate.  

Jessie Rees 
Foundation  

01/11/2015 
06:45 AM  

010:18 

Music & Arts  

Community 
Council - 
01/16/15 - 
01/19/15 Seg 
1  

Education Through Music is a non-
profit organization that puts music 
back into disadvantaged schools as 
a part of the core curriculum for 
every child. They started in 2006 
by serving two schools and 800 
kids. This year is their ninth year 
where they are serving 16 schools 
and over 7,000 children. Their 
mission is to insure that children 
can learn music as a part of their 
overall education. They work in 
schools all over the Los Angeles 
County. ETMLA.org  

Education 
Through 
Music  

01/18/2015 
06:14 AM  

015:43 

Family & 
Social Impact  

Community 
Council - 
01/16/15 - 
01/19/15 Seg 
2  

Martin Luther King Jr made a 
speech to end racism in the United 
States.  

Martin 
Luther King 
Jr Speech  

01/18/2015 
06:29 AM  

016:39 

Youth 
Advocacy  

Community 
Council - 
01/16/15 - 
01/19/15 seg 
3  

Connect A Kid is the first national 
Mentor program specifically for 
adopted kids. They just launched a 
pilot program in Denver last year 
and it went so well that the 
adoption community really 
embraced the program and since 
then they've launched two teams in 
Los Angeles, a Orange County 

Connect A 
Kid  

01/18/2015 
06:46 AM  

010:04 



ISSUE  
PROGRAM 

/ TITLE 
DESCRIPTION  GUEST  DATE/TIME  DURATION  

team, a San Diego team, and New 
York City, Chicago and Orlando 
on the East Coast. If someone is 
interested in helping or attending 
an event visit connectakid.org.  

Global  

Community 
Council - 
01/23/15 - 
01/26/15 Seg 
1  

The International Lifesaving 
Association started seven years ago 
when they heard about a lot of 
drowning rates in Nicaragua, so a 
few lifeguards decided to go to 
Nicaragua and volunteer to teach 
people how to swim. ISLA is now 
in 19 countries. Their mission is to 
advance professional lifesaving 
development to areas in need 
around the globe. IslaSurf.org.  

ISLA - 2015  
01/25/2015 
06:19 AM  

019:46 

Education & 
Literacy  

Community 
Council - 
01/23/15 - 
01/26/15 Seg 
2  

Crayon Collection is an 
organization that redistributes 
crayons. They ask places like 
restaurants to save their little box 
of crayons they hand out to kids 
and they partner up with a title one 
school to use those crayons as art 
supplies. The crayons aren't even 
half used. Maybe the tip is a little 
used but they don't let those go to 
waste. Restaurants that are on 
board to help includes Islands and 
California Pizza Kitchen. 
CrayonCollection.org  

Crayon 
Collection 
2015  

01/25/2015 
06:39 AM  

010:28 

Animal Care  

Community 
Council - 
01/23/15 - 
01/26/15 Seg 
3  

Mercy for Animals works to create 
a society where all animals are 
treated with compassion and 
respect. They serve as a voice for 
animals through proactive 
consumer education initiatives, 
cruelty investigations, corporate 
outreach and legal advocacy. Since 
founding MFA over a decade ago, 
the organization has grown into a 
leading national force in the 
prevention of cruelty to famed 
animals and promotion of 
compassionate food choices and 
policies. MercyForAnimals.org  

Mercy for 
Animals  

01/25/2015 
06:49 AM  

010:19 

Family Impact  

Community 
Council - 
01/30/15 - 
02/02/15 Seg 

The Women Shelter of Long Beach 
a domestic violence agency in 
Long Beach that provides services 
to victims of domestic violence of 

Women 
Shelter Of 
Long Beach  

02/01/2015 
06:16 AM  

020:40 



ISSUE  
PROGRAM 

/ TITLE 
DESCRIPTION  GUEST  DATE/TIME  DURATION  

1  any age. They service anyone who 
needs help, including people of the 
LGBT community. Teen Dating 
Violence Awareness Month is 
February and they're having their 
event on Friday, February 27th 
from 6-9:30pm at the Art Exchange 
in Long Beach. 
WomenShelterLB.org  

Youth 
Advocacy  

Community 
Council - 
01/30/15 - 
02/02/15 Seg 
2  

Beyond Bullies is a non-profit 
organization that started about four 
years ago. Melissa started the 
program for teens and youth who 
were being bullied and to make 
them know that they are not alone  

Beyond 
Bullies  

02/01/2015 
06:37 AM  

009:13 

Event 
Fundraiser  

Community 
Council - 
01/30/15 - 
02/02/15 Seg 
3  

Celebrity Auction Doctors has 
guests at their shows where they 
offer fans an opportunity to bid on 
certain items from different 
celebrities to benefit the charity the 
celebrity supports. The next 
celebrity they have is Mike Peters 
who is auctioning a guitar. The 
event will be on February 8th and 
for more information, people can 
visit 
www.celebrityauctiondoctors.com  

Celebrity 
Auction 
Doctors  

02/01/2015 
06:46 AM  

010:22 

Health & 
Wellness  

Community 
Council - 
02/06/15 - 
02/09/15 Seg 
1  

The Arts & Services for Disabled, 
Inc improves the lives of adults 
with autism, cerebral palsy using 
art therapy. The programs offer 
classes in visual and performing 
arts with building basic self care 
and life skills, memory and 
cognitive ability, self-esteem and 
more!  

Arts & 
Services For 
Disabled  

02/08/2015 
06:11 AM  

020:12 

Global  

Community 
Council - 
02/06/15 - 
02/09/15 Seg 
2  

Wells Bring Hope drills wells to 
bring safe water and sanitation to 
rural villages in West Africa. Only 
US based safe water system that 
educates women in microfinance. 
Can't read, write, count. They are 
now able to spend time to learn 
instead of walking to find water.  

Wells Bring 
Hope  

02/08/2015 
06:31 AM  

009:05 

Education  

Community 
Council - 
02/06/15 - 
02/09/15 Seg 

National organization that is all 
529 savings plan that shares 
information. Website helps parents 
and students to plan ahead and 

College 
Savings 
Plans 
Network  

02/08/2015 
06:40 AM  

010:29 



ISSUE  
PROGRAM 

/ TITLE 
DESCRIPTION  GUEST  DATE/TIME  DURATION  

3  learn how to save money for 
college. Student load debt is at the 
highest ever: 1 trillion dollars.  

Education  

Community 
Council - 
02/13/15 - 
02/16/15 Seg 
1  

ClienSafe Schools America (SSA) 
is the nation's leading total 
solutions company specializing in 
inter-governmental relations, 
public affairs, community-
education outreach as well as the 
design and implementation of 
comprehensive multi-faceted 
programs to protect students, 
teachers and staffs in public and 
private education facilities from 
pre-k to colleges and universities 
throughout the United States.  

Safer 
Schools For 
America  

02/15/2015 
06:22 AM  

014:51 

Family & 
Social Impact  

Community 
Council - 
02/13/15 - 
02/16/15 Seg 
2  

The Autism Movement therapy is 
Autism therapy through dance. The 
organization is focused on serving 
the autism community by 
supporting autism research. This is 
an interhemispheric sensory 
integration technique incorporating 
movement and music in 
collaboration with positive 
behavior support strategies to assist 
individuals with autism spectrum 
disorders in meeting and achieving 
their speech and language, social 
and academic IEP goals.  

Autism 
Movement 
Therapy Inc  

02/15/2015 
06:36 AM  

015:23 

Health / 
Fundraiser  

Community 
Council - 
02/13/15 - 
02/16/15 Seg 
3  

The Lazarex Cancer Foundation 
builds a bridge to hope, dignity, 
and life for cancer patients and 
their families. They provide 
assistance with costs for FDA 
clinical trial participation, 
identification of clinical trial 
options, community outreach and 
education. One man on a mission: 
Cycle 75 miles a day through 18 
states for 3 1/2 months to raise 
funds and awareness in support of 
pancreatic cancer patients.  

Lazarex 
Cancer 
Foundation  

02/15/2015 
06:52 AM  

009:51 

Education & 
Literacy  

Community 
Council - 
02/20/15 - 
02/23/15 Seg 
1  

CyberPatriot is the National Youth 
Cyber Education Program. There 
are three main programs within 
CyberPatriot: the National Youth 
Cyber Defense Competition, AFA 
CyberCamps and the Elementary 

Cyber 
Patriot  

02/22/2015 
06:19 AM  

013:47 



ISSUE  
PROGRAM 

/ TITLE 
DESCRIPTION  GUEST  DATE/TIME  DURATION  

School Cyber Education Initiative. 
CyberPatriot was conceived by the 
Air Force Association (AFA) to 
inspire high school students toward 
careers in cybersecurity or other 
science, technology, engineering, 
and mathematics (STEM) 
disciplines critical to our nation's 
future. For more information, visit 
www.uscyberpatriot.org  

Youth 
Advocacy  

Community 
Council - 
02/20/15 - 
02/23/15 Seg 
2  

A Place Called Home is a 
community center in South Central 
Los Angeles where they provide 
education, art, nutrition, athletics, 
counseling and college 
scholarships for kids and they also 
have a recording and dance studio 
that lets people from as young as 8-
yearsold to 20 to have a pathway to 
higher education. Stars and Strikes 
is an annual event held at Pinz 
Bowling in Studio City, which is a 
celebrity bowling and poker 
tournament. This year it will be on 
Thursday, March 12th from 7-
11pm. This will be the 8th year 
doing the event and it attracts 
young and excited artists to come 
out and have fun and raise money 
for A Place Called Home.  

A Place 
Called 
Home 2015  

02/22/2015 
06:33 AM  

016:48 

Youth 
Advocacy  

Community 
Council - 
02/20/15 - 
02/23/15 Seg 
3  

Sticks N Stonz was created to 
empower kids in their ability to do 
what they love and not let bullying 
of any kind get in their way. It was 
created after Amanda saw her 9-
year-old cry because a little league 
umpire said he lacks style on the 
baseball field, and then her son was 
continuously bullied on the 
baseball field.  

Sticks N 
Stonz  

02/22/2015 
06:50 AM  

009:30 

Event 
Fundraiser  

Community 
Council - 
02/27/15 - 
03/02/15 Seg 
1  

This is IHop's 10th annual free 
pancakes fundraiser on National 
Pancake Day- March 3rd. 
Participating IHOP Restaurants 
plan to give away free pancakes 
from 7am to 10pm to celebrate this 
"Decade of Giving." Leading up to 
Pancake Day, IHOP has been 
selling "Miracle Balloons" for $1 

iHop Decade 
of Giving  

03/01/2015 
06:19 AM  

014:34 



ISSUE  
PROGRAM 

/ TITLE 
DESCRIPTION  GUEST  DATE/TIME  DURATION  

and $5 to benefit Children's 
Miracle Network Hospitals. Their 
goal this year is to raise $3.5 
million for charity.  

Arts  

Community 
Council - 
02/27/15 - 
03/02/15 Seg 
2  

Since 2011, 11:11 ACC has 
produced the Canoga Park Art 
Walk which brings over 200 artists, 
artisans, musicians and performers 
into the streets of Downtown 
Canoga Park. The artwalk season 
begins May 2015 and is held on the 
Third Thursday of each month, 
June through September. A 
Creative Collective focuses on 
encouraging collaboration between 
artists and their community 
including public art festivals, 
creative based workshops, youth 
oriented programming, mentorship 
and collaboration with public and 
private organizations and 
government and service based 
community organizations. Their 
next event is on March 7, it's a 
woodblock printmaking lecture and 
workshop.  

11:11 A 
Creative 
Collective  

03/01/2015 
06:34 AM  

014:52 

Health & 
Wellness  

Community 
Council - 
02/27/15 - 
03/02/15 Seg 
3  

Angels For Sight provides free 
vision screening, eye examinations, 
and glasses to the uninsured, 
undeserved children and seniors. 
There are Vision Clinics at least 
once every other week, sometimes 
two a week.  

Angels For 
Sight  

03/01/2015 
06:49 AM  

010:50 

Event 
Fundraiser  

Community 
Council - 
03/08/15 - 
03/11/15 Seg 
1  

L.A. Car Connection is a new and 
used car buying and leasing 
company. People can buy or lease 
any make or model, save the hassle 
of going to a retail dealership. L.A. 
Car Connection is having their 4th 
annual JDRF track date 
invitational. It's an invitation only 
event where they invite their clients 
to Willow Springs International 
Raceway where they can bring 
their own cars and have a customer 
appreciation day and at the same 
time raise funds for Juvenile 
Diabetes Research on March 26th.  

L.A. Car 
Connection  

03/08/2015 
06:14 AM  

010:25 

Health & Community ACT Today is a national non-profit ACT Today  03/08/2015 018:21 



ISSUE  
PROGRAM 

/ TITLE 
DESCRIPTION  GUEST  DATE/TIME  DURATION  

Wellness  Council - 
03/08/15 - 
03/11/15 Seg 
2  

organization whose mission is to 
provide treatment services and 
support for families to help their 
children with autism achieve their 
full potential. They are the only 
national non-profit that provides 
direct care and treatment grants to 
families for their children. They're 
having their 5th Annual 
ONEHOPE ACT Today! for 
Military Families 5K/10K 
Run/Walk & Family Festival on 
March 28th at Tecolote Shores 
Park in Mission Bay  

06:24 AM  

Event 
Fundraiser  

Community 
Council - 
03/08/15 - 
03/11/15 Seg 
3  

The Peacock Foundation takes 
rescued animals and use them in 
therapy with kids. They go out into 
the community and provide free 
therapy groups for at risk and high 
risk youth in 8-week programs. 
They are having their Share the 
Wine Tasting coming up on 
September 26th at the CBS 
Radford Studios. There will be 
food, wine tasting, live 
entertainment and a bunch of 
animals.  

Peacock 
Foundation  

03/08/2015 
06:43 AM  

010:10 

Youth 
Advocacy  

Community 
Council - 
03/15/15 - 
03/18/15 Seg 
1  

Katie is an actress and Paralympics 
athlete and was born with her legs 
missing from the knee down. Teen 
Adventure Challenge is a 
wilderness race that brings 
communities across Southern 
California together to inspire youth 
to step out of their comfort zones 
and explore new opportunities in 
the outdoors. Their event will be on 
March 21 at Hansen Dam 
Aquatics.  

Teen 
Adventure 
Challenge  

03/15/2015 
06:17 AM  

015:33 

Empowerment  

Community 
Council - 
03/15/15 - 
03/18/15 Seg 
2  

Dancing Man started when an 
overweight man received negative 
comments about him dancing. The 
girls in the "secret group" started 
the hashtag #FindDancingMan to 
find the man and people found him 
in less than 24 hours. They were 
trying to find him to invite him to a 
private dance party with the girls to 
just give him a day to have fun.  

DancingMan  
03/15/2015 
06:33 AM  

013:04 



ISSUE  
PROGRAM 

/ TITLE 
DESCRIPTION  GUEST  DATE/TIME  DURATION  

Military  

Community 
Council - 
03/15/15 - 
03/18/15 Seg 
3  

Jersey Mike's Subs is working with 
Operation Gratitude, which is an 
organization that provides care 
packages to our service men and 
women all over the world. 
Customers can go into any Jersey 
Mike's store during the month of 
March to support Operation 
Gratitude. Operation Gratitude, 
visit www.operationgratitude.com  

Jersey 
Mike's / 
Operation 
Gratitude  

03/15/2015 
06:46 AM  

011:09 

Empowerment  

Community 
Council - 
03/20/15 - 
03/22/15 Seg 
1  

The month of March is Women's 
History Month. Research 
underscores that women leaders 
who achieve high levels of success 
bring core strengths to bear in their 
leadership. But formidable barriers 
stand in the way of many women 
who desire to lead, not the least of 
which are personal courage, 
confidence and capacity. Women 
Up's Rising - Women Leaders 
program aims to reduce these 
barriers by providing promising 
women leaders training in 
transformation leadership. For 
more information, visit 
www.womenup.org  

Women's 
History 
Month  

03/22/2015 
06:12 AM  

014:57 

Health & 
Wellness  

Community 
Council - 
03/20/15 - 
03/22/15 Seg 
2  

MS interrupts the flow of 
information from the brain to the 
spinal cord. The 7th annual MS 
walk on Sunday, April 19 at the 
Rose Bowl. Jillian has her own 
team but people can go to 
www.walkms.org and create their 
own teams or join someone else. 
People can donate to an individual, 
a team, or just donate to the society 
and money goes to not only finding 
a cure but also support groups.  

MS Walk  
03/22/2015 
06:27 AM  

014:37 

Health & 
Wellness  

Community 
Council - 
03/20/15 - 
03/22/15 Seg 
3  

The Pediatrics Cancer Research 
Foundation's mission is to raise 
funds to improve the care and 
quality of life and survival rate of 
children with malignant diseases. 
One of their largest fundraisers of 
the year is their half marathon 
called "Reaching for the Cure". 
The event will be on March 28th 
and 29th in Irvine.  

Pediatric 
Cancer 
Research 
Foundation  

03/22/2015 
06:41 AM  

011:36 
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Health & 
Wellness & 
Fundraiser  

Community 
Council - 
03/28/15 - 
03/29/15 Seg 
1  

This Tour de Pier is organized to 
raise funds for the cancer 
community. The Hirshberg 
Foundation for Pancreatic Cancer 
Research, The Uncle Kory 
Foundation and Cancer Support 
Community. The 3rd Annual Tour 
de Pier is a unique fundraising 
event that brings one of the hottest 
indoor fitness activities " stationary 
cycling " to the gorgeous outdoors 
of Manhattan Beach 5/17/15. Ride 
in place with an ocean view!  

Tour de Pier  
03/29/2015 
06:11 AM  

013:18 

Humanity  

Community 
Council - 
03/28/15 - 
03/29/15 Seg 
2  

Paul Avila and his son, Pauly, 18, 
who cannot see or talk, plan to 
distribute AM-FM headphones to 
the homeless on Skid Row this 
holiday season in honor of Pauly's 
love of music. Avila purchased 
about 50 AM-FM headsets with his 
own money and passed them out 
over Thanksgiving break. Radio 
headsets because they do not 
require a person to download songs 
like a MP3 player would.  

Paul and 
Pauly  

03/29/2015 
06:24 AM  

011:48 

Family & 
Social Impact  

Community 
Council - 
03/28/15 - 
03/29/15 Seg 
3  

Dr. Temple Grandin, Matt & Ed 
Asner, Exceptional Minds & 
Wayne Foglesong & Miller Career 
& Transition Center (LAUSD) we 
will be celebrating job 
opportunities for individuals with 
autism and related disorders. When 
it comes to job opportunities, we 
must replace the word hope and 
ask for a Seat at the Table. Many of 
our youth now face the issue of 
employment as they age out of the 
public school setting and transition 
into adult-hood. We are at a 
crossroads in this country. We 
know that the rate of employment 
for adults with autism is 
devastatingly low, and our May 
20th musical and celebrity event 
intends to shout the message that 
our youth are employable 
individuals who bring value, know-
how and dignity to the workplace. 
We invite you to hear Dr. Temple 
Grandin & Dani Bowman speak to 

Autism 
Works Now  

03/29/2015 
06:36 AM  

012:17 
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the issue at hand. Autism Works 
Now! We look forward to seeing 
you Wednesday May 20th at Club 
Nokia @ LA Live in downtown 
Los Angeles!  

 

Section II  

NETWORK (and/or SYNDICATED) PROGRAMMING  

Section II lists the network-provided (and/or syndicated) programming that 

the station broadcast during the preceding calendar quarter that addresses 

community issues.  

ISSUE  PROGRAM / TITLE DESCRIPTION  DATE/TIME  DURATION  

(Insert network and/or syndicator-provided programs lists here.)  

 

Section III  

PUBLIC SERVICE ANNOUNCEMENTS  

Section III lists public service announcements that the station broadcast 

during the preceding calendar quarter that address community issues.  

ISSUE  ORGANIZATION OR TITLE DURATION  RUNS  

Environmental BLUE WATER GREEN EARTH  000:24 020  

Health & Wellness McDonalds (Walk for Kids) 000:17 024  

Empowerment  Special Olympics  000:16 046  

Health & Wellness Susan G Komen  000:30 020  

EAS TEST  Emergency Alert System  000:03 001  

EAS TEST  Emergency Alert System  000:05 013  

HEALTH AND FITNESS  American Heart Association  000:29 002  

LAPD & LAFD   Knott’s Berry Farm  000:30 003  

LAPD & LAFD  Knott’s Berry Farm  000:31 042  

MILITARY AND VETERANS  SHOW YOUR STRIPES  000:30 010  

MILITARY AND VETERANS  SHOW YOUR STRIPES  000:31 023  

 


