
 

WRBW 
ISSUES AND PROGRAMMING SUMMARY 

 
January 1, 2016 – March 31, 2016 

 

 
 

WRBW telecast the following programs addressing the public issues indicated during the quarter.  
 

ORLANDO MATTERS 

Saturdays 7-7:30am   

WRBW’s weekly locally produced public affairs program looks at the people and places of Central Florida 

and the Space Coast.  Orlando Matters showcases a variety of guests with intriguing discussion on matters 

important to the region.  The Program highlights problems and needs in the area along with solutions and 

courses of action viewers can take to address the issues in their communities. Specific public issue, program 

topics, & airdates are enclosed.  
 

Issue: Community Pride 

COMMUNITY CALENDAR 

A calendar of up coming events from non-profit and community outreach organizations in WRBW’s coverage 

area.  These: 30 second locally produced program inserts remind viewers of events, projects, and happenings 

occurring throughout the region.  Airdate windows and subject matter within each program are enclosed. 
 

 

COMMUNITY OUTREACH PROJECTS 

The Station participated in the following Public Affairs outreach project during the period to benefit the local 

community.  Public issue and subject matter is enclosed. 

 
Meet and greet at the Daytona 500 

March of Dimes-March for Babies 

Meet and greet at Washington Nationals spring training game 

 

The Station telecast over 642 no cost public service announcements during the period.   

 

 

 

 

Kimberly Davies Date: 4/1/16 

Kimberly Davies 

Program Coordinator 

  

 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #777 

 

RECORD DATE:  1/2/16        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  1/2/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: 2016 Legal issues 

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on Orlando Matters, John Brown sits down with attorney Chet Pleban to discuss 
big legal issues for 2016.  They look at gun laws, prison changes, and legal topics that will be 
impacting people in Central Florida. 
  
Also, Lt. Governor Carlos Lopez-Cantera sits down with reporter Mike Synan to discuss his 
run for Senate and other big issues facing Florida in 2015. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Chet Pleban 

Lt. Governor Carlos Lopez Cantera 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 1/5/16 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #778 

 

RECORD DATE:  1/11/16        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  1/9/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Gun control 

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on Orlando Matters, John Brown takes a closer look at President Obama's 
executive order on gun control.  Political analysts Carl Jackson and Ernest Deloach join the 
show to make their case from the Republican and Democratic standpoint.   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Ernest Deloach 

Carl Jackson 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 2/25/16 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #779 

 

RECORD DATE:  1/12/16        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  1/16/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: What really happens in government? 

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on Orlando Matters, host John Brown sits down with former Congressman Ric 
Keller to discuss life on Capitol Hill.  The president recently said in his State of the Union 
address that he regrets the hostility in Congress.  So Keller talks about why there is so much 
fighting and what it's really like working in that environment.   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Ric Keller 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 2/25/16 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #780 

 

RECORD DATE:  1/26/16        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  1/30/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: City of Orlando growth 

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on Orlando Matters, host John Brown talks with Mayor Buddy Dyer about the 
money the city is paying to pave the way for the new Orlando City Soccer Stadium.  Plus, 
George Aguel from Visit Orlando discusses the record tourism numbers for 2015 and how 
to keep the momentum going for 2016. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Mayor Buddy Dyer 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 2/25/16 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #781 

 

RECORD DATE:  2/3/16        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  2/6/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Iowa Caucus impact on Florida vote 

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on Orlando Matters, host John Brown takes a closer look at the Iowa Caucuses.  
He talks with political analysts Ernest DeLoach, Eddie Fernandez and Frank Torres about 
the outcome of the voting and the primary battles ahead.  John also talks with Orlando 
Sentinel Columnist Scott Maxwell about the oversized influence Iowa has on the election 
and some ways it can be changed. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Ernest Deloach 

Eddie Fernandez 

Frant Torres 

Scott Maxwell 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 2/25/16 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #782 

 

RECORD DATE:  2/10/16        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  2/13/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Heroin Addiction problems  

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on “Orlando Matters,” host John Brown talks about the heroin epidemic in 
Central Florida.  Drug counselor Lui "The Dope Doctor" Delgado discusses why so many 
middle class Americans are turning to heroin, why it's so easy to get, and the treatment 
options. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Luis Delgado 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 2/25/16 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #783 

 

RECORD DATE:  2/17/26        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  2/20/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Addiction treatment  

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on Orlando Matters, host John Brown talks with baseball legend Darryl 
Strawberry about his addiction clinics.  The baseball legends now lives in Orlando and 
operates clinics to help people with substance abuse.  They discuss his struggles during his 
playing year, the point when he realized he needed help, and how he is using his name to 
help others get and stay sober. 
  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Darryl Strawberry 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 2/25/16 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #784 

 

RECORD DATE:  2/24/16        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  2/27/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Men's Health Forum 

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on Orlando Matters, John Brown sits down with a medical panel of experts to 
discuss Men's Health.  They look at Heart Disease, Cosmetic Surgery, Weight Loss, and 
other issues impact men here in Central Florida.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Dr. Kevin Accola 

Dr. Jamin Brahmbhatt 

Dr. Armondo Soto 

Jason Avner 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 1/5/16 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #785 

 

RECORD DATE:  3/1/16        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  3/5/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Mayor Dyer addresses downtown issues 

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on Orlando Matters, John Brown talks about the big developments in Orlando 
with Mayor Buddy Dyer.  They will take a look at the growth taking place in Lake Nona, the 
future of the Downtown UCF campus, the new Zip Car program, and a change in the trash 
pickup. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Mayor Buddy Dyer 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 3/3/15 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #786 

 

RECORD DATE:  3/8/16        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  3/12/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Legal issues with identity theft 

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on Orlando Matters, a closer look at your rights when it comes to your personal 
information. Millions of Americans have had their identities stolen over the past few years 
and are now trying to figure out how to reclaim their private information.  Host John Brown 
talks with attorney Richard Dellinger about the legal implications you need to know about. 
  
Also, Dr. George Hagarty of Beacon College will join the show to discuss new options for 
learning disabled students when it comes to a college degree. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Richard Dellinger - Lowndes Law 

Dr. George Hagarty - Beacon College 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 3/7/16 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #787 

 

RECORD DATE:  3/16/16        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  3/19/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Florida Primary recap 

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on Orlando Matters, John Brown takes a look at the fallout from the Florida 
Primaries.  Political analysts Ernest Deloach and Carl Jackson join the panel to talk about the 
winners and losers and where the race goes from here.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Ernest Deloach 

Carl Jackson 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 3/26/16 



 

ORLANDO MATTERS  

PROGRAMMING REPORT 

 
PROGRAM Episode: #788 

 

RECORD DATE:  3/22/16        DIRECTOR: Alwan  

 

AIR DATE:  3/26/16                LENGTH:  30 min.         

 

PRODUCER/HOST: John Brown 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Identity Theft, plus Easter Community Event 

 

SUBJECT MATTER, ISSUES DISCUSSED: 

 
This week on Orlando Matters, a closer look at our recent investigation into identity theft.  
We look at why it's a big mistake to leave your boarding pass behind on a plane or throw it 
away at the airport. There is enough information on that paper to give thieves access to your 
life story. 
 
Plus, Pastor Tim Johnson joins the show to discuss the He Got Up event on Easter to help 
families in need.  30,000 people expected to pack the Citrus Bowl for large community 
event. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GUEST CONTACT NAME & Phone number: 

Tim Johnson 

 

EVERGREEN PROGRAM?:  

 

Filled out by: John Brown     Date: 3/26/16 



PRODUCER:  

PROGRAM:  COMMUNITY CALENDAR  

TITLE:  PSA   

LENGTH: 30  

ON-AIR DATES:1/9/16 - 1/16/16 

PROD. DATE: 1/8/16 

SPONSORS: Papa Johns, Central FL 

Hyundai 
 

VIDEO 

 

 

GRAPHIC OPEN 
 

 

Winter Park Game Night 

Sat., Jan. 16, 6 p.m. 

721 W. New England Ave. 

Winter Park Community Center 

407-623-3275 

 

Camellia show and festival 

Sat., Jan. 16, 10 a.m. 

1500 S. Denning Drive 

Winter Park Garden Club 

407-963-8970 

Winter Park 

 

 

How to grow backyard potatoes 

Sat., Jan. 16, 10 a.m. 

3100 E. New York Ave. DeLand 

Volusia County Agricultural Center 

386-822-5778 
 

 

 

 

GRAPHIC CLOSE

 
 

 

AUDIO 

(:03)  

HERE’S WHAT’S HAPPENING THIS 
WEEKEND FROM MY 65 
  

(:20)  

 

MAKE PLANS FOR A FREE FAMILY 

GAME NIGHT AT THE WINTER PARK 
COMMUNITY CENTER! ENJOY BOARD 

GAMES, A FOOD TRUCK AND MORE!  
 

SEE AWARD-WINNING BLOOMS 
FROM THROUGHOUT CENTRAL 

FLORIDA AND THE SOUTHEASTERN 
UNITED STATES AT THE CAMELLIA* 

SHOW AND FESTIVAL! 
 

AND LEARN HOW TO GROW 
BACKYARD POTATOES WITH 

DEMONSTRATIONS AND TIPS FROM 
AN EXPERT AT THE VOLUSIA COUNTY 

AGRICULTURAL CENTER 

 
 

 (:06) 
THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 
PAPA JOHNS AND YOUR CENTRAL 

FLORIDA HYUNDAI DEALERS   
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 
 



PRODUCER:  

PROGRAM:  COMMUNITY CALENDAR  

TITLE:  PSA   

LENGTH: 30  

ON-AIR DATES:1/16/16 - 1/23/16 

PROD. DATE: 1/15/16 

SPONSORS: Papa Johns, Central FL 

HONDA DEALERS, STEAK AND SHAKE, 

PUBLIX, SOUTHERN CHEVY DEALERS 

HARLEM GLOBETROTTERS  
 

VIDEO 

 

 

GRAPHIC OPEN 
 

 

Local Artist Exhibit 

(386) 804-6987  

Enterprise Heritage Center and Museum  

Saturday and Sunday January 23rd and 24th 

11:00 AM  

360 Main St 

 

Whistle in the distance: The trains of Winter 

Park 

(407) 647-2330 

Winter Park History Museum 

Saturday and Sunday January 23rd and 24th 

5:00 PM 

200 West New England Ave 

 

Conway United Methodist Church movie 

night 

(407)277-5010 

Conway United Methodist Church 

Saturday January 23rd 7:30 PM 

3401 South Conway Road 

 

 

 

 
GRAPHIC CLOSE

 
 

 

AUDIO 

(:03)  

HERE’S WHAT’S HAPPENING THIS 
WEEKEND FROM MY 65 
  

(:20)  

 

 

STOP BY THE ENTERPRISE HERITAGE 
CENTER TO FIND IMAGINATIVE 

WORKS OF ART FROM LOCAL 
ARTISTS 

 
LEARN ABOUT THE HISTORY OF A 

VARIETY OF TRAINS AT THE WINTER 
PARK HISTORY MUSEUM  

 
AND ENJOY A MOVIE NIGHT UNDER 

THE STARS AT CONWAY UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

 
(:06) 

THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 
PAPA JOHNS, YOUR CENTRAL 

FLORIDA HONDA DEALERS  AND 
PUBLIX 

 
(:06) 

THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 
CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 

STEAK AND SHAKE, YOUR 
SOUTHERN CHEVY DEALERS AND 

THE HARLEM GLOBETROTTERS   
 

 
 

 

 
 



PRODUCER:  

PROGRAM:  COMMUNITY CALENDAR  

TITLE:  PSA   

LENGTH: 30  

ON-AIR DATES:1/16/16 - 1/23/16 

PROD. DATE: 1/15/16 

SPONSORS: Papa Johns, Central FL 

HONDA DEALERS, STEAK AND SHAKE, 

PUBLIX, SOUTHERN CHEVY DEALERS 

HARLEM GLOBETROTTERS  
 

VIDEO 

 

 

GRAPHIC OPEN 
 

 

Eola Sunday Market 

(407)246-4485 

Lake Eola Park  

Sunday January 31st 10:00 AM 

101 North Rosalind Ave  

 

Timeless Tales: Family story time 

(407)835-7323 

North Orange branch of the Orange County 

library system  

Sunday January 31st 1:30PM 

1211 East Semoran Blvd 

 

 

Health Expo 

(386)441-4421 

Riverview United Methodist Church  

Saturday January 30th 9:00 AM 

2253 John Anderson Drive 
 

 

 

 
GRAPHIC CLOSE

 
 

 

AUDIO 

(:03)  

HERE’S WHAT’S HAPPENING THIS 
WEEKEND FROM MY 65 
  

(:20)  

 

 

STOP BY THE FARMERS MARKET IN 
DOWNTOWN ORLANDO FOR A NICE 

SUNDAY OUT AT LAKE EOLA  
 

LEARN ABOUT YOUR BODY AND 
WAYS TO STAY HEALTHY AT THE 

FREE HEALTH EXPO AT RIVERVIEW 
UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

 
AND ENJOY A TIMELESS TALE WITH 

YOUR FAMILY AT THE NORTH 
ORANGE BRANCH LIBRARY 

 
(:06) 

THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 
PAPA JOHNS, YOUR CENTRAL 

FLORIDA HYUNDAI DEALERS  AND 
THE FLORIDA LOTTERY 

 
(:06) 

THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 
CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 

STEAK AND SHAKE AND THE HARLEM 
GLOBETROTTERS   

 
 

 
 

 

 
 



PRODUCER:  

PROGRAM:  COMMUNITY CALENDAR  

TITLE:  PSA   

LENGTH: 30  

ON-AIR DATES:01/30/16 - 02/06/16 

PROD. DATE: 01/26/16 

SPONSORS: The Florida Lottery, Papa 

Johns, and The Harlem Globetrotters  
 

VIDEO 

 

 

GRAPHIC OPEN 
 

 

Mardi Gras on Main Street Dog Parade 

Sat., Feb. 6, 9:30 a.m. 

100 New York Ave. 

Chess Park 

386-490-2484 

DeLand 

 

 

Wildlife Festival and Birdapalouza 

(407)886-1441 

Magnolia Park   

Sat. 9:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m. 

2929 S. Binion Rd  

Apopka, FL 32703 
 

 

 

Cupid’s Undie Run 

(212)344-6633 

Elixir 

Sat.12:00 p.m. – 7:00 p.m. 

9 W. Washington St.  

Orlando, FL 32801  
 

 

 

 
GRAPHIC CLOSE

 
 

 

AUDIO 

(:03)  

HERE’S WHAT’S HAPPENING THIS 
WEEKEND FROM MY 65 
  

(:20)  

 

BRING YOUR FURRY FRIEND TO THE 

MARDI GRAS ON MAIN STREET DOG 
PARADE FEATURING A PATRIOTIC 

PUP-COSTUME CONTEST, 
ADOPTABLE PETS, GAMES, AND OF 

COURSE A PARADE! 
 

CELEBRATE THE UNIQUE ANIMALS 
THAT CALL LAKE APOPKA HOME AT 

THE WILDLIFE FESTIVAL AND 
BIRDAPALOOZA.  

 
AND JOIN HUNDREDS OF HALF-

NAKED RUNNERS THROUGH THE 
STREETS OF DOWNTOWN ORLANDO 

TO RAISE FUNDS FOR THE 

CHILDRENS TUMOR FOUNDATION AT 
CUPID’S UNDIE RUN. 

 
(:06) 

THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 
CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 

THE FLORIDA LOTTERY, PAPA JOHNS, 
AND THE HARLEM GLOBETROTTERS 

 
  

 
 

 
 

 

 
 



PRODUCER:  

PROGRAM:  COMMUNITY CALENDAR  

TITLE:  PSA   

LENGTH: 30  

ON-AIR DATES:2/13/16 – 2/20/16 

PROD. DATE: 2/12/16 

SPONSORS: Nellie’s Free Range and 

Certified Humane Eggs, PAPA JOHNS, 

HOLLAR HYUNDAI, BADCOCK, CNT.FLA 

HYUNDAI DEALERS, CENTRAL FLA 

HONDA 
 

VIDEO 

 

 

GRAPHIC OPEN 
 

Orlando Wetlands Festival 

Sat., Feb. 20, 9 a.m. 

1300 Fort Christmas Rd. 

Fort Christmas Historical Park 

407-665-5102 

Orlando 

 

Osceola County Fair 

Sat. & Sun., Feb. 20
th 

& 21
st
, 12 p.m. 

1875 Silver Spur Lane 

Osceola Heritage Park 

407-697-3333 

Osceola 

 

Touch-a-Truck 

Sat., Feb. 20
th

 9 a.m. 

901 E. Seminole Blvd. 

Sanford River Walk 

407-568-1706 

Sanford 

 
 

 

 

GRAPHIC CLOSE

 
 

 

AUDIO 

(:03)  

HERE’S WHAT’S HAPPENING THIS 
WEEKEND FROM MY 65 
  

(:20)  

 

DISCOVER THE BEAUTY OF THE 

WETLANDS WITH HIKES, HAYRIDES, 

WILDLIFE SHOWS AND ACTIVITES FOR 

THE KIDS AT THE ORLANDO WETLANDS 

FESTIVAL! 

 

ENJOY FUN FOR THE WHOLE FAMILY 

AT THE OSCEOLA COUNTY FAIR! 

 

AND BRING YOUR KIDS TO SEE THE 

EQUIPMENT AND VEHICLES FIRST 

RESPONDERS USE DURING A NATURAL 

DISASTER AT “TOUCH-A-TRUCK”! 

 

(:06) 
THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 
NELLIE’S FREE RANGE AND 

CERTIFIED HUMANE EGGS, BADCOCK 

FURNITURE AND HOLLAR HYUNDAI 
 

  
(:06) 

THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 
CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 

YOUR CENTRAL FLORIDA HYUNDAI 
DELAERS, PAPA JOHNS, AND 

CENTRAL FLORIDA HONDA 
 

 
 

 
 

 



PRODUCER:  

PROGRAM:  COMMUNITY CALENDAR  

TITLE:  PSA   

LENGTH: 30  

ON-AIR DATES:01/30/16 - 02/06/16 

PROD. DATE: 01/26/16 

SPONSORS: The Florida Lottery, Papa 

Johns, and The Harlem Globetrotters  
 

VIDEO 

 

 

GRAPHIC OPEN 
 

 

Mount Dora Art Festival  

(352)383-0880 

Downtown Mount Dora   

Sat/Sun. 10:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. 

P.O. Box378  

Mount Dora, FL 32756 
 

 

Wildlife Festival and Birdapalouza 

(407)886-1441 

Magnolia Park   

Sat. 9:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m. 

2929 S. Binion Rd  

Apopka, FL 32703 
 

 

 

Cupid’s Undie Run 

(212)344-6633 

Elixir 

Sat.12:00 p.m. – 7:00 p.m. 

9 W. Washington St.  

Orlando, FL 32801  
 

 

 

 
GRAPHIC CLOSE

 
 

 

AUDIO 

(:03)  

HERE’S WHAT’S HAPPENING THIS 
WEEKEND FROM MY 65 
  

(:20)  

 

 

IT’S TIME ONCE AGAIN FOR THE 
MOUNT DORA ART FESTIVAL! ENJOY 

LIVE ENTERTAINMENT, FOOD, 
CHILDREN’S ACTIVITIES AND OF 

COURSE PLENTY OF ART! 
 

CELEBRATE THE UNIQUE ANIMALS 
THAT CALL LAKE APOPKA HOME AT 

THE WILDLIFE FESTIVAL AND 
BIRDAPALOOZA.  

 
AND JOIN HUNDREDS OF HALF-

NAKED RUNNERS THROUGH THE 
STREETS OF DOWNTOWN ORLANDO 

TO RAISE FUNDS FOR THE 

CHILDRENS TUMOR FOUNDATION AT 
CUPID’S UNDIE RUN. 

 
(:06) 

THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 
CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 

THE FLORIDA LOTTERY, PAPA JOHNS, 
AND THE HARLEM GLOBETROTTERS 

 
  

 
 

 
 

 

 
 



 
PRODUCER:  

PROGRAM:  COMMUNITY CALENDAR  

TITLE:  PSA   

LENGTH: 30  

ON-AIR DATES:03/04/16 - 03/12/16 

PROD. DATE: 03/04/16 

SPONSORS: AUTO NATION, CALICO 

CORNERS, BELLS, MCDONALDS, CF 

HYUNDAI DEALERS. DEVRY 
 

VIDEO 

 

 

GRAPHIC OPEN 
 

 

 

Unwrapped Live 

Dr. Phillips Center  

(844)513-2014 

Sat. 7:30 p.m. 

455 S. Magnolia Ave 

Orlando, FL 32801 

 

Southeastern Guide Dogs Walk-a-thon 

Baldwin Park 

(941)729.5665 

Sat. 8:30 a.m.. 

New Broad Street 

 

Leesburg Food Truck-N-Flick Night 

Main Street  

(352)365-0053 

Sat 5:00 p.m. 

Downtown Leesburg 

 
 

 

 

GRAPHIC CLOSE

 
 

 

AUDIO 

(:03)  

HERE’S WHAT’S HAPPENING THIS 
WEEKEND FROM MY 65 
  

(:20)  

 

HEAD TO DOWNTOWN ORLANDO 

AND ENJOY UNWRAPPED LIVE! A 
FREE JAZZ-INFUSED, HIP-HOP 

INSPIRED MUSIC EXPERIENCE AT 
THE DR. PHILLIPS CENTER. 

 
BRING YOUR PETS TO THE 

SOUTHEASTERN GUIDE DOGS WALK-
A-THON. HELP HONOR 

EXTRAORDINARY GUIDE DOGS AND 
THEIR SERVICE TO THE COMMUNITY. 

 
AND ENJOY AN OUTDOOR MOVIE 

WITH YOUR FAMILY AND FRIENDS AT 
THE LEESBURG FOOD TRUCK-N-

FLICK NIGHT. 

. 
 

(:06) 
THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 
AUTO NATION, CALICO CORNERS, 

AND MCDONALDS 
 

(:06) 
THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 
YOUR CENTRAL FLORIDA HYUNDAI 

DEALERS AND DEVRY UNIVERSITY 
 

  

 
 



 
PRODUCER:  

PROGRAM:  COMMUNITY CALENDAR  

TITLE:  PSA   

LENGTH: 30  

ON-AIR DATES:03/12/16 – 03/19/16 

PROD. DATE: 03/11/16 

SPONSORS:  
 

VIDEO 

 

 

GRAPHIC OPEN 
 

 

 

Quack Attack on Poverty 5K 

Sat., Mar. 19, 8 a.m. 

4990 New Broad St. 

Harbor Park 

407-361-4644 

Orlando 

 

Wine and Seafood Festival 

Sat. & Sun. Mar. 19
th

 & 20
th

 , 10 a.m.
 

19239 N. U.S. Highway 27 

Lakeridge Winery & Vineyards  

352-394-8627 

Clermont 

 

Picnic and Community Garden Party 

Sat., Mar. 19
th

 10 a.m. 

2101 Peghorn Way 

Peghorn Nature Park 

407-957-7243 

St. Cloud 

 

 
 

 

 

GRAPHIC CLOSE

 
 

 

AUDIO 

(:03)  

HERE’S WHAT’S HAPPENING THIS 
WEEKEND FROM MY 65 
  

(:20)  

 

DON YOUR RUBBER DUCKY POOL 

FLOAT AND JOIN THE RACE TO BENEFIT 

THE COMMUNITY FOOD AND 

OUTREACH CENTER AT THE QUACK 

ATTACK ON POVERTY FIVE K! 

 

HELP RAISE MONEY FOR AUTISM 

WHILE ENJOYING FINE DINING AND 

LOCAL MUSIC AT THE WINE AND 

SEAFOOD FESTIVAL! 

 

 

AND ENJOY CHILDREN'S ACTIVITIES, 

LIVE MUSIC, PIE CONTESTS AND MORE 

AT THE PEGHORN HOMESTEAD PICNIC 

AND GARDEN PARTY! 

 

. 
 

(:06) 
THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 
THE N-H-R-A GATOR NATIONALS, 

BADCOCK, AND MCDONALDS 
 

(:06) 
THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 
CENTRAL FLORIDA HONDA AND PAPA 

JOHNS 

 
  

 
 



PRODUCER:  

PROGRAM:  COMMUNITY CALENDAR  

TITLE:  PSA   

LENGTH: 30  

ON-AIR DATES:03/26/16 – 04/2/16 

PROD. DATE: 03/25/16 

SPONSORS: ORLANDO MAGIC, STEAK 

AND SHAKE 
 

VIDEO 

 

 

GRAPHIC OPEN 
 

 

 

Alternatives to Traditional Vegetable 

Gardening  

Uf/IFAS Extension Orange County  

Sat 9:00 a.m. – 10:30 a.m. 

6021 S. Conway Rd. 

Orlando, FL 32812 

Http://gardenflorida.eventbrite.com 

 

Introduction to Florida Friendly  

Landscaping  

Jessie Brock Community Center  

Sat. 10:00 a.m. – 11:30 a.m. 

6021 S. Conway Rd. 

Orlando, FL 32812 

Http://gardenflorida.eventbrite.com 

 

Orlando Area Historical Rose Society  

Harry P. Leu Gardens 

Sun. 2:30 p.m.  

1920 N. Forest Ave 

www.leugardens.org 
 

 

 
 

 

GRAPHIC CLOSE

 
 

 

AUDIO 

(:03)  

HERE’S WHAT’S HAPPENING THIS 
WEEKEND FROM MY 65 
  

(:20)  

 

 
STOP BY THE ALTERNATIVES TO 

TRADITIONAL VEGETABLE 
GARDENING EVENT TO LEARN HOW 

YOU CAN AVOID GROWING YOUR 
VEGETABLES IN THE BACKYARD 

SOIL!  
 

WANT TO MAKE BETTER CHOICES 

WHEN IT COMES TO YOUR 
LANDSCAPING PRACTICES? STOP BY 

THE JESSIE BROCK COMMUNITY 
CENTER FOR INFORMATION FROM 

THE EXPERTS   
 

AND ENJOY A DAY AT LOU GARDENS 
AND LEARN ALL ABOUT ROSES AT 

THE ORLANDO HISTORICAL ROSE 
SOCIETY  

 
 

(:06) 
THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 

YOUR ORLANDO MAGIC 
 

(:06) 
THIS WEEKEND COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR IS BROUGHT TO YOU BY 
STEAK AND SHAKE  

 
  

 



 

 

PUBLIC  

AFFAIRS   

PROJECT      

REPORT 
 

 

STATION:  WOFLWRBW 

 

EVENT: Daytona 500 

 

EVENT DATE: 02-21-2016                 EVENT TIME: 8:00 a.m.  to 2:00 p.m.       

 

EVENT LOCATION: Daytona Speedway 

 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Community awareness 

 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE EVENT DETAIL: Fox 35 anchors Amy Kaufeldt and John Brown along with 

station personnel  went to greet viewers of Fox 35 and Good Day Orlando at the 2016 Daytona 

500. They represented Fox 35 and our connection with the local and national sports community. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

STATION PARTICIPANTS: Amy Kaufeldt and John Brown 

 

COMMUNITY EVENT CONTACT & PHONE #:  Jordan Bryant  386-681-6782 

 

 

STATION PRODUCER COORDINATOR: John Lopez 

 

FILLED OUT BY: Louis Selzer 

Date: 03/23/2016 

 



 

PUBLIC  

AFFAIRS   

PROJECT      

REPORT 
 

 

STATION:  WOFLWRBW 

 

EVENT:  March of Dimes-March for Babies 

 

EVENT DATE: 2/23/16     EVENT TIME: 11:30 am – 1:15 pm  

 

EVENT LOCATION:  Historic Dubsdread Ballroom, 549 West Par Street, Orlando 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Community awareness  

 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE EVENT DETAILS: Fox 35’s Amy Kaudfeldt attended a seminar kicking off the march for 
Babies. Amy was able to utilize her emcee skills to facilitate the event while meeting and greeting local 
viewers. The event proved beneficial for the cause and for outreach purposes. 
  

 

 

 

STATION PARTICIPANTS:  Amy Kaufeldt  



 

COMMUNITY EVENT CONTACT & PHONE #:  Stephanie Baer 321.274.8684. 

 

 

STATION PRODUCER COORDINATOR: John Lopez 

 

FILLED OUT BY: Louis Selzer 

Date: 3/23/16 

 

 



 

 

PUBLIC  

AFFAIRS   

PROJECT      

REPORT 
 

 

STATION:  WOFLWRBW 

 

EVENT: Washington Nationals 

 

EVENT DATE: 03-13-2016                 EVENT TIME: 12:00 p.m.       

 

EVENT LOCATION: Space Coast Stadium, Viera 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE: Community awareness 

 

 

PUBLIC ISSUE EVENT DETAIL: Fox 35 anchor John Brown attended the Washington 

Nationals spring training game and threw out the first pitch. John represented Fox 35 and also 

met with viewers who were excited to meet and connect with the anchor of Fox 35.  

 

 

 

 

 

STATION PARTICIPANTS: John Brown  

 

COMMUNITY EVENT CONTACT & PHONE #:  Charlie Brault 321-633-9200 

 

 

STATION PRODUCER COORDINATOR: John Lopez 

 

FILLED OUT BY: Louis Selzer  

Date: 03/23/2016 

 



WRBW 65: 

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – ORANGE, SEMINOLE, OSCEOLA 
'Fri Jan 15 10:55:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 15 11:55:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – POLKE, SUMTER  
'Sun Jan 17 03:16:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 03:46:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - POLK 
'Sun Jan 17 03:46:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 04:16:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - POLK 
'Sun Jan 17 04:17:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 04:47:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - BREVARD  
'Sun Jan 17 04:31:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 05:16:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA  
'Sun Jan 17 05:06:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 06:06:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA 
'Sun Jan 17 05:41:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 06:26:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – ORANGE, LAKE, SEMINOLE, VOLUSIA  
'Fri Jan 22 10:36:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 11:36:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - VOLUSIA  
'Fri Jan 22 11:49:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 12:34:00 2016 EST'  
CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY – BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, ORANGE, OSCEOLA, SEMINOLE, SUMTER, 
VOLUSIA  
'Thu Jan 28 13:41:00 2016 EST' to 'Thu Jan 28 15:41:00 2016 EST'  
'Sun Feb 28 00:13:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA  
'Tue Feb 16 03:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 04:35:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - BREVARD  
'Tue Feb 16 04:22:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 05:07:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - BREVARD 
'Tue Feb 16 04:22:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 05:07:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - BREVARD  
'Tue Feb 16 04:22:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 05:07:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - MARION  
'Wed Feb 24 08:44:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 09:44:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – SUMTER, POLK 
'Wed Feb 24 09:52:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 10:22:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - POLK  
'Wed Feb 24 12:32:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 13:02:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - POLK  
'Wed Feb 24 12:32:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 13:02:00 2016 EST'  
CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY - FLORIDA 
'Sun Mar  6 10:34:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Mar  6 12:34:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - BREVARD 
'Thu Mar 24 17:10:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 18:10:00 2016 EDT'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - MARION 
'Thu Mar 24 20:34:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:04:00 2016 EDT'  
TORNADO WARNING - OSCEOLA 
'Thu Mar 24 21:11:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:56:00 2016 EDT'  



TORNADO WARNING - OSCEOLA 
'Thu Mar 24 21:11:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:56:00 2016 EDT'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA 
'Fri Mar 25 14:58:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 15:58:00 2016 EDT'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – OSCEOLA, BREVARD 
'Fri Mar 25 15:22:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 16:22:00 2016 EDT'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – OSCEOLA, BREVARD 
'Fri Mar 25 15:22:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 16:22:00 2016 EDT'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – OSCEOLA, BREVARD 
'Fri Mar 25 15:22:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 16:22:00 2016 EDT'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – OSCEOLA, BREVARD 
'Fri Mar 25 15:22:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 16:22:00 2016 EDT'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – OSCEOLA, BREVARD 
'Fri Mar 25 15:22:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 16:22:00 2016 EDT'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – OSCEOLA, BREVARD 
'Fri Mar 25 15:22:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 16:22:00 2016 EDT'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA 
'Tue Mar 29 15:43:00 2016 EDT' to 'Tue Mar 29 16:28:00 2016 EDT'  
 
 

WRBW 65.2 MOVIES!: 

Children’s Spots – WOGX 65.2 

 1/2/16 & 1/9/16 

 2/6/16 & 2/13/16 

 3/5/16 & 3/12/16 

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – ORANGE, SEMINOLE, OSCEOLA 
'Fri Jan 15 10:55:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 15 11:55:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - BREVARD  
'Fri Jan 15 11:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 15 12:05:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – POLK, SUMTER  
'Sun Jan 17 03:16:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 03:46:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - BREVARD  
'Sun Jan 17 04:31:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 05:16:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA  
'Sun Jan 17 05:06:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 06:06:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA  
'Sun Jan 17 05:41:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 06:26:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – ORANGE, LAKE, SEMINOLE, VOLUSIA  
'Fri Jan 22 10:36:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 11:36:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - FLAGLER  
'Fri Jan 22 10:38:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 11:08:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - VOLUSIA  



'Fri Jan 22 11:46:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 12:31:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - VOLUSIA 
'Fri Jan 22 11:49:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 12:34:00 2016 EST'  
CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY - BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, ORANGE, OSCEOLA, SEMINOLE, SUMTER, 
VOLUSIA  
'Thu Jan 28 13:41:00 2016 EST' to 'Thu Jan 28 15:41:00 2016 EST'  
CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY - BREVARE, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, ORANGE, OSCEOLA, POLK, 
SEMINOLE, SUMTER, VOLUSIA  
'Thu Jan 28 13:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Thu Jan 28 14:05:00 2016 EST'  
REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST - FLORIDA 
'Fri Jan 29 13:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 29 15:50:00 2016 EST'  
REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST – ORANGE, BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, OSCEOLA, POLK, SEMINOLE, 
SUMTER, VOLUSIA  
'Fri Jan 29 13:58:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 29 14:58:00 2016 EST'  
REQUIRED WEEKLY TEST – BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, ORANGE, OSCEOLA, SEMINOLE, 
VOLUSIA, SUMTER, FLORIDA  
'Sun Feb 28 03:05:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Feb 28 03:20:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – ORANGE, OSCEOLA  
'Tue Feb 16 03:47:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 04:32:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA  
'Tue Feb 16 03:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 04:35:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - BREVARD 
'Tue Feb 16 04:25:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 04:55:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - BREVARD 
'Tue Feb 16 04:22:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 05:07:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – BREVARD, OSCEOLA 
'Tue Feb 16 04:43:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 05:43:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - MARION  
'Wed Feb 24 08:44:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 09:44:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – PASCO, POLK, SUMTER  
'Wed Feb 24 09:49:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 10:19:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – SUMTER, POLK  
'Wed Feb 24 09:52:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 10:22:00 2016 EST'  
CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY - FLORIDA 

'Sun Mar  6 10:34:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Mar  6 12:34:00 2016 EST'  

CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY – BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, ORANGE, OSCEOLA, POLK, 

SEMINOLE, SUMTER, VOLUSIA 

'Sun Mar  6 11:25:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Mar  6 13:25:00 2016 EST'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - BREVARD 

'Thu Mar 24 17:10:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 18:10:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - LAKE 

'Thu Mar 24 20:29:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:14:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - MARION 

'Thu Mar 24 20:34:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:04:00 2016 EDT'  

TORNADO WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Thu Mar 24 21:10:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:55:00 2016 EDT'  



TORNADO WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Thu Mar 24 21:11:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:56:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA 

'Fri Mar 25 14:58:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 15:58:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – OSCEOLA, BREVARD 

'Fri Mar 25 15:22:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 16:22:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Sat Mar 26 17:44:00 2016 EDT' to 'Sat Mar 26 18:44:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – ORANGE, LAKE, SEMINOLE, VOLUSIA 

'Sat Mar 26 19:00:00 2016 EDT' to 'Sat Mar 26 19:15:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Sat Mar 26 19:23:00 2016 EDT' to 'Sat Mar 26 19:53:00 2016 EDT'  

REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST - FLORIDA 

'Mon Mar 28 13:50:00 2016 EDT' to 'Mon Mar 28 15:50:00 2016 EDT'  

REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST – ORANGE, BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, OSCEOLA, POLK, SEMINOLE, 

SUMTER, VOLUSIA 

'Mon Mar 28 13:56:00 2016 EDT' to 'Mon Mar 28 14:56:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Tue Mar 29 15:43:00 2016 EDT' to 'Tue Mar 29 16:28:00 2016 EDT'  

 

 

WRBW 65.3 BUZZR: 

Children’s Spots – WOGX 65.3 

 1/2/16 & 1/9/16 

 2/6/16 & 2/13/16 

 3/5/16 & 3/12/16 

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – ORANGE, SEMINOLE, OSCEOLA  
'Fri Jan 15 10:55:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 15 11:55:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - BREVARD  
'Fri Jan 15 11:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 15 12:05:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – POLK, SUMTER  
'Sun Jan 17 03:16:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 03:46:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - BREVARD  
'Sun Jan 17 04:31:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 05:16:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA  
'Sun Jan 17 05:41:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 06:26:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – ORANGE, LAKE, SEMINOLE, VOLUSIA 
'Fri Jan 22 10:36:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 11:36:00 2016 EST'  



SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - FLAGLER  
'Fri Jan 22 10:38:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 11:08:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - VOLUSIA  
'Fri Jan 22 11:46:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 12:31:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - BOLUSIA  
'Fri Jan 22 11:49:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 12:34:00 2016 EST'  
CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY- BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, ORANGE, OSCEOLA, SEMINOLE, SUMTER, 
VOLUSIA  
'Thu Jan 28 13:41:00 2016 EST' to 'Thu Jan 28 15:41:00 2016 EST'  
CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY – BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, ORANGE, OSCEOLA, POLK, 
SEMINOLE, SUMTER, VOLUSIA 
'Thu Jan 28 13:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Thu Jan 28 14:05:00 2016 EST'  
REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST - FLORIDA  
'Fri Jan 29 13:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 29 15:50:00 2016 EST'  
REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST – ORANGE, BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, OSCEOLA, POLK, SEMINOLE, 
SUMTER, VOLUSIA  
'Fri Jan 29 13:58:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 29 14:58:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – ORANGE, OSCEOLA  
'Tue Feb 16 03:47:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 04:32:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA  
'Tue Feb 16 03:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 04:35:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - BREVARD  
'Tue Feb 16 04:25:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 04:55:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - BREVARD  
'Tue Feb 16 04:22:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 05:07:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – BREVARD, OSCEOLA  
'Tue Feb 16 04:43:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 05:43:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - MARION 
'Wed Feb 24 08:44:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 09:44:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – SUMTER, POLK  
'Wed Feb 24 09:52:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 10:22:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – PASCO, POLK, SUMTER  
'Wed Feb 24 09:49:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 10:19:00 2016 EST'  
CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY - FLORIDA 

'Sun Mar  6 10:34:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Mar  6 12:34:00 2016 EST'  

CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY – BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, ORANGE, OSCEOLA, POLK, 

SEMINOLE, SUMTER, VOLUSIA 

'Sun Mar  6 11:25:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Mar  6 13:25:00 2016 EST'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - BREVARD 

'Thu Mar 24 17:10:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 18:10:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - LAKE 

'Thu Mar 24 20:29:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:14:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - MARION 

'Thu Mar 24 20:34:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:04:00 2016 EDT'  

TORNADO WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Thu Mar 24 21:10:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:55:00 2016 EDT'  



TORNADO WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Thu Mar 24 21:11:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:56:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA 

'Fri Mar 25 14:58:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 15:58:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – OSCEOLA, BREVARD 

'Fri Mar 25 15:22:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 16:22:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Sat Mar 26 17:44:00 2016 EDT' to 'Sat Mar 26 18:44:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – ORANGE, LAKE, SEMINOLE, VOLUSIA 

'Sat Mar 26 19:00:00 2016 EDT' to 'Sat Mar 26 19:15:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Sat Mar 26 19:23:00 2016 EDT' to 'Sat Mar 26 19:53:00 2016 EDT'  

REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST - FLORIDA 

'Mon Mar 28 13:50:00 2016 EDT' to 'Mon Mar 28 15:50:00 2016 EDT'  

REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST – ORANGE, BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, OSCEOLA, POLK, SEMINOLE, 

SUMTER, VOLUSIA 

'Mon Mar 28 13:56:00 2016 EDT' to 'Mon Mar 28 14:56:00 2016 EDT'  

 SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Tue Mar 29 15:43:00 2016 EDT' to 'Tue Mar 29 16:28:00 2016 EDT'  

 

 

WRBW 65.4 HEROES & ICONS: 

Children’s Spots – WOGX 65.4  

 1/2/16 & 1/9/16 

 2/6/16 & 2/13/16 

 3/5/16 & 3/12/16 

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – ORANGE, SEMINOLE, OSCEOLA  
'Fri Jan 15 10:55:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 15 11:55:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - BREVARD  
'Fri Jan 15 11:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 15 12:05:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – POLK, SUMTER  
'Sun Jan 17 03:16:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 03:46:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - BREVARD  
'Sun Jan 17 04:31:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 05:16:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA 
'Sun Jan 17 05:41:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Jan 17 06:26:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – ORANGE, LAKE, SEMINOLE, VOLUSIA  
'Fri Jan 22 10:36:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 11:36:00 2016 EST'  



SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - FLAGLER  
'Fri Jan 22 10:38:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 11:08:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - VOLUSIA  
'Fri Jan 22 11:46:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 12:31:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - VOLUSIA  
'Fri Jan 22 11:49:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 22 12:34:00 2016 EST'  
CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY - BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, ORANGE, OSCEOLA, SEMINOLE, SUMTER, 
VOLUSIA  
'Thu Jan 28 13:41:00 2016 EST' to 'Thu Jan 28 15:41:00 2016 EST'  
CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY - BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, ORANGE, OSCEOLA, POLK, 
SEMINOLE, SUMTER, VOLUSIA  
'Thu Jan 28 13:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Thu Jan 28 14:05:00 2016 EST'  
REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST - FLORIDA  
'Fri Jan 29 13:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 29 15:50:00 2016 EST'  
REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST – ORANGE, BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, OSCEOLA, POLK, SEMINOLE, 
SUMTER, VOLUSIA  
'Fri Jan 29 13:58:00 2016 EST' to 'Fri Jan 29 14:58:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – ORANGE, OSCEOLA  
'Tue Feb 16 03:47:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 04:32:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA  
'Tue Feb 16 03:50:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 04:35:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - BREVARD  
'Tue Feb 16 04:25:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 04:55:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING - BREVARD  
'Tue Feb 16 04:22:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 05:07:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – BREVARD, OSCEOLA 
'Tue Feb 16 04:43:00 2016 EST' to 'Tue Feb 16 05:43:00 2016 EST'  
SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - MARION 
'Wed Feb 24 08:44:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 09:44:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – PASCO, POLK, SUMTER  
'Wed Feb 24 09:49:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 10:19:00 2016 EST'  
TORNADO WARNING – SUMTER, POLK  
'Wed Feb 24 09:52:00 2016 EST' to 'Wed Feb 24 10:22:00 2016 EST'  
CHILD ABDUCTION EMERGENCY – BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, ORANGE, OSCEOLA, POLK, 

SEMINOLE, SUMTER, VOLUSIA 

'Sun Mar  6 11:25:00 2016 EST' to 'Sun Mar  6 13:25:00 2016 EST'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - BREVARD 

'Thu Mar 24 17:10:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 18:10:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - LAKE 

'Thu Mar 24 20:29:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:14:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - MARION 

'Thu Mar 24 20:34:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:04:00 2016 EDT'  

TORNADO WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Thu Mar 24 21:10:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:55:00 2016 EDT'  

TORNADO WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Thu Mar 24 21:11:00 2016 EDT' to 'Thu Mar 24 21:56:00 2016 EDT'  



SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – BREVARD, ORANGE, OSCEOLA 

'Fri Mar 25 14:58:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 15:58:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – OSCEOLA, BREVARD 

'Fri Mar 25 15:22:00 2016 EDT' to 'Fri Mar 25 16:22:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Sat Mar 26 17:44:00 2016 EDT' to 'Sat Mar 26 18:44:00 2016 EDT'  

 SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING – ORANGE, LAKE, SEMINOLE, VOLUSIA 

'Sat Mar 26 19:00:00 2016 EDT' to 'Sat Mar 26 19:15:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Sat Mar 26 19:23:00 2016 EDT' to 'Sat Mar 26 19:53:00 2016 EDT'  

REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST - FLORIDA 

'Mon Mar 28 13:50:00 2016 EDT' to 'Mon Mar 28 15:50:00 2016 EDT'  

REQUIRED MONTHLY TEST – ORANGE, BREVARD, FLAGLER, LAKE, MARION, OSCEOLA, POLK, SEMINOLE, 

SUMTER, VOLUSIA 

'Mon Mar 28 13:56:00 2016 EDT' to 'Mon Mar 28 14:56:00 2016 EDT'  

SEVERE THUNDERSTORM WARNING - OSCEOLA 

'Tue Mar 29 15:43:00 2016 EDT' to 'Tue Mar 29 16:28:00 2016 EDT'  

 

 

 

 


