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From: Jana Blankenship
To: Rachel Wilson; Ann Nielson; Treena Dixon
Subject: Fw: Conservative Outsiders PAC, EST. 2515 - NAB and Proof of Payment (WK of 3/25)
Date: Friday, March 22, 2024 8:44:13 AM
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FYI - thank you!  


This is on KALL - 


Jana


From: Donley, Brian <Brian.Donley@Katzmedia.com>
Sent: Friday, March 22, 2024 7:14 AM
To: Katy Brown Jones <kbrownjones@bonneville.com>; Deanne Tetzl <dtetzl@ksl.com>;
SLCRadioTraffic@bonneville.com <SLCRadioTraffic@bonneville.com>; paul.haley@cumulus.com
<paul.haley@cumulus.com>; Katherine Grofic <Katherine.Grofic@cumulus.com>;
SLCPoliticalGroup@cumulus.com <SLCPoliticalGroup@cumulus.com>; Jana Blankenship
<jana@bwaymedia.com>; Holly Johnson <Holly.Johnson@townsquaremedia.com>;
jessica.danel@townsquaremedia.com <jessica.danel@townsquaremedia.com>
Cc: Homan, Angela <Angela.Homan@Katzmedia.com>
Subject: Conservative Outsiders PAC, EST. 2515 - NAB and Proof of Payment (WK of 3/25)
 
Good morning,
 
Below please find the proof of payment for the week of 3/25 – plan to continue with the current
traffic until further notice.
 
PROOF OF PAYMENT – WK of 3/25
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Notification of Electronic Payment

This message confirms that MEDIUM BUYING LLC has initiated an electronic
payment to KATZ RADIO via FastPay's ePay solution.
Please see the payment details below.

Total Amount

$9,919.50

Company Vendor
MEDIUM BUYING LLC KATZ RADIO
Memo

UT SEN - COPAC - 3.23-3.29

Estimate #

2515
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Notification of Electronic Payment

This message confirms that MEDIUM BUYING LLC has initiated an
electronic payment to KATZ RADIO via FastPay's ePay solution.
Please see the payment details below.

Total Amount

$9,919.50

Company Vendor
MEDIUM BUYING LLC KATZ RADIO
Memo

UT SEN - COPAC - 3.16-3.22

Estimate #
2515








 
Thanks!


Brian Donley
Vice President, Sales
Katz Radio Group
333 East City Avenue | Suite 510 I Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004
Brian.Donley@Katzmedia.com
Phone & Fax: 215.557.4254
Pronouns: He/Him/His


 
 


From: Donley, Brian 
Sent: Friday, March 15, 2024 10:03 AM
To: Katy Brown Jones <kbrownjones@bonneville.com>; Deanne Tetzl <dtetzl@ksl.com>;
SLCRadioTraffic@bonneville.com; paul.haley@cumulus.com; Katherine Grofic
<Katherine.Grofic@cumulus.com>; SLCPoliticalGroup@cumulus.com; 'jana@bwaymedia.com'
<jana@bwaymedia.com>; Holly Johnson <Holly.Johnson@townsquaremedia.com>; Jessica Danel
<jessica.danel@townsquaremedia.com>
Cc: Homan, Angela <Angela.Homan@Katzmedia.com>
Subject: New Placement - Conservative Outsiders PAC, EST. 2515 - NAB and Proof of Payment (WK
of 3/18)
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Good morning,
 
We issued new schedules for Conservative Outsiders PAC, EST. 2515. Attached please find the NAB
and Below the Proof of Payment for the week of 3/18 – payments will be issued weekly, and I’ll
share proof of payment as they’re received. We’re waiting on the Spot/Traffic, but the buyer hopes
to have it by early afternoon.
 
PROOF OF PAYMENT – WK of 3/18


 
 
Thanks,
 
Brian Donley
Vice President, Sales
Katz Radio Group
333 East City Avenue | Suite 510 I Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004
Brian.Donley@Katzmedia.com
Phone & Fax: 215.557.4254
Pronouns: He/Him/His
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