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NEWSPAPER PUBLIC NOTICE g. / 4 20/ q

W 20 %ﬂ | hereby certify that a notice of the filing of the application for renewal of license of FM Translator
_::____..L.{call sign] has been accomplished in the manner prescribed by Section 73.3580 of the Rules and
Regulations of the Federal Communications Commission.
o
The notice appeared in THE ohnrste NEWS g ‘\H"Z@/newspaper in general circulation in
[location of paper, which should be the station’s community of license as well] on the following

date(s): ,D/s! = ( Se e Enaid s
PMQM"‘O O@Oéﬁ?“{‘\«’f\j WRT TN QUNE

Attached hereto is a copy of an affidavit of an employee of the newspaper attesting to the fact of
publication, supplying a copy of the notice as it appeared in the newspaper, and specifying the date(s) on
which the notice appeared.

]

. Applicant: /ﬂ I \i,p (:T// )@’njg@g

.S el

Tite:___ ¥ RS 1 ey
{

Dated: /(’[g'“’/

This publication is issued periodically to keep Pillsbury Winthrop Shaw Pittman LLP clients and other interested parties
informed of current legal developments that may affect or otherwise be of interest to them. The comments contained herein
do not constitute legal opinion and should not be regarded as a substilute for legal advice.

© 2011 Pillsbury Winthrop Shaw Pittman LLP. All Rights Reserved.
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| called Sherry Stanley at the Carroll News and she sald it ran on the 5™ the same week | called
her (Oct) and she would send you the affidavit and invoice...let me know when and if you get it.

thanks...j

A

From: Dana Evans : .
Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2011 2:57 PM

To: John Hill

Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

No, nothing yet

From: John Hill

Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2011 2:55 PM

To: Dana Evans

Subject: FW: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

Dana they were going to do this again since they had no record- have you received anything yet?
j . .

5

“From: Sl SR |

Sent: Monday, Sgptember 26, 2011 11:56 PM

To: John Hill

Subject: Re: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

| just received an e-mail from NS from Mount Airy News. She said

office is still at THE CARROLL NEWS which is on one of your e-mails, July 19. She said Sinuming
boss's name is YN . | suggest you call S tomorrow at 276-728-7311. If
you can't get the information you need then | can give you the publisher's address and phone
number. His name is Sgiiisaammmene and he lives here in Mount Airy. He's head of Heartland
Publications. I'm assuming this is something WBFJ must have proof of and I'll make sure you get

it!

----- Original Message
From: John Hill- - &+
To: SR

Sent: Monday, September 26, 2011 11:19 PM

Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

ThanksW@...j

From:

Sent: Monday, September 26, 2011 10:38 AM

To: John Hill : _

Subject: Fw: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

| sent an e-mail on 9/21 to friend who works at Mount Airy News about SRR ond no

reply yet. (TR | did sce on line that Sy still works for
"Heartland Publications” so | sent her an e-mail also. GeEEEINEGEIG—G—G—G—_ GGG




I'l let you know but it looks like you may heed to contact the rhain man,
publisher (Heartland Publications) as the last resort. Give it another day or so and see if they

respond.

-

----- Original Message --—- ,

To: John Hill

Sent: Wednesday, September 21, 2011 7:44 PM

Subject: Re: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

John,

| know ount Airy News better than anyone else. She usually knows

a lot about everything going with the newspaper. Let me ashgmpmmmme{irst. Can | show her part
of this e-mall or just mention it to her first. !

Do you want proof this was actually run in the newspaper (Simple Pleasures)??

I'l let you know what | find out about the ad. A

-
)

----- Original Message -----

From: John Hill. -

To: jresinsmSsnOER

Sent: Wednesday, September 21, 2011 12:07 PM

Subject: FW: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

,..I still haven't heard anything back from Sherry Stanley about this | told you about at the
beach concerning WBFJ... o
a way you could check on this in a low key way. | hate fo bring you into this but | need to put

this in my file as a legal requirement.

Let me know what you find out. By chance if they did send me something | never got it and
would need them to remail or resend it...we never were billed either.

Thanks..j

Below you can see the previous emails and my first requests and the follow up emails. Is there -

From: Dana Evans
Sent: Monday, September 12, 2011 11:05 AM

To: John Hill
Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

Not one thing, sorry




From: John Hill ,

Sent: Friday, September 09, 2011 12:51 PM

To: Dana Evans

Subject: FW: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

Dana- did you ever receive anything from them???7? j

From: Sherry Stanley [mailto:sstanley@heartlandpublications.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2011 3:44 PM

To: John Hill :

Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

Can do John.

Sherry L. Stanley

Advertising Manager

The Carroll News

276-728-7311 office

276-728-4119 fax
sstanley(@heartlandpublications.com

~The Mount Airy News

Simple Pleasurés

From: John Hill [mailto:john@wbfj.org]

Sent: Tue 7/19/2011 3:23 PM

To: Sherry Stanley

Cc: Dana Evans; Wally Decker

Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

Sherry...yes, we need an affidavit and tearsheet would be nice also. Please bill to

WBFJ-FM

Attn: Dana Evans

1249 N. Trade St.
Winston-Salem, NC 27101

If there are any questions please call my direct number 336-354-0446. Thanks a lot]

Thanks again Sherry! j

| From: Sherry Stanley [mailto:sstanley@heartiandpublications.com]

Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2011 1:08 PM
To: John Hill
Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

It sure did. Do you need an affadavit?? Or tearsheets??

Sherry L. Stanley




Advertising Manager

The Carroll News

276-728-7311 office

276-728-4119 fax
sstanley@heartlandpublications.com
The Mount Airy News

Simple Pleasures

From: John Hill [mailto:john@wbfj.org]

Sent: Tue 7/19/2011 12:56 PM

To: Sherry Stanley . '
Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

Hi...just following up to make sure the announcement ran...thanks a lot! John Hill

From: John Hill

Sent: Monday, June 13, 2011 3:27 PM

To: 'sstanley@heartlandpublications.com'’

Cc: Dana Evans; Wally Decker

Subject: LEGAL Announcement for WBFI-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

This Legal announcement should run once as soonh as possible... June 22" is fine if that is the
next time you publish. Please send the invoice and the affidavit of publication to:

WBFJ-FM

- Attn: Dana'Evans

1249 N. Trade St.
Winston-Salem, NC 27101

If there are any questions please call my direct number 336-354-0446. Thanks a lot!

John Hill
Technical Director
WBFJ-FM

NOTICE OF RENEWAL (spaces can be removed for publication)

Triad Family Network, Inc. hereby gives notice that on June 13, 2011, it filed an
application with the Federal Communications Commission seeking to renew its
license to operate the following FM Translator Station in Fancy Gap, Virginia:



=1

FM Translator station W276BA located on Fancy Gap Mountain near Wobdlawn,
Virginia operates on channel 276 with a power of 10 Watts and serves the Fancy
Gap, VA (and Mt. Airy, NC) area.

The translator station is engaged in the rebroadcasting of station WBFJ-FM,
Winston-Salem, NC, Channel 207, Individuals who wish to advise the FCC of facts
relating to our renewal application and to whether this station has operated in the
public interest should file comments and petitions with the Commission by August
1, 2011, Further information concerning the FCC’s broadcast renewal process
may be obtained from the FCC, Washington, DC. 20554.
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John Hill

From: Dana Evans

Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2011 12:156 PM
To: John Hill; Sherry Stanley

Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC
Importance: High

Hi Sherry,
| have received a billing from Heartland (account number 192748). However, we have not received an

affidavit as proof that this has been run. This is extrerely urgent for us...the FCC requires that we run
this advertisement and we must prove to them that it has been done. | will not be able to pay this invoice
until proof has been received.

Can you please fast track this?

Thanks,

Dana Evans

Staff Accountant

Philip T. Watson, PA

& WBFJ FM/AM

12489 Trade Street

Winston-Salem, NC 27101

336-777-1008

336-777-1032 Fax

=t

¥

From: John Hill

Sent: Monday, August 15, 2011 2:07 PM

To: Sherry Stanley

Cc: Dana Evans

Subject: FW: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

Sherry don’t mean to be a pest but | never did get the affidavit or invoice for this. Is there anything else we
need to do? Thanks john

From: John Hill

Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2011 3:23 PM

To: 'Sherry Stanley'

Cc: Dana Evans; Wally Decker

Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

Sherry...yes, we need an affidavit and tearsheet would be nice also. Please bill to :
WBFJ-FM

Attn: Dana Evans

1249 N. Trade St.

Winston-Salem, NC 27101

If there are any questions please call my direct number 336-354-0446. Thanks a lot!

Thanks again Sherry! j

From: Sherry Stanley [mailto:sstanley@heartlandpublications.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2011 1:08 PM

To: John Hill .
Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

11/15/2011
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It sure did. Do you need an affadavit?? Or tearsheets??

Sherry L. Stanley

Advertising Manager

The Carroll News

276-728-7311 office

276-728-4119 fax
sstanley@heartlandpublications.com
The Mount Airy News

Simple Pleasures

From: John Hill [mailto:;john@wbfj.org]

Sent: Tue 7/19/2011 12:56 PM

To: Sherry Stanley

Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

Hi...ju's“t1 following up to rr;ake sure the announcement ran...thanks a lot! John Hill

From: John Hill

Sent: Monday, June 13, 2011 3:27 PM

To: 'sstanIey@heartlandpublications.com‘

Cc: Dana Evans; Wally Decker

Subject: LEGAL Announcement for WBF3-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

This Legal announcement should run once as soon as possible... June 290 g fine if that is the next time you
publish. Please send the invoice and the affidavit of publication to:

WBFJ-FM

Attn: Dana Evans

1249 N. Trade St.
Winston-Salem, NC 27101

If there are any questions please call my direct number 336-354-0446. Thanks a lot!

John Hill
Technical Director
WBFJ-FM

NOTICE OF RENEWAL (spaces can be removed for publication)

Triad Family Network, Inc. hereby gives notice that on June 13, 2011, it filed an application with
the Federal Communications Commission seeking to renew its license to operate the following FM
Translator Station in Fancy Gap, Virginia: '

FM Translator station W276BA located on Fancy Gap Mountain near Woodlawn, Virginia
operates on channel 276 with a power of 10 Watts and serves the Fancy Gap, VA (and Mt. Airy,

11/15/2011
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 NC) area,

The translator station is engaged in the rebroadcasting of station WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC,
Channel 207. Individuals who wish to advise the FCC of facts relating to our renewal application
and to whether this station has operated in the public interest should file comments and petitions
with the Commission by August 1, 2011 Further information concerning the FCC’s broadcast
renewal process may be obtained from the FCC, Washington, DC. 20554.

11/15/2011
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From: John Hill

Sent:  Wednesday, November 02, 2011 2:04 PM
To: ‘Sherry Stanley'

Cc: Dana Evans

Subject: FW: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

Sherry... Thanks for airing the announcement per our phone conversation a few weeks back...is the Bill
and affidavit on the way? We want to get you paid and get this on file asap. Thanks a lot... John Hill

Triad Family Network, Inc (WBFJ-FM)
Attn: Dana Evans

1249 Trade Street

Winston-Salem, NC 27101

From: Dana Evans
Sent:"Monday, September 12, 2011 11:05 AM

To: John Hill ;
Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

Not one thing, sorry

From: John Hill © '
Sent: Friday, September 09, 2011 12:51 PM

To: Dana Evans
Subject: FW: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC-Virginia paper

Dana- did you ever receive anything from them???7 j

From: Sherry Stanley [mailto:sstanIey@heartlandpublications.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2011 3:44 PM

To: John Hill
Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

Can do John.

Sherry L. Stanley

Advertising Manager

The Carroll News

276-728-7311 office

276-728-4119 fax
sstanley(@heartlandpublications.com
The Mount Airy News

Simple Pleasures

11/15/2011
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* From: John Hill [mailto:john@wbfj.org]
Sent: Tue 7/19/2011 3:23 PM
To: Sherry Stanley
Cc: Dana Evans; Wally Decker
Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

Sherry...yes, we need an affidavit and tearsheet would be nice also. Please bill to :

WBFJ-FM

Attn: Dana Evans

1249 N. Trade St.
Winston-Salem, NC 27101

if there are any questions please call my direct number 336-354-0446. Thanks a lot!

Thanks again Sherry!

From: Sherry Stanley [mailto:sstanley@heartlandpublications.com] .
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2011 1:08 PM

To: John Hill _

Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBF3J-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

It sure did. Do yéu need an affadavit?? Or tearsheets??
=t

Sherry L. Stanley

Advertising Manager

The Carroll News

276-728-7311 office

276-728-4119 fax
sstanley@heartlandpublications.com
The Mount Airy News

Simple Pleasures

From: John Hill [mailto:john@wbfj.org]
Sent: Tue 7/19/2011 12:56 PM
To: Sherry Stanley
. Subject: RE: LEGAL Announcement for WBFI-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

Hi...just following up to make sure the announcement ran...thanks a lot! John Hill

From: John Hill

Sent: Monday, June 13, 2011 3:27 PM

To; ‘sstanley@heartlandpublications.com‘

Cc: Dana Evans; Wally Decker

Subject: LEGAL Announcement for WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem, NC

This Legal announcement should run once as soon as possible... June 2204 s fine if that is the next time you

11/15/2011
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publish. Please send the invoice and the affidavit of publication to:

WBFJ-FM

Attn: Dana Evans

1249 N. Trade St.
Winston-Salem, NC 27101

If there are any questions please call my direct number 336-354-0446. Thanks a lot!

John Hili
Technical Director
WBFJ-FM

NOTICE OF RENEWAL (spaces can be removed for publication)

Triad Family Network, Inc. hereby gives notice that on June 13, 2011, it filed an application with
the Federal Communications Commission seeking to renew its license to operate the following
FM Translator Station in Fancy Gap, Virginia:

FM Translator station W276BA located on Fancy Gap Mountain near Woodlawn, Virginia
operates on channel 276 with a power of 10 Watts and serves the Fancy Gap, VA (and Mt. Airy,
NC) area.

The translator station is engaged in the rebroadcasting of station WBFJ-FM, Winston-Salem,
NC, Channel 207. Individuals who wish to advise the FCC of facts relating to our renewal
application and to whether this station has operated in the public interest should file comments
and petitions with the Commission by August 1, 2011. Further information concerning the
FCC’s broadcast renewal process may be obtained from the FCC, Washington, DC. 20554,

11/15/2011



A Certifiéate Showing thé.Pﬁblication of
an Order of Publication in
The Carroll News

To the Judge of the Circuit Court of
Carroll County, Virginia:

L &Z‘)M dvzf//uW , an
employee of Iﬂfeartland Publications, LLC dba The Carroll
News, a Newspaper published weekly on Wednesday of

each week of the year, do certify that the foregoing copy of
attached Legal Notice, has been published for /
consecu’ave weeks in said Newspaper on the following

dates: V/@Wb&v 5’, A9/ )

and that said Newspaper is printed wholly in English and is

entered as periodicals class mail in the Town of Hillsville,
Virginia; and that said Newspaper has a paid up list of bona
fide subscribers voluntarily engaged in such, who have paid,
or agreed to pay a stated price of $31.00 per year for such

subscriptions, and for a definite time.

Given under this my hand this / ( day of

NB/UQ/NML/ 2011,

(bucd st Muv

The Carroll I\(f)ews
PO Box 487
Hillsville, VA 24343
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