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Monday: On Mondays WIHS Journal you can learn about the program Grief Share. A 
program that offers support through video teaching Bible lessons, and friends who have 
been through the same road as you. Anissa Porticelli, will be speaking to Gloria Rainey 
one of the head facilitators who recently lost her husband. You can hear this interview 
at 3:15 AM, 12:13 PM, and 5:49 PM right here live in local WIHS!

Tuesday: On Tuesdays WIHS Journal you can hear Ray Bennett, and Lucy Snow from the 
Connecticut prayer walkers. Ray Bennett, will present a lecture on May 2 talking about 
the Constitution spelled out and simplified. Learn more about what the Constitution has 
to say. You can hear this interview at 3:15 AM, 12:30 PM, and 5:49 PM right here and 
live in local WIHS!

Wednesday & Thursday: On the WIHS Journal today with Paul Kretschmer, hear the 
story of a Christian marriage therapist who has also written a book telling a story from 
his home country of New Zealand. Gordon Baker has lived a full life with jobs in many 
different fields. In his latest life, Gordon Baker has become a trained professional 
assisting couples with marriage issues from the Biblical perspective. He has also written 
a book telling the story of people on the other side of the world, but with issues and 
challenges very much like people in southern New England. Hear the WIHS Journal 
today at 3:15am; also at 12:13 & 5:49pm here on WIHS Middletown—Good News 4 
Connecticut!

Friday: On today’s WIHS Journal with Paul Kretschmer you’ll hear how to use a backup 
generator for your home in a safe manner. Kris Kaiser is a representative of the trade 
organization for backup generator manufacturer. There are tips on how to shop for a 
generator, how it should be installed and when to turn over those jobs to a trained 
professional. The WIHS Journal airs today at 3:15am; also at 12:13 & 5:49pm here on 
WIHS Middletown—Good News 4 Connecticut!

Saturday: Hear an amazing story about a woman who did not follow through with the 
suggestions of doctors wanting her to abort 1 or more of her triplets. That and more 
today at 3:15 am, 12:15 pm and 5:10 pm on the WIHS Journal its News & Public Affairs!




