
WIHS Journal Promos the Week of May 23-28, 2016

Monday: On Mondays WIHS Journal, Anissa Porticelli, will speak to the director of The New 
England School of Supernatural Ministry. Mandy Adendorff, will go into detail of her testimony of 
healing from learning about the supernatural. The school is a ministry school for all ages, and 
offers, a one-year program and is part time. The school’s motive is to see believers flourish in 
their walk with the Lord. You can hear this interview at 3:15am; 12:13PM and 5:49PM right here 
on your live and local station WIHS.

Tuesday: On today’s WIHS Journal, hear the views of educators on the issue of teacher 
evaluation—should it be linked to the standard testing all students must take in Connecticut 
schools, or to the actual results of classroom teaching followed by normal class work tests? Two 
officials from the Connecticut Education Association spoke about that recently in Hartford, as well 
as a representative from administrators. Hear this broadcast, produced with the assistance of the 
Connecticut Network on today’s WIHS Journal with Paul Kretschmer. It airs at 3:15am; also at 
12:13 & 5:49pm here on WIHS Middletown—Live and Local 24/7!

Wednesday: On today’s WIHS Journal with Paul Kretschmer, hear Greg Yoder speak to 
evangelistic efforts directed toward children. Yoder is now the executive director of Keys for Kids 
Ministries, formerly known as the Children’s Bible Hour. In a conversation with Ruth Kramer, Greg 
Yoder describes how receptive children are to the Good News of Jesus Christ, and how Keys for 
Kids provides materials for use anywhere in the world to meet that curiosity and draw youngsters 
into the Kingdom of Jesus Christ. Hear this conversation today, assisted by Mission Network 
News on the WIHS Journal. It airs at 3:15am; also at 12:13 & 5:49pm here on WIHS 
Middletown—Live and Local 24/7!

Thursday & Friday: On today’s WIHS Journal with Paul Kretschmer, hear excerpts from a news 
briefing conducted by Connecticut Senior Senator Richard Blumenthal on defense of the United 
States. The measure is known as the National Defense Authorization Act. It covers what the 
defense department will be authorized to do in terms of materials to protect and defend the 
country. Members of Connecticut industry who help produce the materials for the defenders to do 
their job are also heard in this presentation, produced with the cooperation of the Connecticut 
Network. Hear the WIHS Journal with Paul Kretschmer today at 3:15am; also at 12:13 & 5:49pm 
here on WIHS Middletown—Live and Local 24/7!

Saturday: On today’s WIHS Journal with Paul Kretschmer, hear an interview with a chaplain 
assigned to the Billy Graham Rapid Response Team. Ginger Sanders serves with the outreach of 
the Billy Graham Association that ministers to people caught up in disasters and those who seek 
to help and serve them at a time of intense need. Ginger Sanders speaks from the heart of one 
knows firsthand what needs to be said and the support needed by those in perhaps the most 
trying time of life. Hear this broadcast produced in cooperation with Dan Wooding from Assist 
News Service. The WIHS Journal airs today at 3:15am; also at 12:15 & 5:10pm here on WIHS 
Middletown—Live and Local 24/7!


