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10 Minute Programs Airing at 3:15am, 12:13 & 5:49pm Monday through Friday
15 Minute Programs Airing at 3:15am, 12:15 & 5:10pm Saturday

June 18-June 23, 2018

Monday: On Mondays WIHS journal, Anissa will be speaking to Josh Eli, the Manager 
of Word of Life, in Schroon Lake, New York. He will talk about how the ministry got 
started, and share a little bit how the ministry has changed his life and  shaped him,  into 
the man of God that he is today. You can hear his interview at 3:15 AM, 12:13 PM, and 
5:49 PM right here and live in local WIHS.

Tuesday: On Tuesdays WIHS journal, Anissa Porticelli, will be speaking to Gilles (Jills) 
Gently, he is the assistant director of the New Haven Teen Challenge. Today he will 
share his testimony of coming off of heroin. Also, he will talk about how he found Teen 
Challenge, and how it has changed his life. You can hear this interview at 3:15 AM, 
12:13 PM, and 5:49 PM right here on live and local Christian radio WIHS. 

Wednesday: Youth Challenge is a Christ Centered substance abuse program geared for 
men and woman. Here Gerry Williams conversation with Executive Director Esther 
Gonzalez Torres to find out more. That's happening today at 3:15 am, 12:13 pm and 5:49 
pm on the WIHS Journal it's News & Public Affairs!

Thursday & Friday:  On today’s WIHS Journal you’ll hear about a group of 
northeastern states working together to cut down the generation and travel of greenhouse 
gases in the atmosphere. From Environment America, Morgan Folger explains to Paul 
Kretschmer what effects the creation of greenhouse gases has on the planet people call 
home. The WIHS Journal airs today at 3:15am; also at 12:13 & 5:49pm here on WIHS 
Middletown—Good News 4 Connecticut!

Saturday: On today’s WIHS Journal, you’ll hear excerpts from the dedication ceremony 
for the new Engineering & Science Building on the University of Connecticut Campus in 
Storrs. Graduates of the program were on hand as well as University president Susan 
Herbst & Governor Dannel Malloy. Hear how UConn continues to improve its facilities 
in order to rank among the leader public universities in the country. The WIHS Journal, 
produced in cooperation with the Connecticut Network airs today at 3:15am; also at 
12:15 & 5:10pm here on WIHS Middletown—Good News 4 Connecticut!


