
WIHS Journal Promos For The Week of August 21-26, 2017

Monday & Tuesday: On Mondays and Tuesdays WIHS Journal Anissa 
Porticelli will speak to Ken Ham, the CEO, and founder of Answers in 
Genesis, the Creation Museum, and the world-renowned Ark Encounter. He 
will share details of how God is moving in both of his exhibits, and his 
recent opposition with the LGBT community. You can hear this interview at 
3:15, 12:13pm and 5:49PM right here on WIHS live and local 24/7. 

Wednesday & Thursday: On today’s WIHS Journal you’ll excerpts from a 
recent news conference after leaders from two groups representing 
municipal leaders sat down and talked about the state budget crisis with 
Governor Dannel Malloy. Joe DeLong represented the larger cities 
belonging to the Connecticut Conference of Municipalize and Betsy Gara 
represented the Connecticut Conference of Small Towns. They spoke 
especially of the financial strains on cities and towns depending on state aid 
in their own budgets. Hear this broadcast today on the WIHS Journal at 
3:15am; also at 12:13 & 5:49pm here on WIHS Middletown—Live and 
Local 24/7!

Friday:  Soulfest is New England's premier multiday Christian Music 
Festival located in New Hampshire at Gunstock Mountain Resort. Catch 
Gerry Williams Out And About coverage as he spoke with various campers 
attending the Festival. That's happening today at 3:15 a.m. 12:13 p.m. and 
5:49 p.m. on 104.9 FM WIHS News and Public Affairs!

Saturday: Today on the Journal you'll learn about Praise Power And Prayer 
Christian School in Windsor. It's a re-airing of an interview on Morning 
Cheer of principal Ray McMahon and his daughter Lauren McMahon who is 
one of the instructors. Join Gerry Williams and Teresa Daly for an 
informative conversation about this unique local Christian School. That's 
happening today at 3:15 am, 12:15 pm and 5:10 pm on 104.9 FM WIHS 
Live and Local!

 

 




