Alexander, Tasha

From: Fletcher, Michelle

Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2019 14:30

To: Alexander, Tasha

Subject: FW: iHeartMedia Payment #1143805

Attachments: Political_Forms__Carol Swain__WLAC__Signed (07.30.2019).pdf; Political_Forms__Carol

Swain_WNRQ__Signed (07.30.2019).pdf; Political_Forms__Carol Swain_ WUBT__Signed
(07.30.2019).pdf; WLAC WNRQ OrderConfirmation.pdf; WUBTOrderConfirmation.pdf

Attached is one credit card payment receipt with the order confirmations and political forms for Carol Swain for Mayor

Michelle Fletcher

Account Executive -Nashville Region
iHeartMedia Markets Group

>4 55 Music Square West | Nashville, TN | 37203
& 615.744.4764
MichelleFletcher@iHeartMedia.com
www.iHeartMedia.com

America’s #1 Audio Company

Reaching 9 out of 10 Americans Every Month

Radio | Digital | Social | Podcasts | Influencers | Data | Events

From: Jeff Eslick [mailto:jeff@slickmediapro.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2019 1:33 PM

To: Fletcher, Michelle

Subject: Fw: iHeartMedia Payment #1143805

Carol Swain....WUBT pre pay

From: iHeartMedia Payment Center (donotreply@iheartmedia.com) <system@sent-via.netsuite.com>
Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2019 1:31 PM

To: Jeff Eslick <jeff@slickmediapro.com>

Cc: ccrspecialinvoicing@iheartmedia.com <ccrspecialinvoicing@iheartmedia.com>

Subject: iHeartMedia Payment #1143805



Thank you for your payment!
Your payment has been successfully processed. You'll find your

transaction information below.

Jeff Eslicl
VISA — **%2865
Ref. # — 5645114933266447304059

July 30, 2019 Payment #1143805

Invoice/Order # Amount
prepayCSW2 $3,094.00
Credits $0.00

Total $3,094.00

Advertiser — Carol Swain for Mayor
Agency — Slick Media Productions
Account Executive — Michelle Fletcher

Comment — Carol Swain for Mayor WUBT Pre pay

We value your business and look forward to serving you!
Thank you for choosing iHeartMedia
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