
QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Military Services 

 

Program/Segment 

Operation Shoebox/Mary Harper 

 

Date Program Aired 

7.02.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

The program was an interview with Mary Harper and her son, Bobby, about the work they’ve 
one with Operation Shoebox for 20+ years, sending care packages to our armed forces overseas. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Handups/Assistance 

 

Program/Segment 

Ocala Outreach Foundation/Alexis “Sam” Betty and Tommy Thomas 

 

Date Program Aired 

7.09.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

The program was an interview with Sam Betty and Tommy Thomas, founders of the Ocala 
Outreach Foundation.  Discussion included ways to assist those who are on the “cusp” and are 
trying to help themselves but are unable to get assistance elsewhere. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Infrastructure/Invention 

 

Program/Segment 

PERCH Gameday Parking App  

 

Date Program Aired 

7.16.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

 

The program was an interview with JJ Paulsen, creator of the PERCH Gameday Parking app.  
Discussion included how JJ’s creation can help fill a local need with gameday parking around 
the University Florida.   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Drug addiction 

 

Program/Segment 

The Dandelion Project 

 

Date Program Aired 

7.23.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

The program was an interview with Lisa Bolton and Michelle Pepin who have both lost a child 
to addiction.  The group provides counseling and support services. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Mental Health/Building Better Men 

 

Program/Segment 

Kut Different/Jamie Gilmore and Eddie Rocker 

 

Date Program Aired 

7.30.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

 

The program was an interview with brothers Jamie Gilmore and Eddie Rocker, founders of Kut 
Different.  Discussion included ways to afford young men the opportunity to experience the 
world around them, use their talents for good, convert passion into careers, and assert authority 
over their lives. 

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Animal Homelessness 

 

Program/Segment 

V.O.C.A.L./Linda Norman 

 

Date Program Aired 

8.06.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

 

The program was an interview with Voices of Change Animal League (VOCAL) president Linda 
Norman.    Discussion included pet rescue, homeless pets, education on neuter/spay, and 
adoption. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Retirement/Aging/Dementia Care 

 

Program/Segment 

Pinnacle Retirement Advisors 

 

Date Program Aired 

8.13.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

 

The program was an interview with Gary and Dawn Crawford from Pinnacle Retirement 
Advisors.  Discussion included advice for those getting ready to retire, as well as the dementia 
center at Hospice of Marion that the group funded, and the work being done there. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Handups/Assistance 

 

Program/Segment 

Ocala Outreach Foundation/Alexis “Sam” Betty and Tommy Thomas 

 

Date Program Aired 

8.20.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

The program was an interview with Sam Betty and Tommy Thomas, founders of the Ocala 
Outreach Foundation.  Discussion included ways to assist those who are on the “cusp” and are 
trying to help themselves, but are unable to get assistance elsewhere 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Equine Industry/Literacy 

 

Program/Segment 

Ocala Horse Alliance 

 

Date Program Aired 

8.27.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

 

The program was an interview with Ellie Truman, president of the Ocala Horse Alliance.  
Discussion included the goals of OHA as well as their partnership with Marion County Schools 
on the Black Beauty Reading Initiative directed at fourth graders. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Animal Welfare 

 

Program/Segment 

SPCA of Ocala/Molly’s Law 

 

Date Program Aired 

9.03.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

 

The program was an interview with Lilly Baron, president of the SPCA of Ocala and catalyst for 
Molly’s Law, a law that puts animal abusers on a statewide registry.  Discussion included the 
unveiling of the Molly of Molly’s Law statue, and the Molly’s Law documentary on PBS. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Veterans Services 

 

Program/Segment 

10 Can, Inc. 

 

Date Program Aired 

9.10.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

 

The program was an interview with Dr. Matthew Burke, founder of 10 Can Inc.  Discussion 
included inspiration for the organization, how 10 Can Inc. helps military families, and upcoming 
events. 

        

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Breast Cancer Awareness/Mammogram Assistance 

 

Program/Segment 

Bunco Babes/Michelle-O-Gram 

 

Date Program Aired 

9.17.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

 

The program was an interview with Candy Homan and Stacy Carroll with Bunco Babes of 
Ocala, and Cheri Futch with Michelle-O-Gram   Discussion included upcoming breast cancer 
awareness fundraising events, and the role the Bunco Babes play in helping fund Michelle-O-
Gram, a not-for-profit mammogram assistance program. 

 

 

 

 

 

 



QUARTERLY ISSUES – PROGRAM LIST 

The following is a listing of the significant issues responded to by WOGK-FM/WYND-
FM/WNDD-FM/WNDN-FM, along with the most significant programming treatment of those 
issues for the period July 1 – September 30, 2023. 

 

Description of Issue 

Community/Substance Abuse 

 

Program/Segment 

Ocala Mayor-Elect Ben Marciano 

 

Date Program Aired 

9.24.23 

 

Time Program Aired 

0600 

 

Duration/Narration of Type and Description of Program 

Homepage, a 30-minute pre-recorded program 

 

The program was the first official interview with Ocala Mayor-Elect Ben Marciano.  Discussion 
included the substance abuse he endured in the path, mental health, physical health, and goals 
and objectives for his mayoralty. 

        

 

 


