
WMSH ISSUES AND PROGRAMS:  THIRD QUARTER 2015

ISSUE:  YOUTH PROGRAMMING

07/03/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug 
Barry spoke to Ryan Colby.  Ryan is from The Becket Fund.  He works with 
public relations on various forms of social media.  Fr. Mark Mary hoped the guest 
would inspire young people to do this type of work.

07/10/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug 
Barry talked to Trent Horn.  Trent answers philosophical questions, especially 
live on the radio.  Trent was on the show to share with young views valid 
arguments for perennial truths.

08/07/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug 
Barry spoke to Katie Prejean.  Katie is involved with teaching youth coordinators.  
Katie said young people are very distracted by social media today.

08/14/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug 
Barry talked to Michael Filamor and Linda Grijalba.  They run a successful youth 
group in Chantilly, Virginia.  Linda said a lot of young people want a sense of 
community.  They also advise young people on issues they are facing.

09/04/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug 
Barry spoke to Justin Fatica and Jeremy Rivera.  Justin and Jeremy produced a 
video of their bus tour speaking to young people across America.  Purpose is the 
key to living said Justin.

09/11/15 at 19:00…Life on the Rock…60 minutes…Fr. Mark Mary and Doug 
Barry talked to Mary Pearson.  Mary is a blogger, who addresses young ladies.  
She shared advice on dating, relationships, and modesty.

ISSUE:  FAMILY, PARENTING AND RELATIONSHIPS

07/07/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood spoke on 
guiding your child’s interior transformation.  Steve said it was important to build 
strong character in your children in their early years.  Review of our past 
mistakes can be very helpful for our improvement, Steve explained.  Finally, 
Steve mentioned how having enthusiasm is important for a joyful life.

07/14/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood talked on 
the need to instruct children to be obedient.  Obedience is not just a child’s 
mental assent to parental direction, Steve warned.  Steve said children need to 
break free of addictions suffocating their interior well-being.  Lastly, Steve 
recommended to parents to not pretend things are o.k. when they are not, make 
sure as a parent you get your rest, and for everyone to live in the truth.



08/04/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood discussed 
the interior well being of children.  The single most important thing, according to 
Steve, for children is a loving relationship.  Steve said the priority of life should 
not be focused on ourselves but on the other.

08/11/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood spoke on 
practical wisdom for daily living.  We must live with integrity all week long, 
according to Steve.  Steve noted ancient writings have wisdom that can assist us 
today.

09/01/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood spoke on 
wisdom for the family.  Steve said the Barna Group poll showed a decrease in 
interior formation among young people.  The solution, according to Steve, is to 
focus on deeply rooted interior transformation to the truth.

09/08/15 at 14:00…Faith and Family…30 minutes…Host Steve Wood spoke on 
more wisdom for the family.  Good works require the proper inspiration in order to 
perform them, Steve said.  Today’s culture has misunderstood where true 
wisdom comes from, according to Steve.

ISSUE:  HEALTH

07/01/15 at 12:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical 
psychologist, answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on 
raising their children.  A caller needed advice with his daughter who was 
physically abusive to others.

07/02/15 at 12:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical 
psychologist, answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on 
raising their children.  A caller’s sixteen-year-old was exhibiting behavior that 
could require psychological help.

08/05/15 at 12:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical 
psychologist, answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on 
raising their children.  Doctor Ray said we need to admit our faults first for true 
healing to begin.

08/06/15 at 12:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical 
psychologist, answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on 
raising their children.  Doctor Ray said the psychological and societal profile of 
the average American’s spirituality shows us an individual who has sporadic 
devotion and little consistent practice.

09/01/15 at 12:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical 
psychologist, answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on 
raising their children.  A caller needed help with feelings of guilt.



09/03/15 at 12:00…The Doctor is In…57 minutes…Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical 
psychologist, answers listeners questions concerning the healthy choices on 
raising their children.  A caller wanted advice for marriage counseling.

ISSUE:  EDUCATIONAL

07/03/15 at 13:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan 
Burke, and Thom Price taught on current events making news.  Topics covered 
according to ncregister.com were issues of free speech, and Steven Greydanus 
was on to talk about sexual hedonism in our culture.

07/10/15 at 13:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan 
Burke, and Thom Price taught on current events making news.  Topics covered 
according to ncregister.com were controversial relationships making news, and 
recognizing dangers to someone’s interior well being.

08/07/15 at 13:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan 
Burke, and Thom Price taught on current events making news.  Topics covered 
were Anthony Lilles spoke on absolutism, and Matthew Kelly was on to discuss 
interior renewal in local communities.  

08/14/15 at 13:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan 
Burke, and Thom Price taught on current events making news.  Topics covered 
were reproductive health and ancient relics.

09/12/15 at 18:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan 
Burke, and Thom Price taught on current events making news.  Topics covered 
involved annulment and divorce with guest Ben Nguyen, and Katie Warner spoke 
on leadership in our homes.

09/19/15 at 18:00…Register Radio…30 minutes…Hosts Jeanette DeMelo, Dan 
Burke, and Thom Price taught on current events making news.  Topics covered 
were the Vatican visit to Cuba, and Diana Von Glahn talked about the world 
meeting of families taking place in Philadelphia.

ISSUE:  PUBLIC INTEREST

07/12/15 at 08:30…EWTN Bookmark…30 minutes…Host Doug Keck’s weekly 
book review show discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest 
book release.  On this program, author Matthew Bunson was on to discuss the 
book entitled St. Kateri Lily of the Mohawks.  The book is a biography on the first 
Native American woman to be canonized.

07/19/15 at 08:30…EWTN Bookmark…30 minutes…Host Doug Keck’s weekly 
book review show discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest 
book release.  On this program, author Sheila Liaugminas was on to discuss her 
book entitled Non-negotiable:  Essential Principles of a Just Society & Humane 
Culture.   The book ignites dialogue about cultural issues in America.



08/02/15 at 08:30…EWTN Bookmark…30 minutes…Host Doug Keck’s weekly 
book review show discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest 
book release.  On this program, author Fr. Mitch Pacwa was on to discuss his 
book entitled The Holy Land:  An Armchair Pilgrimage.  It is a coffee table book 
that tours the major sites of Israel.

08/09/15 at 08:30…EWTN Bookmark…30 minutes…Host Doug Keck’s weekly 
book review show discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest 
book release.  On this program, author Monsignor Xavier d’Arodes de Peyriague 
talked about the book entitled Lourdes and Its Media Outreach to the World.  The 
book examined the influence Lourdes, France has had on its visitors.

09/06/15 at 08:30…EWTN Bookmark…30 minutes…Host Doug Keck’s weekly 
book review show discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest 
book release.  On this program, author Gail Buckley was on to discuss 
commentaries of ancient writings.

09/13/15 at 08:30…EWTN Bookmark…30 minutes…Host Doug Keck’s weekly 
book review show discusses the salient points with the author(s) on their newest 
book release.  On this program, Doug was at a marketing conference to talk with 
publishers and authors.  Some of the vendors were Sophia Institute Press, TAN 
books, Angelico Press, Ave Maria Press, Ignatius Press, Our Sunday Visitor, and 
Scepter Press.


