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Fri 8/7/2020 1:45 PM
John Krumm <john@krummowen.org =
Re: Docsign Has Been Sent...

To Mary Niemeyer

Thanks Mary, Ashley will go to the bank and bring a check by this afternoon.
--lehn

On Fri, Aug 7, 2020 at 1:42 PM Mary Niemeyer <Mary.Niemeyer@townsquaremedia.com> wrote:

Thank you again lohn,

The schedule for Ashley on KOOL 101.7 came out to a total of $594,

| sent you the NAB Political form to be docusigned.

We will add the commercials the minute we get this back.

Please look for it in your email.

5o much appreciated!

Mary

Mary Niemeyer
Market President/Chief Revenue Officer
Townsguare Media Duluth

Mobile: 703.595.8160



