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ISSUE: CHILDREN’S PROGRAMMING

Glory Stories…30 Minutes at 10:00

1/7/22 … St. Cecilia and Blessed Kateri Part One details a Roman girl, St. Cecilia, who faced 
religious detractors in the Third Century with the spirit of song. She is now the Patron Saint of 
Music. Part two details the story of a Mohawk woman who gave up everything and endured the 
scorn of her family in order to practice the Christian faith.

1/21/22 … St. Joan of Arc details the trials and tribulations of St. Joan of Arc, an historical as 
well as a spiritual leader. Children will learn about her fight to save the French people and will 
learn to be courageous even in the face of overwhelming odds.

2/11/22 … St. Rose details the life of St. Rose who endured suffering and became the first saint 
from the New World. Her life teaches children how to deal with suffering and difficult times.

2/18/22 …. St. Joseph and St. Katherine Drexel: Part One details St. Joseph's obedience and 
his good example of fatherhood. Part two details St. Katherine's charity and good stewardship 
with her family's money when using it to build schools. 

3/4/22 … Blessed Jose Sanchez del Rio details the life of a boy who held onto his Faith against 
the power of the state. He was tortured and eventually martyred but he refused to deny his 
Faith. He is an example of bravery in the face of unfathomable odds.

3/25/22 …Mass responses and prayers Teaches children the new translation of the Mass 
responses. 

ISSUE: YOUNG ADULT CONTENT

Beyond Damascus… 60 Minutes at 20:00. The Beyond Damascus program engages young 
adults each week with stories of conversions, testimonies, and faith journeys.

1/8/22 … This week guest Ennie Hickman discussed how evangelization isn't weird.

1/29/22 …. This week’s guest was Craig Stammen, pitcher for the San Diego Padres and a 
proud Catholic.

2/14/22 … This week’s topic was intercession. 

2/19/22 … This week Dan discussed why hell matters.



2/28/22…. This week Dan discussed how to have an amazing Lent.

3/05/22…. This week’s guest was Jeff Cavins and they discuss following Jesus.

ISSUE: FAMILY, PARENTING AND RELATIONSHIPS

The Doctor is In…57 minutes at 13:0. Dr. Ray Guarendi, a clinical psychologist, answers 
listeners’ questions concerning the healthy choices on raising their children.

1/6/22 … Today, Dr. Ray talked to Jennifer from San Antonio and discussed her eight-year-old 
son and him not listening to her requests.

1/18/22… Dr. Ray helps a caller named Scott who requested advice regarding getting respect 
from his stepmother.
  
2/2/22 a… Dr. Ray talked with and advised a caller, Karen from Cincinnati, who was suffering 
regrets from her divorce of five years ago.

2/15/22… A caller named Shannon disagreed with Dr Ray (and recent research) and discussed 
why all Christians should wear a mask for the safety of others. 
 
3/9/22… Dr. Ray helps Mary a caller in regard to special schools, camps and therapeutic 
boarding schools for young people.

3/23/22…Today, Dr. Ray discussed with caller Monica about adolescence and displays of 
mental health issues.

ISSUE: EDUCATIONAL

Catholic Answers Live…60 minutes at 18:00
 
1/13/22 … Host Jimmy Akin and Mark Brumley had an open forum of taking questions from 
listeners about the Catholic Teaching and Faith. 
 
1/17/22 … Host Trent Horn discussed Pro-Life issues with listeners. Marcellino D'Ambrosio 
discusses how to have a friendship with Jesus.

2/4/22 … Host John Bergsma educated listeners about the Dead Sea Scrolls and Jimmy Akin 
answers weird Questions about the Catholic Teaching and Faith. 

2/18/22… Host Jimmy Akin answered calls about Your Bible Questions and the Catholic Faith.

3/9/22 …. Host Karlo Broussard educates listeners about the intricacies of Catholic Teaching 
and Faith. On this show, he provided Catholic answers to Protestant questions.

3/23/22 …Host Karlo Broussard discussed with listeners the Why's of Catholic Beliefs including 
praying for the faithful departed, distinctions between Christians and Catholics, receiving 
communion at non-Catholic churches.



ISSUE: PUBLIC INTEREST

Kresta in the Afternoon…120 minutes at 16:00

1/6/22 … On this program, guest host Jerry Usher discussed the Latin Mass with Matthew 
Bunson and the feast of the Epiphany with Steve Ray.

1/17/22… On this program, Sue Ellen Browder discussed Catholic feminism and Jonathan 
Dodson looked at how we can overcome crisis using the Beatitudes.

2/03/22… On this program, Archbishop Borys Gudziak reported from the Ukraine on the 
tensions with Russia and how listeners might help. Sister Betty Ann McNeil shared how St 
Elizabeth Seton helped pioneer Catholic education. 

2/15/22 … On this show, guest Robert Wilken examined the Christian origins of religious liberty 
and whether there is such a thing as a 'second conversion'.

3/3/22 …. On this program, guest Dan Philpott discussed how the war in Ukraine could shift the 
global religious landscape. And guest Luke O'Hara shared stories of the Japanese martyrs. 

3/22/22… Matthew Bunson reported on the changes in the Vatican Curia, how Saudi Arabia is 
changing how it sells oil to China.

ISSUE: WOMEN’S INTERESTS

Women of Grace… 60 minutes at 11:00 Host Johnnette Williams hosts this live program of 
special interest to women. She informs, instructs, and inspires listeners with the truth of the 
Catholic faith.

1/5/2… Today, Johnnette welcomed the new year and discussed how to be open to it and 
moments of conversion in changing our lives for God.

1/20/21…Today, Johnette listened to a caller's voice mail messages. A Navy Seal spoke about 
his guilt for the people he killed in Afghanistan and Johnette assisted this young man (and all 
listeners) in a further a understanding of how to deal with guilt. 

2/1/21 … Today, Johnnette answered questions from a caller about teaching teens about sex. 
She noted the changes in our culture including transgenderism and same sex attractions. In 
another call she discussed the evils of prostitution and returning to the truth of God's teachings.

2/17/21…. Today, host Johnnette Williams shared why we need good friends in our lives.

3/1/21… Today, Johnnette shared the joys of praying the Rosary and how it has helped to end 
wars in the past.
 



3/23/21… On this show, Johnnette discusses with researcher Sue Brinkman about psychometry 
(alleged psychic ability to read the history of an object) and popular faceless statues.


